MINNESOTA RULES, CHAPTER 1305
ADOPTION OF THE 20062012 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING
| CODE

1305.0010 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]

1305.0011 ADOPTION OF INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE BY REFERENCE
AND ADMINISTRATIVE AUT HORITY.

Subpart 1. General. For purposes of this chapter, "IBC" means the 2006 2012 edition of the
International Building Code as promulgated by the International Code Council, Falls Church,
Virginia. The IBC is incorporated by reference and made part of the Minnesota State Building
Code except as qualified by the applicable provisions in chapter 1300, part 1305.0021, and as
amended in this chapter. Portions of this chapter reproduce text and tables from the IBC. The
IBC is not subject to frequent change and a copy of the IBC, with amendments for use in
Minnesota, is available in the office of the commissioner of labor and industry. The IBC is
copyright 2066 2011 by the International Code Council, Inc. All rights reserved.

Subp. 2. Mandatory chapters. IBC Chapters 2 through 33 and 35 must be administered by
any municipality that has adopted the code, except as qualified by the applicable provisions in
chapter 1300, and as amended by this chapter. Amendments to IBC Chapters 11 and 30 are
incorporated by reference in this rule chapter, but the actual amendments for those chapters are
located in chapters 1341, the Minnesota Accessibility Code, and 1307, the Minnesota Elevator
Code, respectively. Referenced documents cited in IBC Chapters 11 and 30, and chapters 1307
and 1341, apply, unless otherwise stated or deleted. For the complete application and mandatory
requirements relating to IBC Chapter 11, see chapter 1341. For the complete application and
mandatory requirements relating to IBC Chapter 30, see chapter 1307.

Subp. 3. Replacement chapters. The following IBC chapters are deleted and replaced with
the Minnesota Rules chapters listed in items A and B.

A. IBC Chapter 1 and any references to code administration are deleted and replaced with
chapter 1300, Minnesota Administration Code.

B. IBC Chapter 34 and any references 1o conservation or rehabilitation of existing buildings
are deleted and replaced with chapter 1311, Minnesota Building Conservation Code.

Subp. 4. Seismic or earthquake provisions. Any seismic or ecarthquake provisions of the
IBC and any references to them are deleted and are not included in this code.

Subp. 5. Flood hazard or floodproofing provisions. Any flood hazard or floodproofing
provisions in the IBC, and any reference 10 those provisions, are deleted in their entirety.
Requirements for floodproofing are located in chapter 1335, Floodproofing Regulations.



1305.0020 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.0021 REFERENCES TO OTHER INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL CODES.

Subpart 1. General. References to other codes and standards promulgated by the
International Code Council in the IBC are modified in subparts 2 to 12.

Subp. 2. Building code. References to the IBC in this code mean the Minnesota Building
Code, adopted pursuant to this chapter and Minnesota Statutes, section 326B.777 16B-61,
S&béi 91.51. ef} }.

Subp. 3. Residential code. References to the International Residential Code in this code
mean the Minnesota Residential Code, adopted pursuant to chapter 1309 and Minnesota Statutes,
section 326B. 722 16B-61;subdivisiont.

Subp. 4. Electrical code. References to the International Code Council Electrical Code in
this code mean the Minnesota Electrical Code, adopted pursuant to chapter 1315 and Minnesota
Statutes, section 326.243.

Subp. 5. Fuel gas code. References to the International Fuel Gas Code in this code mean
the Minnesota Mechanical Code, adopted pursuant to chapter 1346 and Minnesota Statutes,
section 326B.722 16B-61;subdivisiont.

Subp. 6. Mechanical code. References to the International Mechanical Code in this code
mean the Minnesota Mechanical Code, adopted pursuant to chapter 1346 and Minnesota
Statutes, 326B.7777 i 61 fyis

Subp. 7. Plumbing code. References to the International Plumbing Code in this code mean
the Minnesota Plumbing Code, adopted pursuant to chapter 4715 and Minnesota Statutes, section

s OO VIO Aty e . s 0 0 0 20 e

Subp. 8. Private sewage disposal code. References to the International Private Sewage
Disposal Code in this code mean the Minnesota Pollution Control Agency's minimum standards
and criteria for individual sewage treatment systems adopted pursuant to Minnesota Rule
eChapters 7080, 7081, 7082, and 7083, and Minnesota Statutes, chapters 103F, 103G, 115, and
116.

Subp. 9. Energy conservation code. References to the International Energy Conservation
Code in this code mean the Minnesota Energy Code, adopted pursuant to Minnesota Statutes,
326B.2772 section16B-617.

Subp. 10. Property maintenance code. References to the International Property
Maintenance Code in this code do not apply.

Subp. 11. Fire code. References to the International Fire Code in this code mean the
Minnesota State Fire Code, adopted pursuant to chapter 7511 7546 and Minnesota Statutes,
chapter 299F.



Subp. 12. International Existing Building Code. References to the International Existing
Building Code in this code mean Minnesota State Building Conservation Code, adopted pursuant
to chapter 1311 and Minnesota Statutes, 306B.77? section16B-61subdivistont.

1305.0030 ADMINISTRATIVE PROCEDURE CRITERIA.
Procedures relating to the administration and enforcement of this code under Minnesota

Statutes, section 326B.22?? 16B-57, are contained in chapter 1300, Minnesota Administration
Code, which governs the application of this code.

ANinneqo +

Fas AN or-1n Ao To)
CHICA o nOoIrIvanrvauit

1305.0100 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.0101 CHAPTER 1, ADMINISTRATION.
IBC Chapter 1 is deleted and replaced with the following:
CHAPTER 1
ADMINISTRATION
This code shall be administered in accordance with Minnesota Rules, chapter 1300.
1305.0102 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.0103 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.0105 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.0106 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.0107 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.0108 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.0109 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.0150 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.0200 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.0201 SECTION 201, GENERAL.

IBC Section 201.4 is amended to read as follows:



201.4 Terms not defined. Where terms are not defined through the methods authorized by this
chapter, the Merriam-Webster Collegiate Dictionary, available at www.m-w.com, shall be
considered as providing ordinarily accepted meanings. The dictionary is incorporated by
reference, is subject to frequent change, and is available through the Minitex interlibrary loan
system.

1305.0202 SECTION 202, DEFINITIONS.

Subpart 1. Agricultural building. The definition of "agricultural building” in IBC Section
202 is amended as follows: :

AGRICULTURAL BUILDING. Pursuant to Minnesota Statutes, 326B.777 seetion—16B-60, an
agricultural building means a structure on agricultural land as defined in Minnesota Statutes,
section 273.13, subdivision 23, that is designed, constructed, and used to house farm implements,
livestock, or agricultural produce or products used by the owner, lessee, and sublessee of the
building and members of their immediate families, their employees, and persons engaged in the
pickup or delivery of agricultural products.

Subp. 2. Townhouse. The definition of "townhouse" in IBC Section 202 is deleted in its

entirety.
Subp. 2a. LIVE/WORK UNIT. The definition of “T ive/Work Unit” in IBC Section 202 is
deleted in its entirety.

Subp. 3. IBC Section 202 is amended by adding or replacing the following definitions:

AISLE. That portion of an exit access that connects an aisle accessway to an exit access
doorway, corridor, or an exit.

CORRIDOR. An interior passageway having a length at least three times its width, having
walls. partitions, or other obstructions to exit travel over 6 feet (1829 mm) in height on two
opposing sides, and having openings from rooms or similar spaces.

ROOM. A space or area bounded by any obstruction over 6 feet in height which at any time
encloses more than 80 percent of the perimeter of the area. In computing the unobstructed
perimeter, openings less than 3 feet (914 mm) in clear width and less than 6 feet 8 inches (2032
mm) in height shall not be considered. Aisles and corridors shall not be construed to form rooms

ROOF COVERING. The covering applied to the roof deck for weather resistance, fire
classification or appearance. Roof covering materials consist of two basic types: (1) roofing
systems, and (2) prepared materials.

1305.0300 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]
1305.0301 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.0302 [Repealed, 31 SR 1165]

1305.0305 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]



1305.0308 INSTITUTIONAL GROUP L
Subpart 1. Section 308:2308.3. IBC Section 368:2308.3 is amended to read as follows:
308.2308.3 Institutional Group I--1. This occupancy shall include buildings, structures, or

p&ftsportlon thereof heﬁsmgfm more than 16 pefseﬂs—whepersons who reside on a 24 hour
whe—be 00— Hen 1nasuperv1sedres&éeﬁt1a4

receiving care are capable of respencing n-emergers § he
from-staffself preservation. This group shall 1nclude but not be hmlted to, the followmg
Alcohol and drug centersresidential-board-and-earefacilities
Aassisted living facilities
Boarding care
Congregate care facilities
Convalescent facilities

halfway-heuses

Ggroup homes

Halfway houses

Housing with services

Residential board and care facilities
Ssocial rehabilitation facilities
Supervised living facilities Class A-2

alcohel-and-dragecenters
| ccilic

308.3.1 Five or fewer persons receiving care. A facility such as the above with five or fewer
persons receiving such care shall be classified as Group R 3.

308.3.2 Six to sixteen persons receiving care. A facility such as above, housing not fewer than-at
least six and not more than 16 persons receiving such care, shall be classified as Group R-4.

Subp. 2. Section 308.3. IBC Section 308.3 is amended to read as follows:

308.3308.4 Institutional Group I--2. This occupancy shall include buildings and structures
used for medical care—s{*gteal—-psyehmtﬂe—&afsmg—ef—eﬁstedﬂ%eafe on a 24 hour basis for more
than five persons who are incapablenet-eapable of self-—preservation. This group shall include,
but not be limited to, the following:

Foster care facilities

Detoxification facilities

Hhospitals

Naursing homes; beth-intermediate-earefacilities-and-skilled-nursing-facilities

Psychiatricmentat hospitals

Supervised living facilities Class B-3




308.4.1 Five or fewer persons receiving care. A facility such as the above with five or fewer
persons_receiving such care shall be classified as Group R--3.

| Subp. 3. Section 308:5:308.6. IBC Section 308-5308.6 is amended to read as follows:

308.5308.6 Institutional Group I--4, day care facilities. This group shall include buildings and
structures occupied by more than five persons of any age who receive custodial care for fewer
less than 24 hours_per day by personsindividuals other than parents or guardians, relatives by
blood, marriage, or adoption, and in a place other than the home of the person cared for.—4A

AR 2 Placac af

Factlitv_aneh-as the ahnve asth-fuve-op fewzar nersons chall he elaccified-ac Gron
HECHItY Sutas thCt aUU VvVt V-0 TS WO PSSO S I Uo UIdhos LA a>—JToup > \=1e]

: . This group shall include, but not limited to,
the following:

Adult daycare center

Child care center

1305.0310 SECTION 310 RESIDENTIAL GROUP R.
| IBC Section 3106-£310 is amended to read as follows:

310.1 Residential Group R. Residential Group R includes, among others, the use of a building
or structure, or a portion thereof, for sleeping purposes when not classified as an Institutional
Group Lor when not regulated by the International Residential Code.

310.2 Definitions. The following terms are defined in Chapter 2:

BOARDING HOUSE

CONGREGATE LIVING FACILITY

DORMITORY

GROUP HOME

PERSONAL CARE SERVICE

TRANSIENT.

310.3 Residential Group R-1. Residential- occupaneies-shall-inelude-the-following:

R1 Residential occupancies containing sleeping units where the occupants are primarily
transient in nature, including:
Bed and breakfast facilities with six or more guest rooms. A facility with less than six
ouest rooms shall be classified as a Group R 3 occupancy
Bboarding houses (transient) with more than 10 occupants
Congregate living facilities (transient) with more than 10 occupants
Hhotels (transient)

Msmotels (transient)
boA and hregl-fact facilitiac v

o wath et or-moe
egaRd—PredidastTdCItICo—withi ST O oI U s UL oI
i

| 310.4 Residential Group R--2 Residential occupancies containing sleeping units or more than
two dwelling units where the occupants are primarily permanent in nature, including:
Aapartment houses
Bboarding houses (net nontransient) with more than 16 occupants
Congregate living facilities (nontransient) with more than 16 occupants

ro _aonect roogms YoVali
TS 7 Tavr

6



Ceonvents

Ddormitories

Ffraternities and sororities
Hhotels (nontransient)
Live/work units

Mmaonasteries

Msnotels (nontransient)
Vacation timeshare properties

Conaoracate  livino yoVall
CONgICgatc—rrvitig— ot
-
D

.
10q  3xtf 14 or fewer
TS —vywithi—rO—or— vy

oee Q a__nea Q.
Ve—OCCUpaito—al v Pty

310.5 Residential Group R-—3 Residential occupancies where the occupants are primarily
permanent in nature and not classified as R--1, R--2, R4, or I including:

Assisted living facility

Bbuildings that do not contain more than two dwelling units

Boarding Care Home

Boarding houses (nontransient) with 16 or fewer occupants

Boarding houses (transient) with 10 or fewer occupants

Careadult facilities that provide accommodations for five or fewer persons_receiving care

annae nf anv ace ftor
o O allr y agv 10T

ohild f=Wat.] etr-pet
T TV O TuUvVWeil pulouUl

:

Ceongregate living facilities (nontransient) with 16 or fewer occupants petrsens
Congregate living facilities (transient) with 10 or fewer occupants

Family adult foster home

Foster care

Housing with services

Residential hospice with 5 or fewer occupants

adultand-child-carefaeilities

310.5.1 Care facilities within a dwelling?

310.6 Residential Group R--4. This occupancy shall include build
thereof for Residential-oceupaneies-shallinelude-buildings-arrangedo :
i i i ine—more than five but not more than 16 personseeeupants,
excluding staff-whestaff, who reside on a 24-hour basis in a supervised residential environment
and receive custodial care. The person receiving care are capable of self-preservation. This
oroup shall include, but not be limited to, the following:

Alcohol and drug centers

Assisted living facilities

Boarding Care Home

Congregate care facilities

Group Homes

Halfway houses

ings, structures or portions




Housing with services

Residential board and care facilities
Residential hospice with 12 or fewer occupants
Social rehabilitation facilities

Group R-4 occupancies shall meet the requirements for construction as defined for Group R-
3, except as otherwise provided for in this code.

1305.0400 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.0402 SECTION 402, COVERED MALL BUILDINGS.

Subpart 1. Section 402.4.2.2.2462:7. IBC Section 402.4.2.2402.7 is amended by adding a
subsection to read as follows:

402.4.2.2.2.402.7.4 Property lines. Property lines may be platted between an anchor building
and a covered mall building separated in accordance with Section 402.7.3 without requiring the
construction of a party wall if there are Jegal agreements recorded with the deed for each of the
separate properties. These recorded agreements shall require that buildings as divided by
property lines be in conformance with the applicable provisions of the State Building Code, as if
the buildings were a single building on a single piece of property. In addition, the agreement
must state that no individual building or property owner may modify any portion of the building
in any way that would not comply with the State Building Code.

Subp. 2. Repealed, 31 SR 1165
Subpart 3. Section 402.7.2 IBC Section 402.7.2 is amended to read as follows:

402.7.2 Smoke control. A smoke control system shall be installed in accordance with Section
909.

Exception: Smoke control is not required for atriums that connect only two stories. Covered
mall buildings shall be provided with a post fire smoke exhaust system in accordance with
Section 916.

1305.0404 SECTION 404, ATRIUMS.

IBC Section 404.5404-4 is amended to read as follows:



| 404.5404.4 Smoke control. A smoke control system shall be installed in accordance with
Section 909.

Exception: Smoke control is not required for atriums that connect only two stories.
Covered mall buildings shall be provided with a post fire smoke exhaust system in
I accordance eomplianee with Section 943 916.
1305.0405 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.0406 SECTION 406, MOTOR VEHICLE-RELATED OCCUPANCIES:

IBC Section 406-3-8406.4.5 is amended to read as follows:

.‘ '!.

406.4.5 Floor surface. Parking surfaces shall be of concrete or similar noncombustible and

nonabsorbent materials.
—_The area of floor used for parking of automobiles or other vehioelesvehicles shall be sloped
to facilitate the movement of liquids to a drain or toward the main vehicle entry doorway.
Exceptions:

1. Asphalts parking surfaces shall be permitted at ground level.

2 Floors of Group S-2 parking garages shall not be required to have a sloped surface.

3. NeUnoccupied portions of non-public parking garages shall not be required to be

nonabsorbent.

1305.0407 SECTION 407, GROUP I-2.
IBC Section 407.2.1 is amended to read as follows:

| 407.2.1 Spaces of unlimited area. Inant2-eeeupanecy; Sspaces constructed as required for
corridors shall be permitted to be open to a corridor, only where all the following criteria are
met:

1. The spaces are not occupied as care recipient’sfer—patient sleeping rooms, treatment
rooms, hazardeus—er-incidental use in accordance withareas-as-defined-in-Section 5095082 or

hazardous uses.

2. The open space is protected by an automatic fire detection system installed in accordance
with Section 907.

3. The corridors onto which the spaces open, in the same smoke compartment, are protected
by an automatic fire detection system installed in accordance with Section 907, or the smoke
compartment in which the spaces are located is equipped throughout with quick response
sprinklers in accordance with Section 903.3.2.



4. The space is arranged so as not to obstruct access to the required exits.

1305.0408 SECTION 408, GROUP I-3.

Subp. 21. Section 408:9408.7. IBC Section 408 is amended by adding a subsection as
follows:

408.9408.7 Security Glazing._In occupancies in Group I-3, windows and doors in 1 -hour fire
barriers constructed in accordance with Section 707, 2-hour fire barriers constructed in
accordance with Section 707 used for horizontal exits, fire partitions constructed in accordance
with Section 708 and smoke barriers constructed in accordance weithwith SeetyienSection 709
shall be permitted to have security glazing installed provided that the following conditions are
met.

1. Individual panels of glazing in door assemblies shall not exceed 1296 square inches (0.84
m?)

2. The glazing shall be protected on both sides by an automatic sprinkler system. The
sprinkler system shall be designed to, when actuated, wet completely the entire surface of any
olazing affected by fire.

Exception: fire partitions or smoke barriers with ¥ inch (6.4 mm) wire glass in a security

olazing assembly.

3. The glazing shall be in a gasketed frame and installed in such a manner that the framing
system will deflect without breaking (loading) the glass before the sprinkler system operates.

4. Obstructions such as curtain rods, drapery tramversetraverse rods, curtains, drapes or
similar materials shall not be installed between the automatic sprinklers and the glazing.

5. Security glazing in fire partitions, 1-hour fire barriers enclosing fire command center and
smoke barriers shall not be limited to 25 percent of the area of the common wall with any room.

10



Subp 2. Section 408.9 Windowless buildings. For the purposes of this section, a windowless
building or portion thereof, is a building or area with non-openable windows, or not having
readily breakable windows, or without exterior doors or skylights that are provided in all resident
areas of the exit access with an occupant load greater than 50. Windowless buildings shall be
provided with an mechanical smoke control system capable of providing a tenable environment
for exiting the smoke compartment in the area of fire origin in accordance with Section 909 for
each windowless smoke compartment.

1305.0414 SECTION 414, HAZARDOUS MATERIALS.
Subpart 1. Section 414.2.4. IBC Section 414.2.4 is amended to read as follows:

414.2.4 Fire resistance rating requirements. The required fire resistance rating for fire barrier
assemblies shall be in accordance with Table 414.2.2.

Subp. 2. Section 414.2.6. IBC Section 414.2 is amended by adding a subsection to read as
follows:

11



414.2.6 Hazardous materials above the third floor in laboratories in Group B, E, and I 2
occupancies. Control areas containing laboratories located above the third floor in Group B, E,
or I 2 occupancies may be exempt from the provisions in Sections 414.2.1 through 414.2.4 if all
of the following conditions are met:

1. Buildings containing the laboratories are equipped throughout with automatic sprinkler
protection installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1;

2. Control areas containing laboratories located above the third floor are separated from
each other and other portions of the building by a fire barrier having a fire resistance rating of not
less than two hours;

3. The maximum amount of hazardous materials in storage and in use in control areas
containing laboratories does not exceed ten percent of the maximum allowable quantities listed
in Tables 307.1(1) and 307.1(2) with all increases allowed in the footnotes of those tables; and

4. The maximum number of control areas containing laboratories shall not exceed 5 per
floor.

1305.0419 [Repealed, 31 SR 1165]

1305.0419, IBC Section 419 Live/Work Units

IBC Section 419 is entirely deleted

1305.04211305.0425 SECTION 42}@5_, GROUP E OCCUPANCIES.
IBC Chapter 4 is amended by adding a section and subsections to read as follows:
SECTION 421425
GROUP E OCCUPANCIES

421.1425.1 Applicability. This section applies to Group E school buildings containing uses
described in this section. School buildings shall comply with this section and all other applicable
provisions of this code, as intended by Minnesota Statutes, section 123B.51, subdivision 7.

421.2425.2 Use of school buildings by lower grades. In addition to the occupancy and
construction requirements in this code, this section applies to those special uses and occupancies
described in this section.

421.2.1425.2.1 School buildings equipped with complete automatic fire sprinkler and fire
alarm systems. Rooms used by preschool, kindergarten, and first and second grade students for
classrooms, latchkey, day care, early childhood family education, teen parent, or similar
programs may be located on any floor level below the fourth story if the following conditions
exist:

12



1. The building is protected throughout with an approved automatic fire sprinkler system;
and

2. The building is protected throughout with an approved automatic fire alarm system
having automatic smoke detection devices installed throughout the exit system within every
room or area used for purposes other than a classroom or office.

421.2.2425.2.2 School buildings equipped with either a complete automatic fire sprinkler
system or a fire alarm system. Rooms shall be located on the story of exit discharge when used
for the purposes of classroom, latchkey, day care, early childhood education, teen parent, or
similar programs by preschool, kindergarten, or first grade students. Rooms shall be located on
the story of exit discharge or one story above when used for any purpose by second grade
students.

Rooms occupied by preschool, kindergarten, first, or second grade students, when used for
the programs described in this section, may be located on floor levels other than those designated
above if one of the following conditions is met:

1. An approved automatic fire sprinkler system is provided throughout the building and the
use of the affected room or space is limited to one grade level at a time and exiting is provided
from the room or space which is independent from the exiting system used by older students; or

2. A complete approved automatic fire alarm system is installed throughout the building
consisting of automatic smoke detection installed throughout the exit system and within all
rooms and areas other than classroom and office areas, and the use of the affected room or space
is limited to one grade level at a time, and exiting is provided from the room or space which is
independent from the exiting system used by older students.

For the purposes of this subpart, pupils from the second grade down are considered one grade
level.

421.2:3425.2.3 Accessory spaces. Accessory spaces, including spaces used for gymnasiums,
cafeterias, media centers, auditoriums, libraries, and band and choir rooms, used on an
occasional basis by preschool, kindergarten, first, and second grade students are permitted to be
located one level above or one level below the story of exit discharge, if the building is protected
throughout by an approved automatic sprinkler system or a complete approved corridor smoke
detection system.

1305.0500 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.0501 SECTION 501, GENERAL.
IBC Section 501.1 is amended to read as follows:
501.1 Scope. The provisions of this chapter control the height and area of structures hereafter

erected and additions to existing structures. An existing building plus additions shall comply
with the height and area provisions of this chapter.

13



1305.0507 SECTION 507, UNLIMITED AREA BUILDINGS.
Subpart 1. IBC Section 507.2. IBC Section 507.2 is amended to read as follows:

507.2 Nonsprinklered, one story. The area of a one story building of Group F 2 or S 2
occupancy shall not be limited when the building is surrounded and adjoined by public ways or
yards not less than 60 feet (18,288 mm) in width.

Subp. 2. IBC Section 507.3. The exceptions listed in IBC Section 507.3 are not amended.
The first sentence of IBC Section 507.3 is amended to read as follows: ‘

507.3 Sprinklered, one story. The area of a one story_above grade plane building of Group B,
F, M, or S occupancy or a one story above grade plane Group A 4 building, of other than Type V
construction, shall not be limited when the building is provided with an automatic sprinkler
system throughout in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 and is surrounded and adjoined by
public ways or yards not less than 60 feet (18,288 mm) in width.

Subp. 3. IBC Section 507.4. IBC Section 507.4 is amended to read as follows:

| 507.4 Two story. The area of a two story above grade plane building of Group B, F, M, or S
occupancy shall not be limited when the building is equipped throughout with an automatic
sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1, and is surrounded and adjoined by public
ways or yards not less than 60 feet (18,288 mm) in width.

Subp. 4. IBC Section 507.5. IBC Section 507.5 is amended by adding a subsection to read
as follows:

507.5.1 Property lines. Portions of an unlimited area building may be divided by platted
property lines without requiring the construction of party walls if the whole building has:

1. Permanent open space on all sides as required by Section 507.2, 507.3, 507.4, or 507.5;
and ‘

2. Proper legal agreements recorded with the deed for each of the separate properties.
These recorded agreements shall require that the buildings as divided by property lines, be in
conformance with the applicable provisions of the Minnesota State Building Code, as if the
buildings were a single building on a single piece of property. In addition, the agreement must
state that no individual building or property owner may modify any portion of the building in any
way that would not be in compliance with the Minnesota State Building Code.




1305.0508 MIXED USE AND OCCUPANCY
508.1 General. Each portion of a building shall be individually classified in accordance with
Section 302.1. Where a building contains more than one occupancy group, the building or
portion thereof shall comply with the applicable provisions of Section 508.2, 508.3 or 508.4, or a
combination of these sections.

Exceptions:

1. Occupancies separated in accordance with Section 510.

9. Where required by Table 415.5.2, areas of Group H-1, H-2 and H-3 occupancies shall be
located in a detached building or structure.

1305.0600 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.0700 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.0704 [Repealed, 31 SR 1165]
1305.0707 [Repealed, 31 SR 1165]
1305.0714 [Repealed, 31 SR 1165]
| 1305.07161305.0717 SECTION 746 717, DUCTS AND AIR TRANSFER OPENINGS.
l IBC Section 7+6:5:3717.5.3 is amended by adding exception 56 as follows:
| 56. Fire dampers, smoke dampers, and combination fire/smoke dampers are not required in
laboratory hood exhaust duct penetrations of shaft enclosures where laboratory ventilation
systems are installed in accordance with NFPA 45.
1305.0717.6.1 Through penetrations, is amended to read as follows:
IBC Sec. 717.6.1 Through penetrations. In occupancies other than Group I-2 and I-3, a duct
constructed of approved materials in accordance with the International Mechanical Code that
penetrates a fire-resistance-rated floor or floor/ceiling assembly that connects not more than two
stories is permitted without a shaft enclosure protection, provided a listed fire damper is installed

at the floor line or the duct is protected in accordance with Section 714.4. For air transfer
openings, see Section 712.1.8.

15



Exceptions: 1. A duct is permitted to penetrate three floors or less without a fire damper at each
floor, provided such duct meets all of the following requirements:

a.} The duct shall be contained and located within the cavity of a wall and shall be constructed
of steel having a minimum wall thickness of 0.0187 inches (0.4712 mm) (No. 26 gage).

b.2- The duct shall open into only one dwelling or sleeping unit and the duct system shall be
continuous from the unit to the exterior of the building.

¢.3- The duct shall not exceed 4-inch (102 mm) nominal diameter and the total area of such ducts
shall not exceed 100 square inches (0.065 m2) in any 100 square feet (9.3 m2) of floor area.

d.4- The annular space around the duct is protected with materials that prevent the passage of
flame and hot gases sufficient to ignite cotton waste where subjected to ASTM E 119 or UL 263
time temperature conditions under a minimum positive pressure

differential of 0.01 inch (2.49 Pa) of water at the location of the penetration for the time period
equivalent to the fire-resistance rating of the construction penetrated.

¢.5- Grille openings located in a ceiling of a fire-resistance-rated floor/ceiling or roof/ceiling
assembly shall be protected with a listed ceiling radiation damper installed in accordance with
Section 717.6.2.1.

2. In Group I-2 and I-3 occupancies, a duct constructed of approved materials in accordance with
the International Mechanical Code that penetrates a fire-resistance-rated floor or floor/ceiling
assembly that connects not more than two stories is permitted without a shaft enclosure
protection, provided a listed smoke/fire damper is installed at the floor line.

1305.0800 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

1305.0900 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

1305.0901 SECTION 901, GENERAL

1305.0901, IBC Section 901.6.2, Fire alarm systems, is amended by deleting the section in its
entirety.

1305.0903 F SECTION 903, AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER SYSTEMS.

Subpart 1. Scope. IBC F Section 903.2.7 is amended as follows.

Subpart 1. Repealed, 31 SR 1165

16



2 Gronp 2 Ar A _nerunanctecscontainino—g netlitv Heenced by the-atgte ot NMinnecota

Z—— o3>0 I OCTUpunitr o v oIt i g e T LY HCCHSECO Dyt staic—orTviinitsota

chall ha neavided wiath-g fire cnnprecuon—quctam-aq reamired-hyv th annlicable Heencsinge

Stidir—pC—PpProviacoaywvrura—tov SHPPrOSoION—S y StoI oI [=ssa=ic v tHe—pprcatit—1IoTotily
. e . . . . o

2 Attached oaracec need-not 1 inlelored theanohontif XL wller 1o installed sxithin

o A % g oo TIoTU O CTrCOthro s aoatr TCH-H1iotanCU—yv ittt

T XTTOUTIvTT 50T

. . . .
Eor tha nurnacecaof thicsection Tre wmlle narbe walle_ar_attae ad multinle fire recictive exterior
O tHCPUTPOSTO OIS~ Tui v WaS;pPalty vvalto, O ditdo it TP O OSTotr v O UAtiut
. 'Y

. . . e .
Ex 1012 Rira wualle mawto wwall v attached multinle 11 _pragiotiuo ayviapinge walla
IO, T C (=2 25> Py v e 2 (5298 F—atdChHeO— Rttt prU— o Toototryey CXTTITOT —vvarts

.

Subpart 2. IBC F Section 903.2.8 Group R is amended by adding a section as follows:

1305.0903.2.8.3 Residential hospice facilities. An automatic sprinkler system installed in
accordance with NEPA 13 shall be provided throughout all buildings with a Group R-3 or Group
R-4 fire area containing a residential hospice facility.

Exception: An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.2
or 903.3.1.3 shall be allowed, provided that all habitable spaces and closets are

sprinkiered.

Subpart 3. IBC F Section 903.2.11.1.3 Basements is amended to read as follows:

1305.0903.2.11.1.3 Basements. Where any portion of the basement is located more than 75 feet
(22 860 mm) from openings required by Section 903.2.11.1, the basement shall be equipped
throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system.

Subpart 4, IBC F 903.2.11.4 Ducts conveying hazardous materials is amended as follows:

1305.0903.2.11.4 Ducts-conveying-hazardous-materials: Fire protection for exhaust systems.

Where required by the International Mechanical Code, automatic sprinklers shall be provided in
ducts conveying flammable or combustible components or having the potential for combustible
residue build-up on the inside. Where sprinkler protection is installed, means shall be provided to

17



prevent water accumulation in the duct or the flow of water back to a process where the
application or water constitutes a serious life or fire hazard.

Exception: Ducts where the largest cross-section diameter of the duct in less than 75 square
inches (480 cm)

. . . vie a
an1 2 12 1 Fwre nroafecetion for ovhanet evstems Animortion-of-an avhoict ouctem nihizing
i e proeenoir o r Aoty SteHI—— xiy - pPoraui—otr—an SXHathst -y ot Ut AT g
. . . . . . .
~nmbuctihle components-or havine the Aantential farecom 1ctihle rocidiie huild - onthe inade-or
combustivie-compoheit-Otavihigthnopuitiiial Ul cOmUStivteFeSituC ot up oI tnUsIue ol
. . .
where remred by ather ceetionaofthis Aande whera the duiet eroscesectionat-area1S—et antor than
WhaereFeaditrea oY - othCtSCOoo Ut oL, ~vvitviy the-guct-croSsS—SeCtoararogTogrvatoriauit

1675 el ;|8E ;;’] 1 ided-witl . . ohi

. . .

wathin a duet and ot the Aot intaleo and  enclocnre —ot—eanaodv—~or chall he conctmeted—of

Ha—the—aductahRa—at e GuCtt st TIoUt,—UHvIUS LY, o —Cahiop y7 O —STiair DT oUThot o toC— Ot

. . . . . . . .

material liated for use wrthout aneinlclernratection When ontrinlder nrotection—1s mactalled meanc

fertar-HSteaHoruSC- WOttt > Pt pProtUuiivin Y RSP O protttiolints TS TOIOUT; THOATns
.
chall he nrosnded tonrevent svater ancmmulation—in—the duiet_or-the v of water bhaecl to—a
ST —pC-ProvideO o pIovyoit—yratot gocH oINS auCT—Or At —xUyy Ul vvitbl O to—
. . . .

Araceccwhere the nnnlication ofsuvater constHtes-3-Sertroys Life_or fire hozard

CES5-WHCTICthTTupphnTanori o vvutvt CORStHUHCH S5O OOy TIIC o v azal .

Subp. 2. Repealed, 31 SR 1165
Subp. 3. Repealed, 31 SR 1165
Subp. 3a. F Section 903.3.1.2.1. IBCF Section 903.3.1.2.1 is amended to read as follows:

903.3.1.2.1 Protection of decks and balconies. Decks and balconies greater than 6 feet (1.8 m)
above grade, greater than 4 feet (1.2 m) deep, and with an area greater than 40 square feet (3.72
m?) attached to new Group R 1 and R 2 occupancy buildings protected in accordance with
Section 903.3.1.2 that are three or more stories in height and with 30 or more units shall be
protected with sprinklers under the balcony or deck framing and under attic eaves when both of
the following two conditions exist:

1. The building has an unsprinklered attic; and
2. The building has combustible siding.

Subp. 4. F Section 903.3.1. IBC F Section 903.3.1 is amended by adding a section to read
as follows:

903.3.1.4 Buildings of undetermined use. When fire sprinkler systems are required in
buildings of undetermined use, they shall be designed and installed to have a sprinkler density of
not less than that required for an Ordinary Hazard Group 2 use with a minimum design area of
3,000 square feet (279 m?). Use is considered undetermined if not specified at the time a permit
is issued. Where a subsequent occupancy requires a system with greater capability, it shall be
the responsibility of the owner to upgrade the system to the required density for the new hazard,
use or occupancy.

Subp. 5. F Section 903.3.1. IBC F Section 903.3.1 is amended by adding a subsection to
read as follows:

18



903.3.1.5 Special sprinkler design criteria. When fire sprinkler systems are required in areas
containing the following uses, they shall be designed and installed to have a sprinkler density of
not less than that required for an Ordinary Hazard Group 2 use:

1. Chemistry labs; or
2. Wrestling rooms or gymnastic rooms.

Subp. 5a. F Section 903.3.1 Standards, IBC F Section 903.3.1 is amended by adding the
following a subsections to read as follows:

903.3.1-6 903.3.1.4 Modifications to sprinkler standards. The sprinkler installation standards
as referenced in Sections 903.3.1.1, 903.3.1.2, and 903.3.1.3 are modified as follows:

903.3.1.6.1 903.3.1.4.1 Hose stream requirements. When, in the opinion of the fire chief, an
adequate alternate water supply for hose stream requirements is provided or available, the water
supply requirements for the sprinkler system hose stream demands may be modified.

903.3.1.6.2 903.3.1.4.2 Elevator shafts and equipment. Sprinkler protection shall not be
installed in elevator shafts, elevator pits, or elevator machine rooms.

EXCEPTION: Health care occupancies that are licensed by the Minnesota Department of
Health and/or participate in Title XVIII (Medicare) and/or Title XVIX ( Medicaid) of the Social

Security Act.

903.3.1.6:3 903.3.1.4.3 Swimming pools. Sprinkler protection need not be provided on the
ceiling of rooms containing swimming pools when the pool area is used exclusively for
swimming purposes and when sprinklers are provided around the perimeter of the pool area.

903.3.1.6.4 903.3.1.5 NFPA 13 modifications. Sections 8.15.8.2 and 8.17.2.5 86:4-142;
- 1625 of NFPA 13 are amended revised to read as follows:

8.14.8.2-8.15.8.2 Linen closets and pantries. Sprinklers are not required in linen closets and
pantries within dwelling units that meet the following conditions:

1. The area of the space does not exceed 12 square feet (1.1 m?).

19



9 The least dimension does not exceed 3 feet (0.9 m).

3. The walls and materials are surfaced with noncombustible or limited combustible
materials.

4. The closet or pantry contains no mechanical equipment, electrical equipment, or
electrical appliances.

8.16.2.5 8.17.2.5 Valves.

8.16.2.5.1 8.17.2.5.1 Fire department connection. A listed check valve shall be installed in
each fire department connection.

8.162.5.1.1 8.17.2.5.1.1 Maximum pipe length. There shall be a maximum of 25 feet (7.6 m)
of pipe between the check valve and the fire department connection inlet.

Exception: This maximum shall not apply to the check valve serving a free standing fire
department connection.

8.16.2.5.1.2 8.17.2.5.1.2 Check valve location. The check valve shall be located to minimize
freezing potential.

Subp. 6. Repealed, 31 SR 1165

Subp. 6a. F Section 903.3.7 IBC F Section 903.3.7 is amended by adding a subsection to
read as follows:

903.3.7 Sprinkler system design pressure safety margin. For new sprinkler systems or
additions to existing sprinkler systems, the available water supply shall exceed the sprinkler
system demand, including hose stream requirements, by 5 psi (0.34 bars) or more from the
lowest seasonal adjusted pressure.

Subp. 7. F Section 903.4, IBC F Section 903.4 is amended by adding an exception number
8 to read as follows:

8. For existing sprinkler systems, monitoring is required when the number of sprinklers is
100 or more.

Subp. 8. F Section 903.4. IBC F Section 903.4 is amended by adding a section to read as
follows:

903.4.4 Valve security. All valves controlling water supplies for automatic sprinklers shall be
locked or secured in the open position.

Exception: Valves located in a room or space when access is limited to essential personnel
only.

20



1305.0904 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.0905 F SECTION 905, STANDPIPE SYSTEMS.

Subpart 1. F Section 905.2. IBC F Section 905.2 is amended by adding a subsection to read
as follows:

905.2.1 Modification to standards. In buildings other than high rise that are protected
throughout by an automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Sections 903.3.1.1 and
903.3.1.2, a Class I or III standpipe system need only meet the pressure requirements for the
sprinkler system when such systems comply with Sections 905.2.1.1 through 905.2.1.5:

905.2.1.1 Municipal water supply. A municipal water supply capable of supplying the required
standpipe flow rate with a residual pressure not less than 20 psi (1.4 bars) through a fire hydrant
shall be provided. A fire hydrant shall be located within 300 feet (91 m) of the building's fire
department connection.

905.2.1.2 System testing and pipe size. The standpipe system shall be able to provide the
pressure and flow rate required by NFPA 14 when the standpipe system is supported by local fire
department apparatus through the fire department connection as verified with hydraulic
calculations. The hydraulic calculations are to be performed between the hydraulically most
demanding standpipe hose connection and the fire department connection. Pipe sizes shall not
be less than the minimum requirements in NFPA 14.

905.2.1.3 Design pressure. A maximum design pressure of 150 psi (10.3 bars) is permitted at
the fire department connection when the standpipe is supported by local fire department
apparatus.

905.2.1.4 Hose connection. At least one 2 1/2 inch (64 mm) hose connection shall be provided
on the exterior of the building at the fire department connection for each 250 gpm (980 L/min) of
required standpipe flow.

905.2.1.5 Automatic sprinkler system demand. The automatic sprinkler system demand,
including the inside hose stream demand from NFPA 13, is to be provided by the municipal
water supply system without requiring fire department pumping into the system.

Subp. 2. F Section 905.3.2. IBC F Section 905.3.2 is amended by adding a section to read
as follows:

905.3.2.1 Group A exhibition. Class III automatic standpipes shall be provided in Group A 3
Occupancies where the floor area used for exhibition exceeds 12,000 square feet (1115 m?).

Subp. 3. F Section 905.3.4. IBC F Sections 905.3.4 and 905.3.4.1 are amended by deleting
the sections in their entirety.

21



Subp. 4. Repealed, 31 SR 1165
Subp. 5. Repealed, 31 SR 1165

Subp. 6. F Section 905.3.8. IBC F Section 905.3 is amended by adding a subsection to read
as follows:

905.3.8 905.3.9 Detention and correctional facilities. Regardless of the height of the building
or number of stories, every building in a Group I 3 detention and correctional facility, where 50
or more persons are under restraint or security under Occupancy Condition 3, 4 or 5, shall be
provided with a Class III automatic wet or semiautomatic dry standpipe system.

Exception: Combined systems meeting the provisions of Section 905.2 may be used.

When acceptable to the fire chief, fire department connections may be located inside all security
walls or fences on the property.

Standpipes shall be located in accordance with Section 905. In addition, standpipes shall be
located so that it will not be necessary to extend hose lines through smoke barriers. When
located in cell complexes, standpipes may be located in secured pipe chases.

Subp. 6a. F Section 905.3.9. IBC F Section 905.3 is amended by adding a subsection to
read as follows:

905.3.9 905.3.10 Group R 2 occupancies. Convenience overhaul hose connections.
Convenience hose connections are not intended to serve as standpipes in accordance with NFPA
14. Class III wet standpipes shall be installed in Group R 2 occupancies three or more stories in
height where any portion of the building's interior area is more than 200 feet (60,960 mm) of
travel, vertically or horizontally, from the nearest point of fire department vehicle access.
Standpipes required by this section shall be installed in enclosed stairways.

In buildings provided with a birdcage design fire sprinkler system, separate standpipes
are required with fire department valves on each floor. In buildings utilizing a combined
sprinkler/standpipe system, fire department valves are required. Minimum standpipe
size shall be not less than 2 % inches.

Permanent signage shall be required which reads, “Fire Department Overhaul Hose -
Connection” at each connection in the building. If a separate standpipe system is
provided, a sign shall also be provided at the exterior FD connection.

Subp. 7. F Section 905.5.1. IBC F Section 905.5.1 is deleted.

1305.0906 F SECTION 906, Portable Fire Extinguishers.

Subpart 1. F Section 906.1 IBC Section 906.1 is amended to read:

22



906.1 Where required. Portable fire extinguishers shall be installed in the following
locations:

1. In all Group A, B, E, F, H, I, M, R-1, R-2, R-4 and S occupancies.

Exception: In all Group A, B and E occupancies equipped throughout with
an approved automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with
Sections 903.3.1.1 fire extinguishers shall be required only in laundry
rooms, boiler and furnace rooms, mechanical and electrical rooms,
garages, stages, projection booths, shops, laboratories, kitchens, locker
rooms, custodial closets, trash-collection rooms, storage rooms greater
than 100 square feet and similar areas.

2. Within 30 feet (9144 mm) of commercial cooking equipment.

3. In areas where flammable or combustible liquids are stored, used or
dispensed.

4. Except in Group R-3 occupanices, a fire extinguisher shall be located in
accordance with Section 3309 while buildings are under construction.

5. Where required by the sections indicated in Table 906.1.

8. Special-hazard areas, including but not limited to laboratories, computer rooms
and generator rooms, where required by the fire code official.

7. R-3 occupancies used as family day care, group family day care, foster care,
adult family day services and residential hospices.

1305.0907 F SECTION 907, FIRE ALARM AND DETECTION SYSTEMS.

Subp. la. F Section 907.2. IBC F Section 907.2 is amended to read as follows:

907.2 Where required in new buildings and occupancies. An approved manual, automatic, or
manual and automatic fire alarm system shall be provided in new buildings and occupancies in

23



accordance with Sections 907.2.1 through 907.2.24 and NFPA 72. For the purposes of Sections
907.2.1 through 907.2.24, fire barrier walls or fire walls shall not define separate buildings. In
buildings containing mixed occupancies that are designed as separated uses in accordance with
Section 50833 508.4, fire alarm and detection systems need only be installed in those
occupancies where required by this section.

Exception: In areas protected by an approved, supervised automatic sprinkler system
installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2, automatic fire detectors required
by Section 907.2 need not be provided. Where Section 907.2 requires smoke detectors, such
protection shall be installed.

Subp. 2. Repealed, 31 SR 1165

Subp. ??27?. F Section 907.2.1. IFC Section 907.2.1 is amended, and sections added, to
read: ‘

907.2.1 Group A, general. A fire alarm system shall be installed in accordance with
Sections 907.2.1 through 907.2.1.3 in Group A occupancies having an occupant load of
300 or more.

Exceptions:

1. Assembly areas used solely for worship purposes.

2 A fire alarm system is not required when an approved automatic fire-
extinquishing system is installed throughout the building.

3. Group A occupancy portions of Group E occupancies are allowed to have
alarms as required for the Group E occupancy.

4. Group A-5 occupancies. Also see Section 907.2.11.

Subp. 3. F Section 907.2.1.1. IBCF Section 907.2.1.1 is amended to read as follows:

007.2.1.1 Initiation. Initiation of the fire alarm system shall be by automatic means. Approved
automatic fire detectors shall be installed in laundry rooms, boiler and furnace rooms,
mechanical and electrical rooms, shops, kitchens, trash collection rooms, storage rooms, and
similar areas.

Subp. 4. F Section 907.2.1.2. IBC F Section 907.2.1.2 is amended to read as follows:

907.2.1.2 Notification. The required fire alarm system shall activate an audible and visible
notification appliance at a constantly attended location within the building for the purposes of
initiating emergency action. A presignal feature and positive alarm sequencing in accordance
with NFPA 72 are permitted.

24



Occupant notification shall be by means of voice announcements, either live or prerecorded,
initiated by the person in the constantly attended location.

Exception: Where no constantly attended location exists, an automatic fire alarm system
providing a general evacuation signal or an approved emergency voice/alarm
communications system is permitted.

Subp. 5. F Section 907.2.1. IBC F Section 907.2.1 is amended by adding a section to read
as follows:

907.2.1.3 System initiation in Group A occupancies with an occupant load of 1,000 or more.
Activation of the fire alarm system in Group A occupancies with an occupant load of 1,000 or
more shall immediately initiate an approved prerecorded message announcement using an
approved emergency voice/alarm communications system in accordance with NFPA 72.

Exception: Where approved, the prerecorded announcement is allowed to be manually
deactivated for a period of time, not to exceed 3 three minutes, for the sole purpose of
allowing a live voice announcement from an approved constantly attended location.

Subp. 6. F Section 907.2.2. IBCF Section 907.2.2 is amended to read as follows:

907.2.2 Group B, general. A fire alarm system shall be installed in accordance with Sections
907.2.2 through 907.2.2.3 in Group B occupancies where:

1. The building has an occupant load of 500 or more persons; or

2. The building has an occupant load of more than 100 persons above or below the lowest
level of exit discharge; or

3. The building contains an eutpatient-elinie: ambulatory care facility.

When automatic sprinkler systems or automatic fire detectors are installed in eutpatient
elinies; ambulatory care facility, such systems or detectors shall be connected to the building fire
alarm system.

Exception: In other than eutpatient-clinies; ambulatory care facility, a fire alarm system is
not required when an approved automatic fire extinguishing system is installed throughout
the building.

Subp. 7. F Section 907.2.2. IBC F Section 907.2.2 is amended by adding a section to read
as follows:

907.2.2.1 Initiation. Initiation of the fire alarm system shall be by automatic means. Approved
automatic fire detectors shall be provided in boiler and furnace rooms, shops, kitchens,
mechanical and electrical rooms, trash collection rooms, storage rooms and similar areas. In
outpatient-clinies; ambulatory care facilities, initiation of the fire alarm system shall also be by
manual means.

25



Subp. 8. F Section 907.2.2. IBC F Section 907.2.2 is amended by adding a section to read
as follows:

907.2.2.2 Notification. Activation of the fire alarm system shall initiate a general evacuation
signal.

Exception: In lieu of audible notification appliances, visible notification appliances shall be
permitted to be used in patient care areas.

Subp. 9. F Section 907.2.2. IBC F Section 907.2.2 is amended by adding a section to read
as follows:

907.2.2.3 Outpatient—elinies: Ambulatory Care Facilities. Corridors in eutpatient—ehnies

ambulatory care facilities and spaces open to the corridors shall be protected by an automatic
smoke detection system.

Subp. 10. F Section 907.2.3. IBC F Section 907.2.3 is amended to read as follows:

907.2.3 Group E, general. A fire alarm system shall be installed in accordance with Sections
907.2.3 through 907.2.3.3 in Group E occupancies having an occupant load of 50 or more.

Subp. 11. F Section 907.2.3. IBC F Section 907.2.3 is amended by adding a section to read
as follows:

907.2.3.1 Initiation. Initiation of the fire alarm system shall be by manual and automatic means.
Approved automatic fire detectors shall be provided in laundry rooms, boiler and furnace rooms,
mechanical and electrical rooms, shops, laboratories, kitchens, locker rooms, janitors' closets,
trash collection rooms, storage rooms, lounges and similar areas.

Exceptions:

1. In buildings protected throughout by an approved, supervised fire sprinkler system,
manual fire alarm boxes are only required in the main office and in a custodial area.

2. Where all corridors are protected by an approved automatic fire alarm system having
smoke detection with alarm verification, manual fire alarm boxes are only required near exits
serving shops, chemistry and physics laboratories, boiler rooms, industrial technology and
industrial arts rooms, kitchens, custodian's offices, and main offices.

Subp. 12. F Section 907.2.3. IBC F Section 907.2.3 is amended by adding a subsection to
read as follows:

907.2.3.2 Travel through adjoining rooms. Where the only means of egress travel from an
interior room or rooms having an aggregate occupant load of more than 10 occupants is through
an adjoining or intervening room, automatic smoke detectors shall be installed throughout the
common atmosphere through which the path of egress travel passes.

26



Exception: In buildings that are protected throughout by an approved automatic sprinkler
system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1, smoke detectors are not required in
intervening or adjoining rooms.

Subp. 13. F Section 907.2.3. IBC F Section 907.2.3 is amended by adding a section to read
as follows:

907.2.3.3 Notification. Activation of the fire alarm system or automatic sprinkler system shall
initiate a general evacuation signal.

Subp. 14. F Section 907.2.4. IBC F Section 907.2.4 is amended to read as follows:

907.2.4 Group F, general. A fire alarm system shall be installed in accordance with Sections
907.2.4 through 907.2.4.2 in Group F occupancies that are two or more stories in height and have
an occupant load of 500 or more above or below the lowest level of exit discharge.

Exception: A fire alarm system is not required when an approved automatic fire
extinguishing system is installed throughout the building.

Subp. 15. F Section 907.2.4. IBC F Section 907.2.4 is amended by adding a section to read
as follows:

907.2.4.1 Initiation. Initiation of the fire alarm system shall be by manual and automatic means.
Approved automatic fire detectors shall be provided in boiler and furnace rooms, trash collection
rooms, kitchens, mechanical and electrical rooms, and similar areas.

Subp. 16. F Section 907.2.4. IBC F Section 907.2.4 is amended by adding a section to read
as follows:

907.2.4.2 Notification. Activation of the fire alarm system shall initiate a general evacuation
signal.

Subp. 17. F Section 907.2.5. IBC F Section 907.2.5 is amended to read as follows:

907.2.5 Group H, general. A fire alarm system shall be installed in accordance with Sections
907.2.5 through 907.2.5.2 in Group H-5 occupancies, occupancies used for the manufacture of
organic coatings, and, when required by Chapters 60, 62, and 63 of the IFC at 37;-39-and-40; the

following locations:

1. Rooms or areas where highly toxic compressed gases are stored or used;
2. Rooms or areas where Class I, II or III organic peroxides are stored; and
3. Liquid and solid oxidizer storage areas.

Subp. 18. F Section 907.2.5. IBC F Section 907.2.5 is amended by adding a section to read
as follows:

27



907.2.5.1 Initiation. Initiation of the fire alarm system in Group H-5 Occupancies and in
occupancies used for the manufacture of organic coatings shall be by manual means. Initiation
of fire alarm systems installed for highly toxic gases, organic peroxides and oxidizers shall be by
automatic means, as specified in Chapters 60, 62, and 63 3%-39-ane-46 of the 2012 IFC.

Subp. 19. F Section 907.2.5. IBCF Section 907.2.5 is amended by adding a section to read
as follows:

907.2.5.2 Notification. Activation of the fire alarm system in Group H-5 Occupancies and in
occupancies used for the manufacture of organic coatings shall initiate a general evacuation
signal. Activation of the automatic detection systems installed for highly toxic gases, organic
peroxides, and oxidizers shall sound a local alarm.

Subp. 20. Repealed, 31 SR 1165
Subp. 21. Repealed, 31 SR 1165

Subp. 72272. F Section 907.2.6. IFC Section 907.2.6 and all subsections are deleted in their
entirety and replaced with the following:

907.2.6 Group I, general. A fire alarm system shall be installed in accordance with Sections
907.2.6 through 907.2.6.5.1 in Group I occupancies.

907.2.6.1 Notification: Activation of the fire alarm system in Group I occupancies shall
immediately transmit an alarm to an approved monitoring station in accordance with-
NFPA 72.

907.2.6.2 Group I-1 occupancies. Initiation of the fire alarm system shall be by manual
and automatic means. Automatic smoke detectors shall be provided in waiting areas that
are open to corridors.

907.2.6.2.1 Notification. Activation of the fire alarm system or automatic
sprinkler system shall initiate a general evacuation signal.

Exceptions:

1. In lieu of audible notification appliances, visible notification appliances shall
be allowed to be used in critical care areas.

2. Where occupants are incapable of evacuating themselves because of age,
physical/mental disabilities or physical restraint, only the attendants or other
personnel required to evacuate occupants from a zone, area, floor or building shall
be required to be notified. This notification shall include means to readily identify
the zone, area, floor or building in need of evacuation.

907.2.6.3 Group I-2 occupancies. Initiation of the fire alarm system shall be by manual
and automatic means. Hospitals, nursing homes (both intermediate care and skilled

28



nursing facilities), board and care homes and detoxification facilities shall be provided
with smoke detection throughout the corridor and spaces open to the corridors, other than
nurse’s stations.

Exception: 1. Corridor smoke detection shall not be required where the sleeping
room smoke detectors required in 907.2.6.3 are connected to an approved fire alarm
system and activate a general evacuation signal.

2. Manual fire alarm boxes shall not be required at exits from patient sleeping areas if
located at all nurses’ stations or other constantly attended staff locations, provided
such fire alarm boxes are visible and continuously accessible and that travel distances
horizontally, on the same floor shall not exceed 200 ft to reach a manual fire alarm
box.

907.2.6.3.1 Notification. Activation of the fire alarm system or automatic sprinkler
system shall initiate a general evacuation signal that is distinctive from audible
signals used for other purposes in the same building.

Exceptions:

1. In lieu of audible notification appliances, visible notification appliances shall be
allowed to be used in critical care areas.

Where occupants are incapable of evacuating themselves because of age,
physical/mental disabilities or physical restraint, only the attendants or other
personnel required to evacuate occupants from a zone, area, floor or building shall
be required to be notified. This notification shall include means to readily identify
the zone, area, floor or building in need of evacuation.

7. Where total evacuation of occupants is impractical due to building configuration,
only the occupants in the affected zones shall be initially notified. Provisions shall
be made to selectively notify occupants in other zones to afford orderly
evacuation of the entire building.

3. Smoke detectors used solely for closing dampers or heating, ventilating, and air
conditioning system shutdown shall not be required to activate the building
evacuation alarm.

907.2.6.3.2 Patient room smoke detectors. Smoke detectors shall be installed in
patient sleeping rooms of hospitals and nursing homes. Such detector’s primary
power shall be other than battery power. Actuation of such detectors shall cause a
visual display on the corridor side of the room where the detector is located and shall
cause a distinct audible and visual alarm at the nurse’s station attending the room.
Such detectors may be part of the facility, fire alarm system, nurse’s call system or a
standalone system. Integral smoke detectors of automatic door-closing devices on

29



sleeping room doors can meet this requirement if they also cause all the items listed
in 907.2.6.3.1.

907:2.6.4 Group I-3 occupancies. Initiation of the fire alarm system shall be by manual
and automatic means. Approved automatic fire detectors shall be installed in laundry and
soiled linen rooms, boiler and furnace rooms, mechanical and electrical rooms, shops,
laboratories, kitchens, locker rooms, janitors® closets, trash-collection rooms, storage
rooms, lounges, gift shops, commissaries and similar areas. Actuation of an automatic
fire-extinguishing system, a manual fire alarm box or a fire detector shall initiate an
approved fire alarm signal, which automatically notifies staff, Presignal systems shall not
be used.

907.2.6.4.1 Manual fire alarm boxes. Manual fire alarm boxes are not required
to be located in accordance with Section 907.4 where the fire alarm boxes are
provided at staff-attended locations having direct supervision over areas where
manual fire alarm boxes have been omitted. Manual fire alarm boxes are
permitted to be locked in areas occupied by detainees, provided that staff
members are present within the subject area and have keys readily available to
operate the manual fire alarm boxes.

907.2.6.4.2 Smoke detectors. An approved automatic smoke-detection system
shall be installed throughout resident housing areas, including sleeping areas and
contiguous day rooms, group activity spaces and other common spaces normally
accessible to residents.

Exceptions:

1. Other approved smoke-detection arrangements providing equivalent
protection, such as placing detectors in exhaust ducts from cells or behind
protective grills, are allowed when necessary to prevent damage or

tampering.

7 Smoke detectors are not required in sleeping rooms with four or fewer
occupants in smoke compartments that are equipped throughout with an
approved automatic sprinkler system,

907.2.6.5 Group I-4 Occupancies. Initiation of the fire alarm system shall be by manual
and automatic means. Automatic smoke detectors shall be provided in waiting areas that
are open to corridors.

907.2.6.5.1 Notification. Activation of the fire alarm system or automatic
sprinkler system shall initiate a general evacuation signal.

30



S ¥atsval
AV F ¥ o

.
11h Sant
UTCOaIC O v It OUwLl

nrdance iz

R hWaVaYal
I avw

ad

+011]
ITOHIIN

Al e 1nac

I oI owTIal

rm_auctem—ch
Y Yot

fire ala
I T TIrCaIar

A

roap Ty squnvialks

1 6 Craunlt soenaral

07

AN ET-AVERN |

Q9

amcr

ler gnd

UOTIVUT

hoi

.
INen-1roo

led]
OO T OUTInS

\= aye \vp§ A

Aeand o

Oy all

.
1 larn
psopugenrsul

inatalled

all he
TOT Y OTIOT OV TInSTaTIVIE

tanc ol

ra detee

£

10
[SACIAUSERICAB AN B R RAN LAY v

armtomat

A haSablant Il)r]
YpPPIrovea

juviviseiepy

lacker +roomma—

TOTISUT

tolhana
toH S

.
1

IOy, IXT

1c

was Fatal

lahaorate
OUTUWY

1 raomaechope
TOOIILY, SIIUPS,; 1t

100

alepty
O—o1ootroar

r1eal and
Toal—arr

mechay

COoTIny, HIvtnar

frnace 1rooms
TUIIaoT—T

QPaaq
TroTLSy

.]f]ﬂ

1133

and.-<
AT OITITITaY

£t chano

.
1

ST SO oy

lonnocecs
TOOUIITYT TOULTE VO,

OO

ctarace
STOTAET

1B

loet
TCCTIOTTOOH LSS

trach ol
oo UOT

claceta
A2 4V el = e

tapd!

Jarmtohs

1913

andJ]-2
oo I =

T

a1 1
up—T

AU OTU

qatat

of- G

. .
in nnttent aleanming aranag
H—Ppaatnr—sIotprig—are

haovea
TUTS

Fira nlogrm
TITCOrIarilT

MMannal
TvIarrdor

101>

Exeent
rrxtoptonr

ianoe okt other canatantls
O oTHCT T OIS tatry

OﬂA n“l(‘]ll

AVAS 2

at_all nyurcea
OS5 tatIony

atad
atCud—arr

. .

at_avite 3£ lae

(277 7aw 7o M v AW A =
'F;1‘D

1rad

o romnro
LRTASEE RS Lo S g

hall not b

TOOOIITIT 11T

log Q

oacecHB3InE
TvTTUpaliT

.
cantiny

e

ALIQT

e
arc

hasvea

alaorm

Aed aueh
SUCUIT

proviaca

.

nraol

A _ctaff laecations

attande

chall

T
qyuatem

TO—CUUTIv
ra _alapm

YIoTOIO—ar
e
[P 5 A v §

aof the
O

.
1013

3 5 S S VAV AN TV )
.
aotivzat

o ara
o,
additiaon
TIT—agaure

] In

B2%yateon

Q1Onn

Thyy
101

TOTOtIo
avacat

A" e e n Y
a ceneral
a—gvnviar

fo

TTTVIING

19

1
pessgncerny;

it

.

juten vy

Iy JtoTS

T

TT—aIartr

ATty ot oty

TOTIS

vy aouatrioir

1Q

TIINY

Th

fied
TTIOTITICU,

nots

ta he
to— 0O

d

A~ hz2 e -ing

chall _ha _regiyre
LoA a8

SITaIT

IO

.
1

ar_bhuild
O ounonirg

flaor
pEAVAVS Y

Qran
arvi,

MLy 7ot o V=Y
O UGy

fram
TroTIT

accupnanta
oLCupdanty

31



detector—ahall
ot T

Q
CTTOT T

a0 nnnraved fie
T anap pruy ol

[
job]

0N A where the firo alarns haw
TOTTT

FaYel o RO
WO CtTHO T ar i OUACS airv PIouy L

that ctafbmerab

Fay erc o1y Py m-t
-SRI O otro oo prostin vyt L

P
o]
g

q

[
[
®
@

2 Uinkea Ao+ant

o]

Z5 T RITTOIR U OUtUw

Subp. 23. F Section 907.2.7. IBC F Section 907.2.7 is deleted.

Subp. 24. F Section 907.2.7.1. IBC F Section 907.2.7.1 is deleted.
Subp. 25. F Section 907.2.8. IBC F Section 907.2.8 is amended to read as follows:

907.2.8 Group R-1, general. A fire alarm system shall be installed in accordance with Sections
907.2.8 through 907.2.8.3 in Group R-1 occupancies.

Exceptions:

1. A fire alarm system is not required in buildings not over two stories in height where all
individual guest rooms and contiguous attic and crawl spaces are separated from each other
and public or common areas by at least one-hour fire partitions and each guest room has an
exit directly to a public way, exit court or yard.

2. Buildings containing five or less guest rooms shall be allowed to be equipped with
approved multiple-station smoke detectors installed as required for Group R-3 Occupancies.
Installation shall be in accordance with Section 907.2.10:11.

907.2.8.1 Initiation. Initiation of the fire alarm system shall be by automatic means. Approved
automatic fire detectors shall be provided in boiler and furnace rooms, shops, laundry rooms,
mechanical and electrical rooms, trash collection rooms, storage rooms, gift shops, locker rooms

32



and similar areas. Automatic smoke detectors shall be provided in all common areas and interior
corridors serving as required means of egress.

Exceptions:

1. System fire and smoke detectors are not required when an approved automatic fire
extinguishing system is installed in accordance with section 903.3.1 or 903.3.1.1.

location:

2. In buildings protected with an approved automatic fire-extinguishing system in
accordance with section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2, manual fire alarm boxes need not be
provided at the exits when one is installed at a constantly attended location.

nd  man a¥a! atda ded At »
A y v - A

907.2.8.2 Notification. Activation of the fire alarm system or automatic sprinkler system shall
initiate a general evacuation signal.

907.2.8.3 Guest room smoke alarms. detectors: Guest room smoke detectors required by
Section 907.2.10 11 shall not be connected to a fire alarm system.

Exception: Connection of such alarms deteeters for annunciation only.

Subp. 26. F Section 907.2.9. IBC F Section 907.2.9 is amended, and subsections added, to
read as follows:

907.2.9 Group R 2, general. A fire alarm system shall be installed in accordance with Sections
907.2.9 through 907.2.9.2 in Group R 2 occupancies where:

1. Any guest room or dwelling unit is located two or more stories above the story containing
the lowest level of exit discharge;

2. Any guest room or dwelling unit is located more than one story below the highest level of
exit discharge of exits serving the dwelling unit;

3. The building contains more than 16 dwelling units or guest rooms; or

Exception: A fire alarm system is not required in buildings not over two stories in height
where all dwelling units and contiguous attic and crawl spaces are separated from each other
and public or common areas by at least one hour fire partitions and each dwelling unit has an
exit directly to a public way, exit court or yard.

907.2.9.1 Initiation. Initiation of the fire alarm system shall be by automatic means. Automatic
fire detectors shall be provided in boiler and furnace rooms, trash collection rooms, shops,
laundry rooms, mechanical and electrical rooms, storage rooms, and similar areas. Automatic
smoke detectors shall be provided in all common areas and interior corridors serving as required
means of egress.

33



Exception: System fire and smoke detectors are not required when an approved automatic
fire extinguishing system is installed throughout the building.

907.2.9.2 Notification. Activation of the fire alarm system or automatic sprinkler system shall
initiate a general evacuation signal.

907.2.9.3 Dwelling unit smoke alarms. deteetors: Dwelling unit smoke alarms deteetors
required by Section 907.2.40 11 shall not be connected to the building fire alarm system.

Exception: Connection of such alarms deteetoss for annunciation only.

Subpt ?? F 907.2.9.3 Group R-2 College and university buildings is amended by renumbering the
section as follows.:

907.2.9.3 907.2.9.4 Group R-2 college and university buildings. An automatic smoke
detection system that activates the occupant notification system in accordance with
Section 907.5 shall be installed in Group R-2 college and university buildings in the
following locations:

Subpt 72 F 907.2.11.3 Interconnection is amended by adding an exception to the section as
follows:

Exception: Smoke alarms installed in sleeping rooms of Group R-3 buildings equipped
throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section
903.3.1.1, 903.3.1.2, or 903.3.1.3 are not required to be interconnected.

Subp. 27. F Section 9072102 907.2.11.4 IBC F Section 907:2:10:2 907.2.11.4 is
amended to read as follows:

907.2.10.2 907.2.11.4 Power source. In new construction, required smoke alarms shall receive
their primary power from the building wiring where such wiring is served from a commercial
source and shall be equipped with a battery backup. Smoke alarms shall emit a signal when the
batteries are low. Wiring shall be permanent and without a disconnecting switch other than as
required for overcurrent protection.

Exceptions:

1. Smoke alarms are not required to be equipped with battery backup in Group R 1
occupancies where they are connected to an emergency electrical system.

34



2. Smoke alarms are not required to be equipped with battery backup in Group R 2
occupancies equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance
with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2.

3. Smoke alarms installed in sleeping rooms of group R-3 buildings equipped
throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section
903.3.1.1, 903.3.1.2, or 903.3.1.3 are allowed to be battery-powered.

tontad s
OGOy it

n o
oararepr

ey

o]

Subp. 28. F Section 907.2. IBC F Section 907.2 is amended by adding sections to read as
follows:

907224 907.2.23 Residential hospices. A fire alarm system shall be installed in accordance
with Section 997-2.24 907.2.23 in residential hospices. When automatic sprinkler systems or
automatic fire detectors are installed, such systems or detectors shall be connected to the building
fire alarm system.

907.2.24.1 907.2.23.1 Initiation. Initiation of the fire alarm system shall be by manual and
automatic means. Approved automatic fire detectors shall be provided in boiler and furnace
rooms, kitchens, laboratories, shops, gift shops, commissaries, laundry and soiled linen rooms,
mechanical and electrical rooms, locker rooms, storage rooms, janitors' closets, trash collection
rooms, lounges and similar areas. Automatic smoke detectors shall be provided in sleeping
rooms, corridors and spaces open to the corridors.

Exception: Manual fire alarm boxes are not required at exits if manual fire alarm boxes are
located at all nurses' stations or other continuously attended staff locations, provided such
fire alarm boxes are visible and continuously accessible and that travel distances required by
Section 907.4.1 are not exceeded.

9072242 907.2.23.2 Notification. Activation of the fire alarm system or automatic sprinkler
system shall initiate a general evacuation signal. In addition, the fire alarm system shall be

monitored by an approved central station service in accordance with Section 903.4.1.

Exception: In lieu of audible notification appliances, visible notification appliances shall be
allowed to be used in sleeping areas.

Subp. 29. Repealed, 31 SR 1165

35



Subpt. 22 F Section 907.3 is amended to read as follows::

907.3 Fire safety functions. Automatic fire detectors utilized forthe purpose-of performingfire

. oy 1 .
aenfotsz Funetions chall he connectedto the huilding’s fire alarnicontrol-unit swvherea fire alarm
Sarety-HRCHOY S OTCOIHICU TV A U7 I pyHaHS—-SHFe-didi-Cotd O vt -vwiIvT oo T di1ali1i2

systemis required by Sections 907.2- and chapter 11 are to activate notification appliances in
accordance with those sections. : . ton—per i i

B . . . . TR q TR . .
and activate-the alorn-notifieation annlisncecoractizate a-37151 o and ayray o e rulSOry—a anal
ang-actvate-thedarihRotHtauon apprianvUs O aviT VOtV Tl HSHEeadhodutioiCHupor vioory STt

at o constantly-attended location. Where automatic fire detectors are installed for other fire
safety functions, they shall perform the intended function upon activation. Where automatic
detectors are installed for fire safety functions and the building has a fire alarm system, such
detectors shall activate supervisory signals at the fire alarm control panel or at a constantly
attended location. Where the building does not have a fire alarm system, such detectors shall
activate a visual and audible supervisory signal at an approved location, which shall indicate the
source of the sienal, In-buildings not-equipped-with e-alarm system—the-sutomatiefire

sanv, a
detectarchall he nowere
agetectOlHhaalr DT PO wWwIIv

. . .
o 9
0 .

farm the antended

=3 a
TOTITT TV TTIITOUTIIVE

ol alants 0
T, PC

At Fat 2}
Y IO OV O

o]

Subpt. 2? F 907.3 .1 Duct smoke detectors is deleted entirely and replaced with the following:

907.3.1 Air distribution and air-handling systems. Smoke detectors installed to shut
down the air distribution or air-handling system shall, upon activation, perform the
intended function. Air distribution or air-handling equipment that is part of a smoke-
control system shall switch to smoke-control mode upon activation of a detector.

907.3.1.1 Fire alarm system interface. Smoke detectors that are installed in air
distribution or air-handling systems for shutdown purposes and that are connected
to a fire alarm system shall not sound a general evacuation signal.

Subpt. 2?2 F 907.3.2 Delayed egress locks is deleted entirely and réolaoed with the following:

907.3.2 Elevator control functions. Smoke detectors that are installed to control or
recall elevators or to control doors for elevators, elevator lobbies or elevator shafts and
that are connected to a fire alarm system shall not sound a general evacuation signal.
Elevator recall and firefighter's emergency operation for elevators shall only be
controlled by elevator smoke detectors and shall not initiate upon other building fire
detectors or evacuation signals.

Subpt. 2? F 907.3.3 Elevator emergency operation is deleted entirely and replaced with the
following:

907.3.3 Door hold-open functions. Smoke detectors that are installed to hold open fire
doors under nonemergency conditions and that are connected to a fire alarm system shall
sound a general evacuation signal when the doors being held open are part of the means
of egress corridor or stair system. Door hold-open smoke detectors are not required to
activate a visual or audible signal.

36



ly.

ire

t

101N €1

is amended by deleting the sect

1ng

.5 Monitori

6

jon 907

2?7 F Sect

?

Subpt

nded torend-ac follaais:
HECOTO-TTaaasTOTIoOVY O,

1an 00790 i ame
CTIOTI U7 v 7~ 1o Gillvw

RC ESact
TG T DU

1an-907.902
\$ i e ey ey -1

¥ Seoet
IO

Q]"]’\“’\ Qn
oHOPOor

chall
1T

T OO arIc oIt

hat f

and

he nravided
OUT POy

than 1l

OtrIoT—tiar (T

anooc chall
oatIoTapprialiviny [e2uterny

dfor

. .
1an—apnnh

cat

£

.
1
T

WLle alarm not
OrC—aralr o oov

.
1
T

Aud
Fas =

QTN

ble_—alarms

(PAvS S EpLVINNIY T

90792 Aud
TU T IX

TIariTLs

a fire algm
arre level of 145 _dee

T oTTa X

anxnrrnoce—other

heo 1i10e
|3 A VAR ¥ Iv L

1 natta

1ve cormd—that
> Ourch—iar oot

.
1atinet
Glototry

nr\\11‘\r‘ o} r:l
WOOITG

llJUuU

Ororay—pa

helg

LeA S Te )

[}
1

SUTC— IOV O UT T UVl

1de annd_nrea

1ances ah all nray

inn_annl

fHont
HHHOTIroatiorr

(AR AN ahave the averace ambh

OTY)

1

arm-—not

hle al
oUIv arar

T]'\n a1 1(1
+Ta]C—aatr

appranvos SHar proviooe—a SOGTIOTPIU0

cound level having

tHC i >o gt IO VO TIa v iiiy

the mascim

ashove
T-oO DI Yy qQuioves

L= 3 0 av i AR A=) SV

+ cotmdlevel ar5 AR A
i

1lon

OO vV OTHC O vVoIag v ariulvilv s

.
thin the
withid—hac

A _cnace i

ASACATAY SEASAC IS Sina g

75 4R A
1o

1N--—every—_ocetHe

. .
1ohever 1o oreater
HS—groatci S voly

.

A\PAVARS I VAV S ACTe PR A B R A2 R A A 2

60 cecandsa

TI—o T Ivaot

a_ dnration—of-at legat

o atrat™
hild

-1
Py

and
xanu— T

R

Carrons
SToapy

1
poes

\v5 >y

chall he:
Us.
and 60-4BA

STIOTT

lexvela
IOV UL

epund_nreqonre
SOTHTIUPIooouivy

TITTOTIT

90-dB A

I Rathnabhiaal

PR SivERs U U

Tha m

1o

'Umlulll&,»

IO

,\f\n‘l]“ﬂnn"on 'T‘]"Q
SECHPAnCICsT

An_anolisncecchall be- 110 AR A _at the

Oappriaiiocus ST OC 1TV OD7I Y iy

1n-ather

[¢ASLV EAVAV ALV iV AL WP NV QR VA S 2 Y

\SiSiestory
fieat

. .
n mnnl‘\nﬂthn] ominment- oo
T ConaravaT VU DIt L

.
1
OO, OU DT T

cermaneless
ooTthpanet

Fal

hle alarm-not 1
HHHoahroder

1

1113 sornd precoure laval for a11d
IO OO Prosouivy TOVyOITUTOTuTeUIddl

jestevsvunnges

.

maxim

. .
tont nolce 1a
O15C—>

the averace amb
trie—averdg U—a otttk

\AR A Z o~

1anoo

]
PHarivey

]’\1 8 Oy

.
1
g CcU— ot ToU—aacToIivT Ay

rotanece franm-the a11d

1 heartng 4
it —Orst
arentor than 105 AR A

L= 3% w ey Biv]

.

et hakhaal

hssnasunnny

Lo val
\AS32% Y

danece
\wiavies ¥y i

.
1B 3IECON

1ded
ProvIooaIn aov

hall ha nrayz
I Ov

fieatinnannliances <
ApPpPHIaictS—St

.
1
|Demawieanyvivy

+

hle alarm no
cararr 1o

A §2 k]

sreato Tty TUO O vV IOTUT

hie alarm
1T

.
1

£ aid
T oot

.
18130

1

10
A\UAAAV VIS W BAVAT S V]

]f\‘"l YOI'] 1

T

all he al
T ow—ar

annlinneea ah
27 2 Y2212 R A e

finatinn

1
T TIoTIToaeorT

larm- not

hle g
Y IOTOTC™ T

1Q

AVA

1L

Fvnnn"
EACCpPaoin

and_ciheectioneadded —to
G053 050 Oatdaca, o

ded
\w A=A~ 2y

1Q _anion

IRC.E Qantinn 007 10
D CCTION—> o7/ 1TU Ly arnavil

TIOST

H Soprtion-907-106
U 1LUs

T RCCNRT

21

Q‘]l’\“
oHOPO 1

1vafe

[}
aro-rTo—aviryaly

fire-de

Yy 1Oro—atiumnmantre i

m tho

tead har Sortian-007 2 greto-get
CtorSTeqUCao yOCoton—7uv7nz

otare reaid

.
10 fira dete
CTIrC—atte

Antomat
ppy=invisareans

1008

o eafotvfunet
THFC- YOy TR T IOt

fiont

907 10 K
Uk

arc

toantarg oo
QoTTCToTS

10

Where antomati

101K

wCOTTOTIY,

1th _thace ceet

VY It —trIosST
theyv oh

Adanece wur

RSl s VaYaVat)
T accoraarroy

. . .
inn_annligneces

.
1

peswanpmawioany

not

On—applancos
tolled for-other

TS TOTIUTK

1O

.
1179t

.
Lon-Hnon-aet
aotvatrotls

fHinet
THRCHIOTT

intended
<

IO IItoTIcrT

\vimuS

all marfar

101G

finet

firo cafety

HA

GpPuoTT

T Yot pul L
ad for

TOLICTIOTRS

TOT-OTOoT o satvly

MW hetre o

ooy oirvarailnn

1dino haa g Heo alarm

.
1

hn

and the
anOtnv

1O

< funet

firo anfat
DIt

TUT TITV

inatall

TOTO are TILSTAIIvY

10 detectara are

[AwaEBIean A waRv i) ANA

toamat

yy oo at

[4=auivossyy

BAEAEE AR

at o

nanel or

at the fire alarm ranteal
gt tHC-1IIrT—Ti™

la

TEHIaTs

QLONS

aTafatvd

nte Qumerss

cneh-_deteectora ahall _get

A% S mavavin ey

aneh
OUTT

Pancrordara
cyustem
3 Yol

T COTINroOT

fire_alarm

GOCH OtV rrvauliin

dnece not_have-g

PervIsUry ™S
hildine
TS

|79 4%7

nd and

viIouoar ar

VY TIUTO

1 a0 Whepre the
O—ToTator
1 q

CtoTb—yrr—Tmorrvyato—otr
d laeat

attende
J Attt ut

ayuctem

3y ot
conctantlyv
COTIoTantr

’;I'\]’\

\AgIvavIny

wzh

1810

+ an annravedloeat
= pproveaTovadots;

{ 1o
puces gy

QLA

OO L

hle cimerss
10 AuUTIoIT SUp Uy IoULy IIE

.
1

.
1untoe q 371g11a

GCTeCtors— o avttrvidivy o

Adetactore chall get

101

.
ntended funet
tH TGO Tairotrons

nerfaorm - the

101

.
1yat

.

mon—aet

cucterm. chall 1

kL aVad

. . .
1ON--OF-3 handl
TOTI O ol aoTiT S

. . .
11 dicteribhut
STLIOUOtU

T ol Ul

the o

POt

v atroiiy

S Y OTOI STty opuonmaTr

o ronteal cucterm chall cunteh to
Oy St -SOan S ywWIto

oo o parTroUra DIITUKR O OO

1nment that 1o naet of a amol

TPt

LEnVa A~Yahhl
gt

. . .
ietebition oot handl
tHoutioh-or—<air riankr

A ‘;1' A
fpvsan=ars

fFira_alarm cuctem chall

urpostoTantd thdti T OO oo too v aiur

Aurnacac_and that are connected-to-a

I3

chitdawmn

CHITTE S y ot 1TUt ST LT

handline-cuctems for

Iy yotorirotalt

.
013
arrIarn

ar_yanall
TO—COItrolT—oul—Irovalt

+olled to_cantrol
(‘1‘\ O'F"(‘

.
Aatantare that gre 1nc
GELECTOT thdt T O—otaIIcw

Sanl-a
PTITUIRY

Tlavator control - funetions
AV COIT o 1ainC troinys

907102
T U

PoRaray
arv

Elevuatorrecall nind

that
T IOV artor Tooary arrg

alevator and
Tl vator

Fatil

EF=Yal

lahh

alavator
CICvator

alouatara

or to _econtral-doorc faor

\vau

alaxvatara
SOV ators

A yteny

[2384e ]

OIIATHY

T

TOTUTOSS

TICTYatUn,

tO—COIItror—roory UL

dtaa

acnatiaon-cional
gCHAton ST
he_controlled bz

fire_alaprm ovatom chall not connd-a general-exz
Gto—a—Hedidi—sy storistalriotsount BonciarTy

conhecte
CoOnnooTtT

alevator

onl
Oty

chall
OTITTY

elevuatars
IO Vatons

for

101

anerat

THCT s oo y—opeaiTulit

aghterlc _emerceness

firefi

amalce
IO

pC—CUMIrunta— Uy VI valul

pavEy

TITCITE AU 54

Ty y ot —oalt osodncl—a

fire_alarm cuctem chall commd—a

O S—aRg - CormoTcica—to—d v ulidlt

Ana_and that gre ronnected—to—a

41

.
1

cand

TEUTIC y— oot

TOTTIOIIIT

nonemeroeneclt

11nr‘nv
uraavrT T

37



1305.0908 SECTION 908, EMERGENCY ALARM SYSTEMS.

Subpt. 1. F Section 908.7 Carbon monoxide alarms is deleted in its entirety.

1305.0909 SECTION 909, SMOKE CONTROL SYSTEMS.

Subpart 1. F Section 909.1 Scope and purpose is amended to read as follows:

909.1 Scope and purpose. This section applies to mechanical or passive smoke control systems
when they are required by other provisions of this code. The purpose of this section is to
establish minimum requirements for the design, installation and acceptance testing of smoke
control systems that are intended to provide a tenable environment for the evacuation or
relocation of occupants. These provisions are not intended for the preservation of contents;-the

i e io operations-or-forassista H-SHPPLessio : ivities— or the

ation of operations. Smoeke-control systems repulated by-this section-serv-a-different

a atallfa' aone a A O Q ) avalue AR-Or-ovVerh

Subpart 2. F Section 909.4.6 Duration of operation is amended to read as follows:

909.4.6 Duration of operations. All portions of the active or passive smoke control system shall
be capable of continued operation after detection of the fire event for a period of not less than
either 20 minutes. erL.5-times-the caleulated-esress time—whieheverisless: System design shall

be for 20 minutes or 1.5 times the calculated egress time, whichever is less.

Subpart + 2a. F Section 909.4. IBC F Section 909.4 is amended by adding a subsection to
read as follows:

909.4.7 Door opening force. With any of the design methods allowed by Section 909, the door
opening force, latch release, and set in motion force shall comply with Section 1008.1.2 3
requirements when the system is in smoke control mode.

Subp. 2. F Section 909.21 22. IBC F Section 909 is amended by adding a subsection to read
as follows:

38



| 909.21909.22 High rise and covered mall smoke exhaust systems. High rise buildings and
covered mall buildings exceeding 50,000 square feet (4645 m”) in floor area, excluding anchor
stores, shall be equipped with a post fire smoke exhaust system installed and maintained in
" accordance with Section 943 916.

1305.0910 F SECTION 910, SMOKE AND HEAT VENTS.
IBC F Section 910 is amended to read as follows:
F SECTION 910
SMOKE AND HEAT VENTS

Subpart 1. F Section 910.1. IBC F Section 910.1 is amended by adding sections to read as
follows:

910.1.1 Required venting method. Required smoke and heat venting shall be accomplished
with mechanical smoke exhaust according to Section 910.4.

Exceptions:

1. Calculated engineering design of mechanical smoke exhaust in accordance with Section
910.5 shall be permitted for buildings sprinklered throughout.

2. For nonsprinklered buildings, smoke and heat vents as specified in Section 910.3 shall be
permitted.

3. Where approved by the code official, smoke and heat vents as specified in Section 910.3
shall be permitted in sprinklered buildings.

910.1.2 Listing. Smoke and heat vents and mechanical smoke exhaust fans shall be listed for the
intended purpose.

910.1.3 Curtain boards. When mechanical smoke exhaust is provided in accordance with
Section 910.4 or 910.5, curtain boards are only required at the separation between areas
protected with early suppression fast response (ESFR) sprinklers and conventional sprinkler
systems.

Subp. 2. F Section 910.4. IBC F Section 910.4 is amended to read as follows:

910.4 Mechanical smoke exhaust. Mechanical smoke exhaust shall be in accordance with
Sections 910.4.1 through 910.4.6.

Subp. 3. F Section 910.4.3. IBC F Section 910.4.3 is amended to read as follows:

1 be automatieally-manually activated,
0 ela 7 veen the

910.4.3 Operation. Mechanical smoke exhaust fans shal i




- In addition, individual manual
controls of each fan unit shall also be provided.

F=Ya) 1L comnle evhag
T CCIATITOA T D ITIUIN G UATITN LY

Subp. 4. F Section 910.4.5. IBC F Section 910.4.5 is amended to read as follows:

.910.4.5 Supply air. Supply air for exhaust fans shall be sized to provide a minimum of 50
percent of the required exhaust. Air velocity at each supply air opening shall not exceed an
average of 200 feet per minute when measured 4 feet (1219 mm) in front of the opening.
Openings for supply air shall be uniformly distributed around the periphery of the area served
and be located or ducted to a position not more than one-half the storage height above the floor.
Supply air openings shall open automatically upon operation of the smoke exhaust system and
shall not require a manual action at each supply opening for operation. Supply air openings shall
be kept clear of storage or obstructions to airflow for at least four feet (1219 mm) in front of the
opening. Supply air openings shall be separated from exhaust fans and exterior combustibles to
prevent introduction of smoke into the building.

Subp. 5. F Section 910. IBC F Section 910 is amended by deleting section 910.5 and
replacing it with the following: addingseetions-to-read-as-fotlows:

910.5 Calculated engineering design of mechanical smoke exhaust. Calculated engineering
design of mechanical smoke exhaust shall be in accordance with Sections 910.5.1 through
910.5.5.

910.5.1 Methodology. Mechanical smoke exhaust systems shall be designed to remove smoke
after a fire is extinguished and to assist the fire department during suppression operations or
during marginal sprinkler control situations. They are not considered life safety systems and are
not designed for occupant safety.

910.5.2 Calculation method. Volumetric flow rate calculations shall demonstrate that the
system will provide at least three air changes per hour for the space required to be provided with
smoke exhaust. When only a portion of a space is used for high piled storage requiring smoke
exhaust, the volume to be extracted shall be based on the ceiling height multiplied by the actual
gross floor area for storage.

910.5.3 Operation. Mechanical smoke exhaust fans shall be automatically activated upon
sprinkler system water flow. A 5 to 10 minute delay shall be provided between the sprinkler
water flow signal and activation of the exhaust fans. In addition, individual manual controls of
each fan unit shall also be provided.

Exception: When required by the code official, initiation of mechanical smoke exhaust fans
shall be only through manual activation.

910.5.4 Supply air. Supply air for exhaust fans shall be sized to provide a minimum of 50
percent of the required exhaust. Air velocity at each supply air opening shall not exceed an
average of 200 feet per minute when measured 4 feet (1219 mm) in front of the opening.

40



Openings for supply air shall be uniformly distributed around the periphery of the area served
and be located or ducted to a position not more than one half the storage height above the floor.
Supply air openings shall open automatically upon operation of the smoke exhaust system’and
shall not require a manual action at each supply opening for operation. Supply air openings shall
be kept clear of storage or obstructions to airflow for at least 4 feet (1219 mm) in front of the
opening. Supply air openings shall be separated from exhaust fans and exterior combustibles to
prevent introduction of smoke into the building.

910.5.5 Equipment. Wiring and controls shall be as required in Section 910.4.4. Interlocks
shall be as required in Section 910.4.6. Exhaust fans shall be uniformly spaced and each fan
shall have a maximum individual capacity of 30,000 cfm (850 m’/min).

910.6 Testing and maintenance. Mechanical smoke exhaust systems shall be tested and
maintained as required by Sections 910.6.1 through 910.6.4.

910.6.1 Acceptance testing. Mechanical smoke exhaust systems shall be acceptance tested as
required by Sections 909.18.2 1 through 909.18.5 7 and 909.19.

910.6.1.1 Controls. For testing purposes, each smoke exhaust system equipped for automatic
activation shall be put into operation by the actuation of the automatic initiating device. Control
sequences shall be verified throughout the system, including verification of override from the
firefighter's control panel when systems are equipped for automatic activation.

910.6.2 Special inspections. Special inspections for mechanical smoke exhaust shall be
conducted according to Section 909.18.8.

910.6.3 Maintenance. Mechanical smoke exhaust systems, including exhaust fans, supply air
openings and controls, shall be maintained and unobstructed.

910.6.4 Operational testing. Operational testing of the smoke exhaust system shall include all
equipment such as initiating devices, fans, dampers, controls, and supply air openings.
Mechanical smoke exhaust systems shall be operated and tested under each control sequence at
least annually.

1305.0912 F SECTION 912, FIRE DEPARTMENT CONNECTIONS.

IBC F Section 912.2 is amended by adding a subsection to read:
912.2.3 Connection height. Newly installed fire department connections shall be located not
less than 18 inches (457 mm) and not more than 4 feet (1.2 m) above the level of the adjacent

grade or access level.

| 1305.0913 SECTION-9131305.0916 SECTION 916, POST FIRE EXHAUST SYSTEM.

IBC Chapter 9 is amended by adding a section and subsections to read as follows:

| SECTION 943916

| 41



POST FIRE SMOKE EXHAUST SYSTEM

913.1916.1 Scope and purpose. This section applies to post fire smoke exhaust systems when
they are required by other provisions of this code. The purpose of this section is to establish
minimum requirements for the design and installation of smoke exhaust systems that are
intended for the timely restoration of operations and overhaul activities once a fire is
extinguished.

913.2916.2 General design requirements. Post fire smoke exhaust systems are not intended or
designed as life safety systems and are not required to meet the provisions of Section 909. These
systems are permitted to use dedicated equipment, the normal building HVAC system or other
openings and shall have the capability to exhaust smoke from occupied spaces. Smoke removal
may be by either mechanical or natural ventilation, but shall be capable of removing cold smoke.
Smoke exhaust shall be permitted through elevator shafts. Smoke removed from a space must be
discharged to a safe location outside the building and may not be recirculated into the building in
accordance with the mechanical code.

913.3916.3 Exhaust capability. The system shall have an air supply and smoke exhaust
capability that will provide a minimum of three air changes per hour or remove smoke to less
than a 5 percent concentration within one hour of operation. The system need not exhaust from
all areas at the same time, but is permitted to be zoned based on the largest fire area served. For
the purpose of calculating system size, the height of a compartment shall be considered to run
from slab to slab and include the volume above suspended ceilings.

913.4916.4 Operation. The smoke exhaust system shall be operated by manual controls that are
readily accessible to the fire department at an approved location and shall incorporate an
approved control diagram. When a system is zoned into areas of operation less than the entire
building, each zone shall have an individual control. Fire department manual controls of post
fire smoke exhaust systems shall have the highest priority of any control point within the
building. Smoke exhaust shall not be permitted through any exit enclosure as defined in Section
1002. '

913.5916.5 Inspection and testing. Post fire smoke exhaust systems shall be inspected and
tested annually.

1305.1000 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

1305.1000 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]

.
" Af an avit acececs that-co anta a1Q
O3S XIt < CtOo Uit —CUTIT Tty Al tng

ja
q
«

e}
fany
[}

42



1305.1003 [Repealed, 31 SR 1165]

1305.1004 [Repealed, 31 SR 1165]

1305.1008 SECTION 1008, DOORS, GATES, AND TURNSTILES.
Subpart 1. Repealed, 31 SR 1165
Subp. 2. Repealed, 31 SR 1165
Subp. 3. Repealed, 31 SR 1165

Subp. 4. IBC Section 1008.1.3. IBC Section 1008.1.3 is amended by adding a subsection to
read as follows:

43



Subp. 5. IBC Section 1008:1:41008.1.5. IBC Section 1008-1-41008.1.5 is amended by
modifying exception 5 to read as follows:

Exceptions:

5. Exterior decks, patios, or balconies that are part of Type B dwelling units, have
impervious surfaces, and that are not more than two inches (50 mm) below the finished floor
level of the adjacent interior space of the dwelling unit.

Subp. 6. IBC Section 1008:1:8:31008.1.9.3. IBC Section 1668-1-8-31008.1.9.3 is amended
to read as follows:

1008.1.8:31008.1.9.3 Locks and latches. Locks and latches shall be permitted to prevent
operation of doors where any of the following exists:

1. Places of detention or restraint.
2. In buildings in occupancy Group A having an occupant load of 300 or less, in buildings
in occupancy Groups B, F, M, and S, and in churches, the main exterior door or doors are

permitted to be equipped with key operated locking devices from the egress side provided:

2.1.  The locking device is readily distinguishable as locked.

44



2.2. A readily visible durable sign is posted on the egress side on or adjacent to the door
stating: THIS DOOR TO REMAIN UNLOCKED WHEN BUILDING IS OCCUPIED. The
sign shall be in letters 1 inch (25 mm) high on a contrasting background.

2.3.  The use of the key operated locking device is revekeblerevocable by the building
official for due cause.

3. Where egress doors are used in pairs, approved automatic flush bolts shall be permitted to
be used, provided that the door leaf having the automatic flush bolts has no doorknob or surface
mounted hardware.

4. Doors from individual dwelling or sleeping units of Group R occupancies having an
occupant load of 10 or less are permitted to be equipped with a night latch, dead bolt, or security
chain, provided such devices are openable from the inside without the use of a key or tool.

5. Fire doors after the minimum elevated temperature has dlsabled the unlatching
mechanism in accordance with listed fire door test procedures.

56. Delayed egress locks, installed and maintained in conformance with Section
10068-1-8-61008.1.9.7.

67. Special egress—eontrol—devieeslocking arrangements installed and maintained in
conformance with Section $8681-3-61008.1.9.6.

78. In rooms, other than cells, where occupants are being restrained for safety or security
reasons, special loekingdetention arrangements which comply with the requirements of Section
1008-1.161008.1.11 are permitted.

Subp. 7. IBC Section 1008:1:8:61008.1.9.7. IBC Section +008:+-8-61008.1.9.7 is amended
to read as follows:

1008.1.8.61008.1.9.7 Delayed egress locks. Approved, listed, delayed egress locks shall be
permitted to be installed on doors serving any occupancy except Group A and H occupancies in
buildings that are equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with
Section 903.3.1.1 or an approved automatic smoke detection system installed in accordance with
Section 907, provided that the doors unlock in accordance with Items 1 through 6 below. A
building occupant shall not be required to pass through more than one door equipped with a
delayed egress lock before entering an exit.

1. The doors unlock upon actuation of the automatic sprinkler system or automatic fire
detection system.

2. The doors unlock upon loss of power controlling the lock or lock mechanism.

3. The door locks shall have the capability of being unlocked by a signal from the fire
command center.

45



4. The initiation of an irreversible process which will release the latch in not more than 15
seconds when a force of not more than 15 pounds (67 N) is applied for one second to the release
device. Initiation of the irreversible process shall activate an audible signal in the vicinity of the
door. Once the door lock has been released by the application of force to the releasing device,
relocking shall be by manual means only.

Exception: Where approved, a delay of not more than 30 seconds is permitted.

5. A sign shall be provided on the door located above and within 12 inches (305 mm) of the
release device reading: PUSH UNTIL ALARM SOUNDS. DOOR CAN BE OPENED IN 15
30 SECONDS.

6. Emergency lighting shall be provided at the door.

Subp. 7A IBC Section 1008.1.9.6 IBC Section 1008.1.9.6 is amended to read as follows:

1008.1.9.6 Special locking arrangements in Group I-1, I-2, R-3 or R-4. Approved special egress
locks shall be permitted in a Group I-1, I-2, R-3 or R-4 occupancy where the clinical needs of
persons receiving care require such locking. Special egress locks shall be permitted in such
occupancies where the building is equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler
system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 ex and an approved automatic smoke or heat
detection system installed in accordance with Section 907, provided that doors are installed and
operated in accordance with Items 1 through 7.

1. The doors unlock upon actuation of the automatic sprinkler system e and automatic fire

detection system.

7. The doors unlock upon loss of power controlling the lock or lock mechanism.

3 The door locks shall have the capability of being unlocked by a signal from the fire

command center, a nursing station or other approved location.

4. A building occupant shall not be required to pass through more than one door equipped

with a special egress lock before entering an exit.

5. The procedures for the operation(s) of the unlocking system shall be described and

approved as part of the emergency planning and preparedness required by Chapter 4 of the

International Fire Code.

6. All clinical staff shall have the keys, codes or other means necessary to operate the

locking devices.

7. Emergency lighting shall be eprevidedprovided at the door.

8. 24-hour patient supervision is provided within the secured area.

9. Locking devices are designed to fail in the open position.

10. TFloor levels within the building or portion of the building with special locking

arrangement shall be divided into at least two compartments by smoke barriers meeting the

requirements of Section 709.

Exception: Item 1 through 4 shall not apply to doors to areas where persons, which because

of clinical needs, require restraint or containment as part of the function of a

phyechiatriepsychiatric traetymenttreatment area.

Subp. 8. IBC Section 1008.1. IBC Section 1008.1 is amended by adding subsections as
follows:

46



1008.1.101008.1.11 Special loekingdetention arrangements. Special leekingdetention
arrangements meeting the requirements of Sections 1008-1101008.1.11  through
1008-1-16.51008.1.11.4 are permitted for rooms, other than cells, where the occupants are being
restrained for safety or security reasons. The use of Sections 1008-1101008.1.11 through
1008-1-10-51008.1.11.5 may be revoked by the fire code official or building official for due
cause.

1008.1.10.11008.1.11.1 Locking hardware. Locking devices shall release upon any of the
following conditions:

1. Activation of the automatic sprinkler system.

2. Activation of any automatic fire detection device.

3. Activation of any automatic fire alarm system.

4. Loss of electrical power to the locking device or the fire alarm system.

5. Activation of the fire alarm trouble signal.

6. Operation of a manual switch located in an approved location.
All locking devices shall be designed to fail in the open position following the release of the
locking devices for any of the conditions specified above. Relocking of the devices shall be by
manual means only at the door.
1008.1-10.21008.1.11.2 Fire extinguishing system. When special leekingdetention

arrangements are used, the room or area being secured shall be protected with quick response
sprinklers.

1008.1.10.31008.1.11.3 Fire alarm and detection. = When special leekingdetention
arrangements are used, the room or area and spaces between the room or area and an exterior exit
door shall be protected with automatic smoke detection connected to the building's fire alarm
system. If the walls of the room or area do not extend to the ceiling, automatic smoke detection
can be provided in the adjacent room or area, provided that there are no substantial obstructions
to delay activation of the smoke detection.

1008.1.10.51008.1.11.4 Location. The room or rooms shall be located on a floor that provides
direct grade level access when located in buildings or portions thereof consisting of nonrated
construction.

47



1305.1009 SECTION 1009, STAIRWAYS AND HANDRAILS.
| IBC Section 1009.9.1009.13 IBC Section $009:91009.13 is amended to read as follows:

| 1009.91009.13 Alternating tread devices. Alternating tread devices are limited to an element
of a means of egress in buildings of Groups F, H, and S from a mezzanine not more than 250
square feet (23 m?) in area and which serves not more than five occupants; in buildings of Group
I 3 from a guard tower, observation station, or control room not more than 250 square feet (23
m?) in area and for access to unoccupied roofs. Access to mechanical equipment or appliances
on a roof shall be in accordance with Section 1209.3.1 and the Minnesota Mechanical Code.

1305.1013 SECTION 1013, GUARDS.

| Subpart 1. IBC Section 1013.1.1013.2 IBC Section 1043-+1013.2 is amended by adding an
exception as follows:

Exception:

8. In accordance with the Minnesota Bleacher Safety Act, Minnesota Statutes, section
| 16B-616326B112, guards are not required on bleachers 55 inches or less in height.

Subp. 2. IBC Section 1043:2:1013.3 IBC Section 1643-21013.3 is amended by modifying
exception 24 to read as follows:

2. The guard height in assembly seating areas shall be in accordance with Section
1025.141028.14 and the Minnesota Bleacher Safety Act, Minnesota Statutes, section
16B.616:326B.112

Subp. 3. IBC Section 1013.8 Window sills, is amended to read as follows:
1013.8 Window sills. In Occupancy groups R-2 and R-3, one- and two- family and multiple-
family dwellings, where the opening of the sill portion of an operable window is located more
than 72 inches (1829 mm) above the finished grade or other surface below, thelowest-part-ofthe

elear o £ the windows hall he at o heioht not laca than 26 1xaches (015 mu ) abaove the
CICUL AL

nenino o Fay ol m
Oy O tob vy InmTuovy olitell UL d—-HEHEAT HOT 0t OO THUHVS 7 1 THITT ) AUU vV U re

: 3 he m—in—which-the-—w : ceated—O operable sections of
windows shall not permit openings that allow passage of a 4-inch-diameter (102 mm) sphere
where such openings are located within 36 24 inches (945 610 mm) of the finished floor.

Exceptions:

1. Operable windows where the sill portion of the opening is located more than 75 feet
(22.860 mm) above the finished grade or other surface below and that are provided with
window fall prevention devices that comply with ASTM F 2006.

7. Windows whose openings will not allow a 4-inch-diameter (102 mm) sphere to pass
through the opening when the window is in its largest opened position.

3. Openings that are provided with window fall prevention devices that comply with ASTM
F 2090.

4. Windows that are provided with window opening control devices that comply with
Section 1013.8.1.

| 1305.10141305.1017 SECTION 10141017, EXJFACCESSAISLES.

| 48



IBC Section 104441017 and all subsections are deleted in their entirety and replaced with
the following:

1014.41017.1 Aisles and aisle accessways. Aisles and aisle accessways serving as a portion of
the exit access in the means of egress system shall comply with the requirements of this section.
Aisles and aisle accessways shall be provided from all occupied portions of the exit access.
Aisles and aisle accessways serving assembly areas, other than seating at tables, shall comply
with Section 10251028. Aisles and aisle accessways serving reviewing stands, grandstands, and
bleachers shall comply with Section +6241028.

1014.4.11017.2 Width determination. Where tables or counters are served by fixed seats, the
width of the aisle or aisle accessway shall be measured from the back of the seat. Where seating
is located at a table or counter and is adjacent to an aisle or aisle accessway, the measurement of
required clear width of the aisle or aisle accessway shall be made to a line 19 inches (483 mm)
measured perpendicular to and away from and running parallel to the edge of the table or
counter. In the case of other side boundaries for aisle or aisle accessways, the clear width shall
be measured to walls, tread edges, or other obstructions.

The required width of the aisles and aisle accessways shall be unobstructed.

Exception: Doors, when fully opened, and handrails shall not reduce the required width by
more than 7 inches (178 mm). Doors in any position shall not reduce the required width by
more than one half. Other nonstructural projections such as trim and similar decorative
features are permitted to project into the required width 1.5 inches (38 mm) from each side.

1014.4-1.11017.2.1 Minimum aisle accessway width. Aisle accessways not required to be
accessible by Chapter 11 shall provide a minimum of 12 inches (305 mm) of width, plus 0.5
inches (12.7 mm) of width for each additional one foot (305 mm), or fraction thereof, beyond 12
feet (3658 mm) of aisle accessway length.

Exception: Portions of an aisle accessway having a length not exceeding six feet and used
by a total of not more than four persons.

1014.4.1.21017.2.2 Minimum aisle width. The minimum clear width shall be determined by
Section 1005.1 for the occupant load served, but shall not be less than 36 inches (914 mm).

Exception: Nonpublic aisles serving less than 50 people, and are not required to be
accessible by Chapter 11, need not exceed 28 inches (711 mm) in width.

1014:421017.3. Length.

1014.4:2:11017.3.1 Aisle accessway. The length of travel along the aisle accessway shall not
exceed 30 feet (9144 mm) to an aisle or exit access doorway.

1014.42.21017.3.2 Aisle. The length of travel along an aisle or combination aisle accessway
and aisle to a point where a person has a choice of two or more paths of egress travel to separate

49



exits or exit access doorways shall not exceed that permitted by Section 1014.3 for common path
of egress travel.

1305.1015 SECTION 1015, EXIT AND EXIT ACCESS DOORWAYS.
IBC Section 1015.1 is amended to read as follows:

1015.1 Exit or exit access doorways required_from spaces. Two exits or exit access doorways
from any space shall be provided where one of the following conditions exists:

1. The occupant load of the space exceeds the values in Table 1015.1.

Exception:

1. In Groups R--2 and R--3 occupancies, one means of egress is permitted within and
from individual dwelling units with a maximum occupant load of +620 where the
dwelling unit is equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2.

2. Care suites in Group I-2 occupancies complying with Section 407.4.3.

2. The common path of egress travel exceeds the limitations of Section 1014.3.
3. Where required by Sections 1015.3, 1015.4, and-1015.5, and 1015.6

4. When located in buildings used for educational purposes, laboratories and prep rooms
that exceed 500 square feet in area and contain hazardous materials.

. v

Where a building contains mixed occupancies, each individual occupancy shall comply with the
applicable requirements for that occupancy. Where applicable, cumulative occupant loads from
adjacent occupancies shall be considered in accordance with the previesiensprovisions of
Section 1004.1

Table 1015.1 is unchanged.

.
g c v
and have accoca tn the minimum-number af annraved 1 nendent evite ag ramired by Seots
ahgHRaveaceesSsSto eI unr o bvT o appl Uy LAl HGECPOHGTIT- Ut do IO va U (SAT VIS AVAS S
1015 1 Oeccunante_on-evers stopss in oaveru hacamant and 1n_evervbuldine chall he nravaded
T+ o ECHPATS - O O v Oy — otOr y 5 o v el PaSetReant U voryDuitding~oraliu proviaoa
wath _and ava aoonao 1 minimuma—niimber—of anproved indenendent_esxits go vamured-hu
WAH—ahRd-—ave—acceSs—to0—tnC T ut oot —oTap pro v Vs HGEEPeRAt— Ut asTUqUey—oy
Talhla 1010 1 ovecentag madified in-Sectian- 101090 Eor rnncec of thic chanter acernted
T84T U115 EXCOPTas o ITUToTo oL ez O tHE-PUrpostS-OTtHs-THa ety oToupIcta
racfechall be neovided wath aviteagg ramired for-stories Tha reauirednumber-o oviite fram-ans:
FOOI5-5hdHDeProvIGOU—yyIdT Tt ds T oI vH FOr-5t0 1851 e TCqun COaTov o oA e T oL ULy
. . . .
atorz hacamaent or indi nal anace chall he maintainad until aveiual ot orade-orthe-By 10 suayu
Sty BaSCCnt - o THOT v IO uaI- o pavu il o aiptadihe ottt rvorargaat o pauivvid
i

50



s? Tstery 29— —oeccupants

51



B*EM.S? 2 stories 30— —occupants

1305.1018 SECTION 1018 CORRIDORS
1305.1018.6, IBC Section 1018.6 Corridor Continuity, is amended to read as follows:

IBC Section 1018.6 Corridor continuity. Fire-resistance-rated corridors shall be continuous
from the point of entry to an exit, and shall not be interrupted by intervening rooms. When the
path of egress travel within a fire-resistance-rated corridor to the exit includes travel along
unenclosed exif access stairways or ramps, the fire resistance-rating shall be continuous for the
length of the stairway or ramp and for the length of the connecting corridor on the adjacent
floors leading to the exit.

Exceptions: 1. Foyers, lobbies or reception rooms constructed as required for corridors shall not
be construed as intervening rooms so long as the aggregate area of such spaces does not exceed
1000 sq.ft. per floor. ‘
2. Spaces constructed as required for corridors shall be permitted to be open to a corridor, only
where all the following criteria are met:

a. The spaces are not occupied as a dwelling units, sleeping units, incidental use or hazardous
uses. |

b. The open space and corridor is protected by an automatic smoke detection system that initiates
alarm notification devices in all normally occupied spaces that utilize the corridor for their means
of egress.

¢. The space is arranged so as not to obstruct access to the required exits.

d.* The space is not within a nonsprinklered group R occupancy.

1305.1022 SECTION 1022, INTERIOR EXIT STAIRWAYS AND RAMPS

1305.1022.5, IBC Section 1022.5 Penetrations, is amended to read as follows:
1022.5 Penetrations. Penetrations into and openings through interior exit stairways and ramps
are prohibited except for required exit doors, equipment and ductwork necessary for independent

ventilation or pressurization, sprinkler piping, standpipes, electrical raceway for fire department

52



communications systems and electrical raceway serving the interior exit stairway or ramp and
terminating at a steel box not exceeding 16 square inches (0.010m2). Such penetrations shall be
protected in accordance with Section 714. There shall be no penetrations or communicating
openings, whether protected or not, between adjacent interior exit stairways and ramps.

1305.1023 SECTION 1023 EXIT PASSAGEWAYS

1305.1023.6, IBC Section 1023.6 Penetrations, is amended to read as follows:

1023.6 Penetrations.

Penetrations into and openings through an exif passageway are prohibited except for required
exit doors, equipment and ductwork necessary for independent pressurization, sprinkler piping,
standpipes, electrical raceway for fire department communication and electrical raceway serving
the exit passageway and terminating at a steel box not exceeding 16 square inches (0.010m2).
Such penetrations shall be protected in accordance with Section 714. There shall be no
penetrations or communicating openings, whether protected or not, between adjacent exif

passageways.

.
Eyveontions Meomberane nenetrationscha
EXCOP TN, TvIvToTwii P oI IV e TTUIOTLY I
a a a
; -

o antcide of the-ax
HEC-0utorC oI tiaC CAT

1305.10251305.1028 SECTION 10251028, ASSEMBLY.

IBC Section 1025.1.3:1028.1.1. IBC Section 1025.1-11028.1.1 is amended to read as
follows: ,

1025.1.11028.1.1 Bleachers, grandstands, and folding and telescopic seating shall comply with
International Code Council (ICC) 300, with the following amendments to ICC 300:

a. ICC 300 Section 404.5 is amended by adding an exception as follows:

Exception: Aisles shall not be required to be more than 66 inches (1.676 mm) in width
when the following are satisfied:

1. the seating area served by such aisles is composed entirely of bleachers;
2. the row to row dimension is 28 inches (71 cm) or less; and
3. front egress is not limited.

b. ICC 300 Section 405.1 is amended to read as follows:

53



Section 405.1 Aisles. The minimum width of aisles shall be in accordance with Section 404.5,
but not less than that required by this section. An aisle is not required in seating facilities where
all of the following conditions exist:

1. Seats are without backrest.
2. The rise from row to row does not exceed 6 inches (152 mm) per row.

Exception: Bleachers 55 inches or less in height.

3. The row to row spacing does not exceed 28 inches (711 mm) unless the seat boards and
| footboards are netat the same elevation.

4. The number of rows does not exceed 16 rows in height.

5. The first seat board is not more than 12 inches (305 mm) above the ground floor or a
cross aisle.

Exception: Bleachers 55 inches or less in height.
6. Seat boards have a continuous flat surface.
7. Seat boards provide a walking surface with a minimum width of 11 inches (279 mm).
8. Egress from seating is not restricted by rails, guards, or other obstructions.
c. ICC 300 Section 405.6 is amended by adding an exception as follows:
3. Aisles serving bleachers in compliance with Section 404.5.
| d. ICC 300 Section 408.1, item 1 is amended by adding an second exception as follows:
(First exception is numbered as 1.)
2. In accordance with the Minnesota Bleacher Safety Act, Minnesota Statutes, section
|  16B:616326B.112:
(a) bleachers must have vertical perimeter guards or other approved guards that address
climbability and are designed to prevent accidents; and
(b) guards are not required on bleachers 55 inches (1397 mm) and less in height.
e. ICC 300 Section 408.3 is amended to read as follows:
408.3 Guard design. Guards and their attachment shall be designed to resist the loads indicated
in Section 303. Bleachers must have vertical perimeter guards or other approved guards that
address climbability and are designed to prevent accidents, in accordance with the Minnesota

| Bleacher Safety Act, Minnesota Statutes, section +6B-616326B.112.

f. ICC 300 Chapter 5 is deleted and replaced with the following:

| 54



inches (1397 mm) above grade or the floor

All bleachers or bleacher open spaces over 55

1 is over 30 inches (762 mm) above

ai

Is, if any part of the guardr

al

below, and all bleacher guardr

m

.

ntained

ified to conform with the safety requirements co

grade or the floor below, must be cert
| Minnesota Statutes, section 16B-6+6326B.112.

+ :
[l . M
BT 9
o »
bmd el
G
o] ~H
<2} t
B ¢
o\ o]
=
— ®
& 4o P
] &
i o7}
)] H
228
wm 3
& E+
o= L
® R &
D
_..Mu el¥]
D jant
== -
L2 3
(o]
2] o)
wn
23 mw
32
B5 8
i
J g E
g Mw..
2 5
B ¥
th «a
5 )
H o+
3
TE 2
Trw 3
2E 5
48] @
D &
%7
. b ol
5.2
[v] e
D 2
ms X
N D
)]
-
D &
o [40)
¢ 8 g
[«
3 B2
&
£ o8

nraac_aof the
(78]

aroay—Ur

.
11O

d

in—0

ad
oI auyuTitnirs

V=Y L= Va kAL E L

TOOHoUtr ot oy uv

na oo bt chall not-b
TOGUTE

CUPIITE
na achall anen-d

. .
mn-—each cleeni
T oauitT T

d

oot

A _roaalie

UT

chall b
DITTATT

Ao oourt

Arta a vard or-couet
Cy; O1today

Anhlicalleyw
pooaeTalr

10 YRIAXT
TICyva ys

1

1nta-a nuh
O—apuo

1ractlyy

OpUITUIT OUt y— 1w

1 Tgonarr

Suech anen
D UTIOpTat

hacement
jsjenimissawisay

1MoQ eaqnpned
Ctrppet
0N 3 1 1 o

.

thld
UHILUILIBU
th SQant

1012
TU T TZy

i¥atal

Qants

.
1n

pracvaoToTIr [SAATAn VS

tag aaq annlicable

Up—IeTo goodpdiroros—do T Up

than Groumn-R-2 acenpane
Tt 1o

Tn_othet
TH—OTCrT

thranch

1
T

OO LT Ut

1O

1
T OCOUtIOIT

TOOIrIvU vyl

I
11 acrcardance sz
IOy y et aoto

1nl-lar cuatam

I
1SR

TO VOO noronattv oI

th_an_annraved-automat

OOy aps

ot sz

IroUsTT

1ded

PEaYadhda¥ataa¥ellkatlath Vi
proviac

SICC P E " TOUITTS

adeen

T otnOraarOroup— i oUTTOpantIto s appricaurvir D CCTIOITT 1T U T %y

th q

VwWIli o

I other than Groun-R-—3 AoouBANnCles A annlicable in Saction 1012

2
v

ta
OS5It

R alifatatalatall

1ta

.
1o acecace t0 Buro—temote—ex
nee—rated—Ccorriaoaviig tlCCos—toOTyWwoTTI UL UAo =4t Opp

sotonce_rated corridon haoxs

fiya vag

dnor—to—a
OO

ho ¥l

TOUOTI T

LA A v a5 9

& o
wm
L3
£ 2
.
E g
]
N
ol
3 &
L &
B
S &
i3
p——
o
w0
&=
® @
&
O T
QD
D
F
O =
+ O
H
B
¢ T
T <
B D
& F
=t
O &
I
Rl
D
80 of
R
o P
D
joR Mu
o
® &
[0} mu
] =
o ¥
Ul evH
o B
Hop
o &
g @
b
ﬂ =)
il
D B
wn
D 2
o &
& B
o
g0 ¥
o ®
D D
o QD
g &
? &
» T
£ £
B -
.
.
oh B

to_an_osit

4 oo a0 meane of ecrecs that 1c not_onen—to-the

.
nit ar cleen
T O1—51C0p

and the dwell

G HICaUT U gTtssvulat— o UL vpoitoTiIv

TS Ut IS

CRaVadihhhal

INO—13

anog e Oy LI s o

T A waiaTd

xraprd
jul\—‘,

(21

o a nuihlie wav _ _or to-g
dPaonCywdy; Orto

1

1raetlss

.
1 accecce doorthat-obens d
F-EXIHaCeOHHHOOITHAT O pPUIs Ui Tor y— Ity

. .
1inh have an evit door-or-ex
Ve €t Gour—o

T
VY IIITTIT T

%

X

1305.1101 SECTION 1101, GENERAL.

.

IBC Section 1101.1 is amended to read as follows

55



1101.1 General. Buildings or portions of buildings shall be accessible to persons with
disabilities as required by Minnesota Rules, chapter 1341. Refer to Minnesota Rules, chapter
1341, the Minnesota Accessibility Code, for the complete application of IBC Chapter 11.
1305.1200 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

1305.1202 [Repealed, 31 SR 1165]

1305.1203 SECTION 1203, VENTILATION.

IBC Section 1203.1 is amended to read as follows:

1203.1 General. Buildings shall be provided with natural ventilation in accordance with Section
1203.4 or mechanical ventilation in accordance with Minnesota Rules, chapter 1346.

Exceptions:

1. Buildings or portions thereof that are not intended for normal human occupancy, or
where the primary purpose is not associated with human comfort.

2. Group U occupancies.

Where the air infiltration rate in a dwelling unit is less than 5 air changes per hour when
tested with a blower door at a pressure 0.2 inch w.c. (50 Pa) in accordance with Section
402.4.1.2 of the International Energy Conservation Code, the dwelling unit shall be ventilated by
mechanical means in accordance with Minnesota Rules, chapter 1346.

1305.1204 [Repealed, 31 SR 1165]
1305.1207 [Repealed, 31 SR 1165]
1305.1209 SECTION 1209, ACCESS TO UNOCCUPIED SPACES.
IBC Section 1209.3 is amended, and subsections added, to read as follows:
1209.3 Mechanical equipment and appliance access. Access to mechanical equipment and
appliances installed in underfloor areas, in attic spaces, and on roofs or elevated structures shall
be in accordance with this section and the Minnesota Mechanical Code.
1209.3.1 Mechanical equipment and appliances on roofs or elevated structures. Where
mechanical equipment or appliances requiring periodic inspection, service, or maintenance are
installed on roofs or elevated structures, a permanent stair shall be provided for access.
Exception: A portable ladder may be used for dwellings, replacement equipment on existing
buildings, and exterior roof access points not exceeding 16 feet (4.9 m) above grade, unless

the building official determines that the unique shape of the roof does not allow safe access
with a portable ladder.

56



The permanent stair shall be as required by relevant safety regulations, but shall not be less
than the following:

1. The stair shall be installed at an angle of not more than 60 degrees measured from the
horizontal plane.

2. The stair shall have flat treads at least six inches (152 mm) deep and a clear width of at
least 18 inches (457 mm) with equally spaced risers at least 10.5 inches (267 mm) high and not
exceeding 14 inches (356 mm).

3. The stair shall have intermediate landings not exceeding 18 feet (5.5 m) vertically.
4. Continuous handrails shall be installed on both sides of the stair.

5 TInterior stairs shall terminate at the undersideunderside of the roof at a hatch or scuttle of
at least eight square feet (0.74m2) with a minimum dimension of 20 inches (508 mm).

6. When a roof access hatch or scuttle is located within ten feet (3.0 m) of a roof edge, a
guard shall be installed in accordance with this code.

7. Exterior stairs shall terminate at the roof access point or at a level landing of at least eight
square feet (O.74m2) with a minimum dimension of 20 inches (508 mm). The landing shall have
a guard installed in accordance with IMC Section 304.9.

1209.3.1.1 Permanent ladders. Where a change in roof elevation greater than 30 inches (762
mm) but not exceeding 16 feet (4.9 m) exists, a permanent ladder shall be provided. The ladder

may be vertical and shall be as required by relevant safety regulations, but shall not be less than
the following: :

1. Width shall be at least 16 inches (406 mm).

2. Rung spacing shall be a maximum of 14 inches (356 mm).

3. Toe space shall be at least six inches (152 mm).

4. Side railings shall extend at least 30 inches (762 mm) above the roof or parapet wall.
1305.1210 SECTION 1210, SURROUNDING MATERIALS.

IBC Section 1210.1 is amended to read as follows:
1210.1- Floors:1210.2.1 Floors and wall bases. In other than dwelling units, toilet, bathing and
shower—and-bathing room floors_finish material shall have a smooth, hard, nonabsorbent
surface, such as portland cement, concrete, ceramic tile, sheet vinyl, or other approved floor

covering material, The intersections of such floors with walls shall have a smooth hard
nonabsorbent vertical base that extends upward onto the walls at least 54 inches (127 mm).

1305.1300 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

57



1305.1350 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.1355 [Repealed, 11 SR 1405]
1305.1370 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.1400 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

1305.1403 PERFORMANCE REQUIREMENTS.

1305.1403.5. Section 1403.5 Vertical and Lateral Flame Propagation, is deleted entirely.

1305.1404 [Repealed, 31 SR 1165]
1305.1405 SECTION 1405, INSTALLATION OF WALL COVERINGS.

| Subpart 1. Section 1405:3:21405.4.2. IBC Section $405:3-21405.4.2 is amended to read as
follows:

| 1405.3.21405.4.2 Masonry. Flashing and weepholes in anchored veneer shall be located above
finished ground level above the foundation wall or slab, and other points of support, including
structural floors, shelf angles and lintels where anchored veneers are designed in accordance with
| Section 1405-5. 1405.4.6

Subp. 2. Repealed, 31 SR 1165

1305.1500 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

1305.1503 SECTION 1503, WEATHER PROTECTION.

Subpart 1. IBC Section 1503.4. IBC Section 1503.4 is amended to read as follows:

58



1503.4 Roof drainage. Design and installation of roof drainage systems shall comply with
Minnesota Rules, chapter 4715, Minnesota Plumbing Code, and the following provisions:

1. Where required. All roofs shall drain into a separate storm sewer system or to an approved
place of disposal. For one and two family dwellings, and where approved, storm water is
permitted to discharge onto flat areas, such as streets or lawns, provided that the storm water
flows away from the building.

2. Roof design. Roofs shall be designed for the maximum possible depth of water that will
pond thereon as determined by the relative levels of roof deck and overflow weirs, scuppers,
edges, or serviceable drains in combination with the deflected structural elements. In
determining the maximum possible depth of water, all primary roof drainage means shall be
assumed to be blocked.

3. Secondary drainage required. Secondary (emergency) roof drains or scuppers shall be
provided where the roof perimeter construction extends above the roof in such a manner that
water will be entrapped if the primary drains allow buildup for any reason.

4. Separate systems required. Secondary (emergency) roof drain systems shall have piping
and point of discharge separate from the primary system. Discharge shall be above grade in a
location which would normally be observed by the building occupants or maintenance personnel.

5. Sizing of secondary drains. Secondary (emergency) roof drain systems shall be sized in
accordance with the Minnesota State Plumbing Code. Scuppers shall be sized to prevent the
depth of ponding water from exceeding that for which the roof was designed as determined by
this code. Scuppers shall not have an opening dimension of less than 4 inches (102 mm). The
flow through the primary system shall not be considered when sizing the secondary roof drainage
system.

Subp. 2. IBC Section 1503.4.1. IBC Section 1503.4.1 is deleted in its entirety.

1305.1506 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]

1305.1507 SECTION 1507, REQUIREMENTS FOR ROOF COVERINGS.
Subpart 1. Repealed, 31 SR 1165
Subp. 2. Repealed, 31 SR 1165
Subp. 3 Repealed, 31 SR 1165
Subp. 4. Repealed, 31 SR 1165

Subp. 5. Section 1507.10.1. IBC Section 1507.10.1 is amended to read as follows:

59



1507.10.1 Slope. Unless designed for water accumulation in accordance with Section 1611.2,
built-up roofs shall have a design slope of a minimum of one-fourth unit vertical in 12 units
horizontal (2-percent slope) for drainage, except for coal-tar built-up roofs that shall have a
design slope of a minimum one-eighth unit vertical in 12 units horizontal (1-percent slope).

Subp. 6. Section 1507.11.1. IBC Section 1507.11.1 is amended to read as follows:

1507.11.1 Slope. Unless designed for water accumulation in accordance with Section 1611.2,
modified bitumen membrane roofs shall have a design slope of a minimum of one-fourth unit
vertical in 12 units horizontal (2-percent slope) for drainage.

Subp. 7. Section 1507.12.1. IBC Section 1507.12.1 is amended to read as follows:

1507.12.1 Slope. Unless designed for water accumulation in accordance with Section 1611.2,
thermoset single-ply membrane roofs shall have a design slope of a minimum of one-fourth unit
vertical in 12 units horizontal (2-percent slope) for drainage.

Subp. 8. Section 1507.13.1. IBC Section 1507.13.1 is amended to read as follows:

1507.13.1 Slope. Unless designed for water accumulation in accordance with Section 1611.2,
thermoplastic single-ply membrane roofs shall have a design slope of a minimum of one-fourth
unit vertical in 12 units horizontal (2-percent slope) for drainage.

Subp. 9. Section 1507.14.1. IBC Section 1507.14.1 is amended to read as follows:

1507.14.1 Slope. Unless designed for water accumulation in accordance with Section 1611.2,
sprayed polyurethane foam roofs shall have a design slope of a minimum of one-fourth unit
vertical in 12 units horizontal (2-percent slope) for drainage.

Subp. 10. Section 1507.15.1. IBC Section 1507.15.1 is amended to read as follows:

1507.15.1 Slope. Unless designed for water accumulation in accordance with Section 1611.2,
liquid-applied roofs shall have a design slope of a minimum of one-fourth unit vertical in 12
units horizontal (2-percent slope).

1305.1509 SECTION 1509, ROOFTOP STRUCTURES.

IBC Section 1509:21509.2.3 is amended to read as follows:

; 1509.2.3 Use limitations. A-penthouse-or-otherprojection-above-theroofin

Penthouse;—bu —or—any—other—simila ection—above—the
purposes other than shelter of mechanical or electrical equipment, tanks, or shelter-of-vertical
shaft openings in the roof assembly.

60



Exception: Accessory uses necessary for the maintenance of building systems shall be
permitted when the penthouse is sprinkled in accordance with section 903.1.1.

1305.1510 SECTION 1510, REROOFING.

IBC Section 1510.5 is amended to read as follows:
1510.5 Reinstallation of materials. Existing slate, clay or cement tile shall be permitted for
reinstallation, except that damaged, cracked or broken slate or tile shall not be reinstalled.
Existing vent flashing, metal edging, drain outlets, collars and metal counterflashings shall not be
reinstalled where rusted, damaged or deteriorated. Aggregate surfacing materials shall not be
reinstalled unless such aggregate complies with the gradation requirements of ASTM C-33
Standard Specification for Concrete Aggregate.
1305.1590 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.1600 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.1604 [Repealed, 31 SR1165]
1305.1607 SECTION 1607, LIVE LOADS.

Subpart 1. Repealed, 31 SR 1165

Subp. 2. Section 1607.1312.2. IBC Section 1607.134+2.2 is amended to read as follows:
1607.1312.2 Vertical impact force. The maximum wheel loads of the crane shall be increased
by the percentages shown below to determine the induced vertical impact or vibration force.
Impact load shall be applied to one hoist system at a time for multiple hoist or bridge systems.

Monorails, underhung bridge cranes and pendant operated top running bridge cranes:

15 percent minimum for hoist lift speeds of less than 30 feet per minute.

Percentage equivalent to 0.5 times the hoist lift speed, for lift speeds of 30 to 100 feet per
minute.

50 percent maximum for hoist lift speeds greater than 100 feet per minute.

50 percent for magnetic pickup or vacuum lift type systems.

61



No impact load is required for hand chain (non-powered) hoists.

Cab operated or remotely operated top running bridge cranes:

25 percent minimum.

Subp. 3. Section 1607.1312.3. IBC Section 1607.1342.3 is amended to read as follows:
1607.1312.3 Lateral force.

Top running powered bridge cranes. The lateral force on top running crane runway beams
with powered trolleys shall be calculated as 20 percent of the sum of the rated capacity of the
crane and the weight of the hoist and trolley. The lateral force shall be assumed to act
horizontally at the traction surface of a runway beam, in either direction perpendicular to the
beam, and shall be distributed according to the lateral stiffness of the runway beam and
supporting structure. The runway beams shall be designed for the lateral and torsional loads, as
well as for the maximum lateral deflection limit of Span/800.

Monorails and underhung bridge cranes.

The bridge girder, underhung bridge crane runway beam and monorails shall be designed
with sufficient strength and rigidity to prevent detrimental lateral deflection.

The lateral deflection should not exceed span/800 based on 5 percent of maximum wheel
load(s) without vertical impact factor.

1305.1608 SECTION 1608, SNOW LOADS.
Subpart 1. Section 1608.2. IBC Section 1608.2 is amended to read as follows:

1608.2 Ground snow loads. The ground snow loads to be used in determining the design snow
loads for buildings and other structures are given in Minnesota Rules, chapter 1303.

Subp. 2. Figure 1608.2. IBC Figure 1608.2 on GROUND SNOW LOADS, pg, FOR THE
UNITED STATES (PSF) is deleted.

Subp. 3. Repealed, 31 SR 1165
1305.1614 [Renumbered 1305.1616]
1305.1616 [Renumbered 1305.1618]
1305.1616 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.1618 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]

1305.1623 [Renumbered 1305.1625]

62



1305.1625 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.1700 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

1305.1701 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]

1305.1702 [Repealed, |SECTION1702, DEFINITIONS:

1305.17051704 SECTION 17054764, REQUIRED  VERIFICATION __AND
INSPECTIONSPECIALINSPECFIONS.

Subpart 1. Repealed, 31 SR 1165
Subp. 2. Table 1705.34:4. IBC Table 1705.34-4 is amended as follows:

A. Add "X to the "Periodic" column, row "76. Inspection of concrete and shotcrete
placement for proper application techniques."

B. Add footnote "cb." to read as follows:

cb. Exception: Periodic verification and inspection is permitted, upon approval of Inspeetion

can-beperiodic-when-acceptable-te the structural engineer of record and the building official.
Subp. 3. Repealed, 31 SR 1165

Subp. 4. Section 1705.4 Masonry construction. Add the following sentence to the end of

the section:

“Periodic verification and inspection of grout placement is permitted, upon approval of the
structural engineer of record and the building official.”

63



1305.1750 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

1305.1775 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

1305.1790 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]

1305.1795 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

1305.1800 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

1305.1805 SECTION 1805, FOOTINGS AND FOUNDATIONS.
Subpart 1. Repealed, 31 SR 1165
Subp. 2. Repealed, 31 SR 1165

Subp. 3. Repealed, 31 SR 1165

| Subp. 4. IBC Section 1805.2. [Repealed, |-IBC-Section1805-2—is—amendedto—read-as
follows:

| Subp. 5. IBC Section 1809.5:2-+. IBC Section 1809.5-2} is amended to read as follows:

| 1809.5.2-1 Frost protection. Except where otherwise protected from frost, foundations walls;
piers, and other permanent supports of buildings and structures shall be protected from frost by
one or more of the following methods:

| 1. Extending below the frost line specified The-minimum-allowablefooting-depth-shall-be
in aceordance-with Minnesota Rules, part 1303.1600;

2. Constructing in accordance with ASCE 32; or
3. Erecting on solid rock.

Exception: Freestanding buildings meeting al-of the following conditions shall not be
required to be protected:

] 1. Constructing in accordance with chapter 1303.Classified—in—Oeeupaney—Category1in

accordance-with-Section1604-5;




l Shallow foundations Eeetings shall not bear on frozen soil.-untess-such-frozen-condition-is-of
a-permanent-character:

1305.1806 [Repealed, 31 SR 1165]

1305.1807 SECTION 1807, DAMPPROOFING AND WATERPROOFING.

IBC Section 1807.4.3 is amended to read as follows:
1807.4.3 Drain discharge. The floor base and foundation perimeter drain shall discharge by
gravity or mechanical means into a trapped area drain, sump, dry well, or other approved
location above the ground.

1305.1900 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

| 1305.1907 [Repealed, |SECTIONI907, DETAILS-OF REINFORCEMENT:

1305.1918 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]

1305.1928 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.2000 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.2050 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.2100 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]
| 1305.2109 [Repealed, |SECTION2109; EMPIRICAL-DESIGN-OF-MASONRY-

FABEE2109:4-1
WALLLATERAL-SUPPORT REQUIREMENTS

65



Length———te
Thickness—or—Wall
Height———te
Thickness
Bearing-walls
Solid_uni all
grouted 20
All-others 18
Nonbearing-walls
Exterior 18
Interior 28

1305.2200 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.2300 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.2304 [Repealed, 31 SR 1165]
1305.2308 SECTION 2308, CONVENTIONAL LIGHT FRAME CONSTRUCTION.

Subpart 1. IBC Figure 2308.9.3. The table to IBC Figure 2308.9.3, Basic Components of
the Lateral Bracing System, is amended to read as follows:

Wind Speed Maximum  Required
Wall Spacing Bracketing

(Feet) Lengthb
90 mph 35°0” Table
2308.9.3.(1)
and  Section
2308.9.3

(IBC Figure 2308.9.3 is changed to reflect amendments in table.)

Subp. 2. IBC Table 2308.9.3(1). IBC Table 2308.9.3(1), Braced Wall Panels, is amended to
read as follows:

TABLE 2308.9.3(1)
BRACED WALL PANELSa
Wind Condition Construction Methods®™® Braced Panel Location
Speed 1 23 456 78 and Length®

66



One story, top of twoorthree X X X X X X X X

stor )
y Located in accordance

with section 2308.9.3
and not more than 25
feet on center

| 90 mph First story oef two story orX X X X X X X X
second story of three story

First story of three story X XX XX XX
For SI: 1inch=25.4 mm, 1 foot=304.8 mm

“This table specifies minimum requirements for braced panels that form interior or exterior
braced wall lines.

bSee Section 2308.9.3 for full description.

°See Sections 2308.9.3.1 and 2308.9.3.2 for alternative braced panel requirements,
Building length is the dimension parallel to the braced wall length.

*Gypsum wallboard applied to framing supports that are spaced at 16 inches on center.
1305.2320 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]

1305.2326 [Renumbered 1305.2320]

1305.2400 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]

1305.2500 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

1305.2510 SECTION 2510 LATHING AND FURRING FOR CEMENT PLASTER
(STUCCO)

IBC Section 2510.6 is amended as follows:

2510.6 Water-resistive barriers. Water-resistive barriers shall be installed as required in
Section 1404.2 and, where applied over wood-based sheathing, shall include a water resistive
vapor-permeable barrier with a performance at least equivalent to two layers of Grade D paper.

Exception: where the water-resistive barrier that is applied over wood-based sheathing has a

water resistance equal or greater than that of 60-minute Grade D paper and is separated from the
stucco by an intervening, substantially nonwater-absorbing layer or drainage space.

1305.2600 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

1305.2603 SECTION 2603 FOAM PLASTIC INSULATION.

[ 67



IBC Section 2603.4.1.13 is amended to read as follows:

2603.4.1.13 Type V construction. Foam plastic spray applied to a sill plate and header of Type
V construction is subject to all of the following:

1. The maximum thickness of the foam plastic shall be 5 1/2 inches (82.6 mm).

2. The foam plastic shall have a flame spread index of 25 or less and an accompanying
smoke developed index of 450 or less when tested in accordance with ASTM E84.

1305.2700 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.2702 SECTION 2702, EMERGENCY AND STANDBY POWER SYSTEMS.
IBC Section 2702.1 is amended to read as follows:

2702.1 Installation. Emergency and standby power systems shall be installed in accordance
with Minnesota Rules, chapter 1315.

1305.2800 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.2900 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.2902 SECTION 2902, MINIMUM PLUMBING FACILITIES.
Subpart 1. Section 2902.1. IBC Section 2902.1 is amended to read as follows:

2902.1 Minimum number of fixtures. Plumbing fixtures shall be provided for the type of
occupancy and in the minimum number shown in Table 2902.1. Types of occupancies not
shown in Table 2902.1 shall be considered individually by the building official. The number of
occupants shall be determined by this code. Occupancy classification shall be determined in
accordance with Chapter 3. ‘

Exception: When approved by the building official, buildings or structures that are normally
unoccupied, such as picnic shelters, amphitheaters, small transit stop stations, cold storage
buildings, utility sheds, warming houses, kiosks, concession stands and similar structures,
need not be provided with restroom facilities.

| Subp. la. Section 2902:1:12902.1.2. IBC Section 2902-+42902.1.2 is amended to read as
follows: :

2902.1.32902.1.2 Unisex—teilet-andFamily or assitedassisted-use toilet and bath fixtures.

Fixtures located within unisexfamily or assitedassisted-use toilet_and bathing rooms complying

with Minnesota Rules, chapter 1341, are permitted to be included in determining the minimum
| required number of fixtures for either the male or female occupants.

Subp. 2. Table 2902.1.



A. The body of IBC Table 2902.1 is amended as follows:

1. Add footnote "eh" to the A 5 Use Group "Stadiums, amusement parks, bleachers, and
grandstands for outdoor sporting events and activities" description of the table.

2. Add footnotes "£," "gi," and "hj" to the "Drinking Fountains" heading in the table.
3. Add footnote "ik" to the "Water Closets" heading in the table.

B. The footnotes to IBC Table 2902.1 are amended, and footnotes added, to read as
follows:

a. The fixtures shown are based on one fixture being the minimum required for the number
of persons indicated or any fraction of the number of persons indicated. The number of
occupants shall be determined by this code.

b. Toilet facilities for employees shall be separate from facilities for inmates or patieatscare
recipients.

c. A single occupant toilet room with one water closet and one lavatory serving not more
than two adjacent patient rooms shall be permitted where such room is provided with direct
access from each patient room and with provisions for privacy.

d. The occupant load for seasonal outdoor seating and entertainment areas shall be included
when determining the minimum number of facilities required.

eh. Permanent facilities located either on site or available in an adjacent building or portable
temporary facilities available on site during times when the stadium or grandstand is in use may
be used.

f. A drinking fountain shall not be required for in-buildings-er—tenant-spaces-having-an

occupant load less than 50.
gi. Where water is served in restaurants, drinking fountains shall not be required.

hi. Water or other beverages available through free or fee based serving or dispensers may
be substituted for up to 50 percent of the required number of drinking fountains.

ik. In each bathroom or toilet room, urinals shall not be substituted for more than 67 percent
of the required water closets.

Subp. 3. Section 2902.2. IBC Section 2902.2 is amended to read as follows:

2902.2 Separate facilities. Where plumbing fixtures are required, separate facilities shall be
provided for each sex.

Exceptions:

69



1. Separate facilities shall not be required for dwelling units and sleeping units.

2. Separate facilities shall not be required in structures or tenant spaces with a total occupant
load, including both employees and customers, of 15 or less.

3. Separate facilities shall not be required in mercantile occupancies in which the maximum
occupant load is 56100 or less.

4, Separate facilities shall not be required in Group B occupancies not exceeding 2,000
gross square feet (185.8 m?) of floor area. When using this exception, the individual unisex
restroomfamily or assisted-use toilet facility shall have not less than one watercloset, one
urinal, and one lavatory.

Subp. 4. Section 2902, IBC Section 2902 is amended by adding a subsection to read as
follows:

2902.6 Controlled access to required facilities. Sanitation facilities required by this chapter
may have controlled access, but in all cases shall be maintained available for utilization by those
employees, customers, or patrons used to calculate the minimum required facilities.
1305.3000 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]
1305.3001 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.3030 CHAPTER 30, ELEVATORS AND CONVEYING SYSTEMS.
IBC Chapter 30 is deleted and replaced with the following:
CHAPTER 30
ELEVATORS AND CONVEYING SYSTEMS
The design, construction, installation, operation, alteration, and repair of elevators and related
devices shall be in accordance with Minnesota Rules, chapter 1307. Refer to Minnesota Rules,
chapter 1307, the Minnesota Elevator Code, for the complete application of IBC Chapter 30.
1305.3100 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]
1305.3109 SECTION 3109, SWIMMING POOL ENCLOSURES.

IBC Section 3109 Swimming Pool Enclosures and Safety Devices is deleted in its entirety.

1305.3112 SECTION 3112, WINDOW CLEANING BUILDING ANCHORS

IBC Chapter 31 is amended by adding a new section as follows:

3112 WINDOW CLEANING BUILDING ANCHORS

70



3112.1 General. Building anchors for window cleaning safety shall be provided for buildings
four or more stories above grade plane. Building anchors for window cleaning safety shall be
designed, installed and located in accordance with the design criteria of ASI/IWCA 1-14.1-2001.

Exceptions:
1. Buildings without windows.

2. Existing buildings undergoing reconstruction, alteration or repair that does not
include the exposure of primary structural roof components.

The commissioner of the Minnesota Department of Labor and Industry may waive all or a
portion of the requirements for existing buildings if the installation of the dedicated anchorages
would not result in significant safety improvements due to limits on the size of the project, or
other factors as determined by the commissioner.

1305.3200 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]
1305.3300 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]
1305.3302 SECTION 3302, CONSTRUCTION SAFEGUARDS.

IBC Section 3302 is amended by adding a subsection to read as follows:
3302.33302.4 Construction barriers. Where construction, remodeling, or demolition is taking
place involving the use of cutting and welding, temporary heating with open flames, or
flammable liquid fueled equipment, such areas shall be separated from occupied areas of a
building by materials that will resist the spread of fire and smoke as specified for draftstopping
materials in Section 473-1718.3.1.
1305.3305 SECTION 3305, SANITARY.

IBC Section 3305 is deleted.
1305.3400 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.3401 CHAPTER 34, EXISTING STRUCTURES.

IBC Chapter 34 is deleted and replaced with the following:

CHAPTER 34
EXISTING STRUCTURES

The standards for a change of occupancy, alteration, and repair of existing buildings and
structures with historical significance, shall be in accordance with Minnesota Rules, chapter

1311. Refer to Minnesota Rules, chapter 1311, the Minnesota Building Conservation Code, for
the complete application of provisions for existing structures.

71



1305.3500 CHAPTER 35, REFERENCED STANDARDS.
IBC Chapter 35 is amended by modifying a referenced standard as follows:

NFPA 45 20042011 Standard on Fire Protection for Laboratories Using Chemicals

1305.3600 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]
1305.3700 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]
1305.3800 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.3850 [Repealed, 11 SR 1405]
1305.3860 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.3900 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.3970 [Repealed, 11 SR 1405]
1305.4000 [Repealed by amendment, 9 SR 1557]
1305.4100 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.4200 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]
1305.4300 [Repealed, 11 SR 1405]
1305.4313 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.4332 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.4415 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.4416 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.4429 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.4500 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]
1305.4600 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

1305.4700 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

72



1305.4800 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.4850 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.4900 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]

1305.5000 [Repealed, 11 SR 1405]

1305.5100 [Repealed, 11 SR 1405; 19 SR 1340]

1305.5101 [Renumbered 1307.0010]
1305.5102 [Renumbered 1307.0015]
1305.5103 [Renum‘bered 1307.0020]
1305.5104 [Renumbered 1307.0025]
1305.5105 [Renumbered 1307.0030]
1305.5106 [Renumbered 1307.0035]
1305.5107 [Renumbered 1307.0040]
1305.5108 [Renumbered 1307.0045]
1305.5109 [Renumbered 1307.0050]
1305.5110 [Renumbered 1307.0055]
1305.5111 [Renumbered 1307.0060]
1305.5112 [Renumbered 1307.0065]
1305.5114 [Renumbered 1307.0070]
1305.5115 [Renumbered 1307.0075]
1305.5116 [Renumbered 1307.0080]
1305.5117 [Renumbered 1307.0085]
1305.5118 [Renumbered 1307.0090]
1305.5200 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

1305.5300 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]

73



1305.5310 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]

1305.5320 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.5340 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.5360 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.5380 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.5385 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.5400 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.5500 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]

1305.5700 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.5710 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.5720 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.5730 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.5740 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.5750 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.5800 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]

1305.5900 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.5910 [Repealed, 11 SR 1405]
1305.6000 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340)
1305.6200 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.6250 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.6260 [Repealed, 11 SR 1405]
1305.6270 [Repealed, 11 SR 1405]
1305.6280 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

1305.6300 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

74



1305.6400 [Repealed by amendment, 9 SR 1557]
1305.6425 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.6430 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.6500 [Repealed by amendment, 9 SR 1557]
1305.6525 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.6550 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]

1305.6600 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]

1305.6700 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.6800 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.6900 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]

1305.6901 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.6902 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.6905 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.6910 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.6920 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.7000 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.7100 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]

Minn. Rules repealed, etc. in chapter 1305
1305.0010 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.0020 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.0100 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.0102 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.0103 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]

1305.0105 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]

75



1305.0106 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.0107 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.0108 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.0109 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.0150 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.0200 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.0300 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]

1305.0301 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.0305 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.0308 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.0400 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.0405 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.0500 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.0600 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.0700 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.0800 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.0900 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.0904 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]

1305.1000 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.1000 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]

1305.1004 [Renumbered 1305.1000, subpart 1]
1305.1009 [Renumbered 1305.1000, subps 3 and 4]
1305.1019 [Renumbered 1305.1000, subp 5]
1305.1100 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

1305.1200 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

1305.1300 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

76



1305.1350 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.1355 [Repealed, 11 SR 1405]
1305.1370 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.1400 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.1500 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.1506 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.1590 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.1600 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.1614 [Renumbered 1305.1616]

1305.1616 [Renumbered 1305.1618]
1305.1616 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]

1305.1618 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.1623 [Renumbered 1305.1625]
1305.1625 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.1700 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.1701 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.1750 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.1775 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.1790 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]
1305.1795 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.1800 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.1900 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.1918 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]

1305.1928 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]



1305.2000 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.2050 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.2100 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]

1305.2200 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.2300 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

1305.2320 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]

1305.2326 [Renumbered 1305.2320]

1305.2400 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]
1305.2500 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.2600 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.2700 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.2800 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.2900 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.3000 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]
1305.3001 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.3100 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]
1305.3200 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]
1305.3300 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]
1305.3400 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

1305.3500 [Repealed, 11 SR 1405]
1305.3600 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]

1305.3700 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]
1305.3800 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.3850 [Repealed, 11 SR 1405]

1305.3860 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

78



1305.3900 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

1305.3970 [Repealed, 11 SR 1405]

1305.4000 [Repealed by amendment, 9 SR 1557]

1305.4100 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.4200 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]

1305.4300 [Repealed, 11 SR 1405]
1305.4313 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.4332 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.4415 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.4416 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.4429 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]
1305.4500 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]

1305.4600 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.4700 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.4800 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.4850 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.4900 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]

1305.5000 [Repealed, 11 SR 1405]

1305.5100 [Repealed, 11 SR 1405; 19 SR 1340]

1305.5101 [Renumbered 1307.0010]
1305.5102 [Renumbered 1307.0015]
1305.5103 [Renumbered 1307.0020]
1305.5104 [Renumbered 1307.0025]

1305.5105 [Renumbered 1307.0030]

79



1305.5106 [Renumbered 1307.0035]
1305.5107 [Renumbered 1307.0040]
1305.5108 [Renumbered 1307.0045]
1305.5109 [Renumbered 1307.0050]
1305.5110 [Renumbered 1307.0055]
1305.5111 [Renumbered 1307.0060]
1305.5112 [Renumbered 1307.0065]
1305.5114 [Renumbered 1307.0070]
1305.5115 [Renumbered 1307.0075]
1305.5116 [Renumbered 1307.0080]
1305.5117 [Renumbered 1307.0085]
1305.5118 [Renumbered 1307.0090]
1305.5200 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.5300 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]
1305.5310 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]
1305.5320 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.5340 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.5360 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.5380 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.5385 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.5400 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.5500 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]
1305.5700 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

1305.5710 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

80



1305.5720 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.5730 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.5740 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.5750 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.5800 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]
1305.5900 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.5910 [Repealed, 11 SR 1405]
1305.6000 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.6200 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.6250 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.6260 [Repealed, 11 SR 1405]
1305.6270 [Repealed, 11 SR 1405]
1305.6280 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.6300 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.6400 [Repealed by amendment, 9 SR 1557]
1305.6425 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.6430 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.6500 [Repealed by amendment, 9 SR 1557]
1305.6525 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.6550 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]
1305.6600 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]
1305.6700 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.6800 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]

1305.6900 [Repealed, 15 SR 74]

81



1305.6901 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.6902 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.6905 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.6910 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.6920 [Repealed, 19 SR 1340]
1305.7000 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]

1305.7100 [Repealed, 27 SR 1474]

82



