
 1 

 

 

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL FORM 
  (Must be submitted electronically) 

 
Author/requestor: Chris Rosival      Date: 12/10/2024  
 
Email address: chris.rosival@state.mn.us     Model Code: 2024 IMC 
 
Telephone number: 651-284-5510     Code or Rule Section: 1346.0306.5 
 
Firm/Association affiliation, if any: DLI    Topic of proposal: Roof access 
 
Code or rule section to be changed: 306.5 
 
Intended for Technical Advisory Group (“TAG”): 

 
 
General Information           Yes No 
 

A. Is the proposed change unique to the State of Minnesota?     ☒ ☐ 

B. Is the proposed change required due to climatic conditions of Minnesota?  ☒ ☐ 

C. Will the proposed change encourage more uniform enforcement?   ☒ ☐ 

D. Will the proposed change remedy a problem?     ☒ ☐  

E. Does the proposal delete a current Minnesota Rule, chapter amendment?  ☒ ☐ 

F. Would this proposed change be appropriate through the ICC code  

development process?        ☒ ☐  

 
Proposed Language 

1. The proposed code change is meant to: 
 

 change language contained the model code book? If so, list section(s). 
 2024 IMC Section 306.5 
 

 change language contained in an existing amendment in Minnesota Rule? If so, list Rule part(s). 
 MR1346.0306.5 
 
  delete language contained in the model code book? If so, list section(s). 
       
 
  delete language contained in an existing amendment in Minnesota Rule? If so, list Rule 
 part(s). 
       
 
  add new language that is not found in the model code book or in Minnesota Rule. 

      
2. Is this proposed code change required by Minnesota Statute? If so, please provide the citation.  
       

 



 2 

 
 

3. Provide specific language you would like to see changed. Indicate proposed new words with 
underlining and strikethrough words proposed for deletion. Include the entire code (sub) section or 
rule subpart that contains your proposed changes.   

 
306.5 Where equipment requiring access or appliances are located on an elevated structure or the roof 
of a building such that personnel will have to climb higher than 16 feet (4877 mm) above grade to 
access such equipment or appliances, an interior or exterior means of access shall be provided. Such 
access shall be required as referenced in MR1305 Section 1011.15. Permanent ladders shall be 
installed for not require climbing over obstructions greater than 30 inches (762 mm) in height or walking 
on roofs having a slope greater than 4 units vertical in 12 units horizontal (33-percent slope). Such 
access shall not require the use of portable ladders. Where access involves climbing over parapet 
walls, the height shall be measured to the top of the parapet wall. 
Permanent ladders installed to provide the required access shall comply with the following minimum 
design criteria: 
1. The side railing shall extend above the parapet or roof edge or landing platform not less than 42 
inches (1067 mm). 
2. Ladders shall have rung spacing not less than 10 inches (254 mm) and not to exceed 14 inches (356 
mm) on center. The uppermost rung shall be not greater than 24 inches (610 mm) below the upper 
edge of the roof hatch, roof or parapet, as applicable. 
3. Ladders shall have a toe spacing not less than 7 inches (178 mm) and not more than 12 inches (305 
mm) deep. 
4. There shall be not less than 16 inches (406 mm) between rails. 
5. Rungs shall have a diameter not less than 0.75-inch (19.1 mm) and be capable of withstanding a 
300-pound (136 kg) load. 
6. Ladders over 30 feet (9144 mm) in height shall be provided with offset sections and landings capable 
of withstanding 100 pounds per square foot (488 kg/m2). Landing dimensions shall be not less than 18 
inches (457 mm) and not less than the width of the ladder served. A guard rail shall be provided on all 
open sides of the landing. 
7. Climbing clearance. The distance from the centerline of the rungs to the nearest permanent object on 
the climbing side of the ladder shall be not less than 30 inches (762 mm) measured perpendicular to 
the rungs. This distance shall be maintained from the point of ladder access to the bottom of the roof 
hatch. A minimum clear width of 15 inches (381 mm) shall be provided on both sides of the ladder 
measured from the midpoint of and parallel with the rungs except where cages or wells are installed. 
8. Landing required. The ladder shall be provided with a clear and unobstructed bottom landing area 
having a minimum dimension of 30 inches (762 mm) by 30 inches (762 mm) centered in front of the 
ladder. 
9. Ladders shall be protected against corrosion by approved means. 
10. Access to ladders shall be provided at all times. 
11. Top landing required. The ladder shall be provided with a clear and unobstructed landing on the exit 
side of the roof hatch, having a minimum space of 30 inches (762 mm) deep and being the same width 
as the hatch. Catwalks installed to provide the required access shall be not less than 24 inches (610 
mm) wide and shall have railings as required for service platforms. 

Exception: This section shall not apply to Group R-3 occupancies.  
 

4. Will this proposed code change impact other sections of a model code book or an amendment in 
Minnesota Rule? If so, please list the affected sections or rule parts. 
 
Yes, Minnesota Building Code 

 
 
Need and Reason 
 

1. Why is the proposed code change needed? Please provide a general explanation as well as a 
specific explanation for any changes to numerical values (heights, area, etc.) 



 3 

 
The code change addresses the access to roofs. The roof access is normally designed by 
architects, not mechanical contractors. 
 

2. Why is the proposed code change a reasonable solution?  
 
The Minnesota Building Code is a better location for how to build a ship stairs.  
 

3. What other factors should the TAG consider?  
      
 

 
Cost/Benefit Analysis 
 

1. Will the proposed code change increase or decrease costs? Please explain and provide estimates if 
possible.  
 
No change 
 

2. If there is an increased cost, will this cost be offset by a safety or other benefit? Please explain. If 
the benefit is quantifiable (for example energy savings), provide an estimate if possible.  
      
 

3.  If there is a cost increase, who will bear the costs? This can include government units, businesses, 
and individuals. 
      

 
4. Are there any enforcement or compliance cost increases or decreases with the proposed code 

change? Please explain.   
      
 

5. Will the cost of complying with the proposed code change in the first year after the rule takes effect 
exceed $25,000 for any one small business or small city (Minn. Stat. § 14.127)? A small business is 
any business that has less than 50 full-time employees. A small city is any statutory or home rule 
charter city that has less than ten full-time employees. Please explain.   
      

 
 
Regulatory Analysis  
 
 

1. What parties or segments of industry are affected by this proposed code change? 
 
Architects, engineers and mechanical contractors 

 
 

2. Can you think of other means or methods to achieve the purpose of the proposed code change? 
What might someone opposed to this code change suggest instead? Please explain what  the 
alternatives are and why your proposed change is the preferred method or means to achieve the 
desired result. 

  
 

3. What are the probable costs or consequences of not adopting the code change, including those 
costs or consequences borne by identifiable categories of affected parties, such as separate 
classes of government units, businesses, or individuals? 
 

https://www.revisor.mn.gov/statutes/cite/14.127


 4 

4. Are you aware of any federal or state regulation or requirement related to this proposed code 
change? If so, please list the federal or state regulation or requirement and your assessment of any 
differences between the proposed code change and the federal regulation or requirement. 

  
 
  
***Note: The information you provide in this code change proposal form is considered Public Data and 
used by the TAG to consider your proposed modification to the code. Any code change proposal form 
submitted to DLI may be reviewed at public TAG meetings and used by department staff and the Office 
of Administrative Hearings to justify the need and reasonableness of any proposed rule draft subject to 
administrative review and is available to the public.  
 
****Note: Incomplete forms will be returned to the submitter with instruction to complete the form. Only 
completed forms will be accepted and considered by the TAG. The submitter may be asked to provide 
additional information in support of the proposed code change. 
 



 1 

 

 

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL FORM 
  (Must be submitted electronically) 

 
Author/requestor: Chris Rosival      Date: 12/13/2024  
 
Email address: chris.rosival@state.mn.us     Model Code: 2024 
 
Telephone number: 651-284-5510     Code or Rule Section: IMC 607 
 
Firm/Association affiliation, if any: DLI    Topic of proposal: Shaft enclosures 
 
Code or rule section to be changed: 607.5.5 
 
Intended for Technical Advisory Group (“TAG”): 

 
 
General Information           Yes No 
 

A. Is the proposed change unique to the State of Minnesota?     ☐ ☐ 

B. Is the proposed change required due to climatic conditions of Minnesota?  ☐ ☐ 

C. Will the proposed change encourage more uniform enforcement?   ☒ ☐ 

D. Will the proposed change remedy a problem?     ☒ ☐  

E. Does the proposal delete a current Minnesota Rule, chapter amendment?  ☐ ☐ 

F. Would this proposed change be appropriate through the ICC code  

development process?        ☒ ☐  

 
Proposed Language 

1. The proposed code change is meant to: 
 

 change language contained the model code book? If so, list section(s). 
       
 

 change language contained in an existing amendment in Minnesota Rule? If so, list Rule part(s). 
       
 
  delete language contained in the model code book? If so, list section(s). 
       
 
  delete language contained in an existing amendment in Minnesota Rule? If so, list Rule 
 part(s). 
       
 
  add new language that is not found in the model code book or in Minnesota Rule. 

IMC 607.5.5 
 

2. Is this proposed code change required by Minnesota Statute? If so, please provide the citation.  
       



 2 

 
 
 

3. Provide specific language you would like to see changed. Indicate proposed new words with 
underlining and strikethrough words proposed for deletion. Include the entire code (sub) section or 
rule subpart that contains your proposed changes.   
 
[BF] 607.5.5 Shaft enclosures. Shaft enclosures that are permitted to be penetrated by ducts and 
air transfer openings shall be protected with listed fire and smoke dampers installed in accordance 
with their listing. 

Exceptions: 
1. Fire dampers are not required at penetrations of shafts where any of the following apply: 
1.1. Steel exhaust subducts having a wall thickness of not less than 0.0187 inch (0.4712 
mm) extend not less than 22 inches (559 mm) vertically in exhaust shafts and an exhaust 
fan is installed at the upper terminus of the shaft that is powered continuously, in 
accordance with Section 909.11 of the International Building Code, so as to maintain a 
continuous airflow upward to the outdoors. 
1.2. Penetrations are tested in accordance with ASTM E119 or UL 263 as part of the fire-
resistance-rated assembly. 
1.3. Ducts are used as part of an approved smoke control system in accordance with 
Section 909 of the International Building Code, and where the fire damper will interfere with 
the operation of the smoke control system. 
1.4. The penetrations are in parking garage exhaust or supply shafts that are separated 
from other building shafts by not less than 2-hour fire-resistance-rated construction. 
2. In Group B and R occupancies equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in 
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 of the International Building Code, smoke dampers are 
not required at penetrations of shafts where kitchen, clothes dryer, bathroom and toilet room 
exhaust openings with steel exhaust subducts, having a wall thickness of not 
less than 0.0187 inch (0.4712 mm), extend not less than 22 inches (559 mm) vertically and 
the exhaust fan at the upper terminus is powered continuously in accordance with the 
provisions of Section 909.11 of the International Building Code, and maintains airflow 
upward to the outdoors. 
3. Smoke dampers are not required at penetrations of exhaust or supply shafts in parking 
garages that are separated from other building shafts by not less than 2-hour fire-resistance-
rated construction. 
4. Smoke dampers are not required at penetrations of shafts where ducts are used as part 
of an approved mechanical smoke control system designed in accordance with Section 909 
of the International Building Code and where the smoke damper will interfere with the 
operation of the smoke control system. 
5. Fire dampers and combination fire/smoke dampers are not required in kitchen and 
clothes dryer exhaust systems where dampers are prohibited by this code. 
6.Fire dampers, smoke dampers, and combination fire/smoke dampers are not required in 
laboratory hood exhaust duct penetrations of shaft enclosures where laboratory ventilation 
systems are installed in accordance with Chapters 1 to 4, 7, and 8 of NFPA 45. 

  
4. Will this proposed code change impact other sections of a model code book or an amendment in 

Minnesota Rule? If so, please list the affected sections or rule parts. 
       

 
 
Need and Reason 
 

1. Why is the proposed code change needed? Please provide a general explanation as well as a 
specific explanation for any changes to numerical values (heights, area, etc.) 
 
This is an amendment in MR1305 that needs to added to the IMC for consistency. 



 3 

717.5.3 Shaft enclosures. 
Shaft enclosures that are permitted to be penetrated by ducts and air transfer openings shall be 
protected with listed fire and smoke dampers installed in accordance with their listing. 
Exceptions: 
1.Fire dampers are not required at penetrations of shafts where any of the following criteria are met: 
1.1.Steel exhaust subducts are extended not less than 22 inches (559 mm) vertically in exhaust 
shafts, provided that there is a continuous airflow upward to the outside. 
1.2.Penetrations are tested in accordance with ASTM E119 or UL 263 as part of the fire-resistance-
rated assembly. 
1.3.Ducts are used as part of an approved smoke control system designed and installed in 
accordance with Section 909 and where the fire damper will interfere with the operation of the 
smoke control system. 
1.4.The penetrations are in parking garage exhaust or supply shafts that are separated from other 
building shafts by not less than 2-hour fire-resistance-rated construction. 
2.In Group B and R occupancies equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in 
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1, smoke dampers are not required at penetrations of shafts 
where all of the following criteria are met: 
2.1.Kitchen, clothes dryer, bathroom and toilet room exhaust openings are installed with steel 
exhaust subducts, having a minimum wall thickness of 0.0187-inch (0.4712 mm) (No. 26 gage). 
2.2.The subducts extend not less than 22 inches (559 mm) vertically. 
2.3.An exhaust fan is installed at the upper terminus of the shaft that is powered continuously in 
accordance with the provisions of Section 909.11, so as to maintain a continuous upward airflow to 
the outside. 
3.Smoke dampers are not required at penetration of exhaust or supply shafts in parking garages 
that are separated from other building shafts by not less than 2-hour fire-resistance-rated 
construction. 
4.Smoke dampers are not required at penetrations of shafts where ducts are used as part of an 
approved mechanical smoke control system designed in accordance with Section 909 and where 
the smoke damper will interfere with the operation of the smoke control system. 
5.Fire dampers and combination fire/smoke dampers are not required in kitchen and clothes dryer 
exhaust systems where dampers are prohibited by the International Mechanical Code. 
6.Fire dampers, smoke dampers, and combination fire/smoke dampers are not required in 
laboratory hood exhaust duct penetrations of shaft enclosures where laboratory ventilation systems 
are installed in accordance with Chapters 1 to 4, 7, and 8 of NFPA 45. 
 

2. Why is the proposed code change a reasonable solution?  
The 2 codes are identical except for the amendment 
 

3. What other factors should the TAG consider?  
      
 

 
Cost/Benefit Analysis 
 

1. Will the proposed code change increase or decrease costs? Please explain and provide estimates if 
possible.  
No change 
 

2. If there is an increased cost, will this cost be offset by a safety or other benefit? Please explain. If 
the benefit is quantifiable (for example energy savings), provide an estimate if possible.  
      
 

3.  If there is a cost increase, who will bear the costs? This can include government units, businesses, 
and individuals. 
      

 



 4 

4. Are there any enforcement or compliance cost increases or decreases with the proposed code 
change? Please explain.   
      
 

5. Will the cost of complying with the proposed code change in the first year after the rule takes effect 
exceed $25,000 for any one small business or small city (Minn. Stat. § 14.127)? A small business is 
any business that has less than 50 full-time employees. A small city is any statutory or home rule 
charter city that has less than ten full-time employees. Please explain.   
      

 
 
Regulatory Analysis  
 
 

1. What parties or segments of industry are affected by this proposed code change? 
Mechanical designers and installers 

 
 

2. Can you think of other means or methods to achieve the purpose of the proposed code change? 
What might someone opposed to this code change suggest instead? Please explain what  the 
alternatives are and why your proposed change is the preferred method or means to achieve the 
desired result. 

       
 

3. What are the probable costs or consequences of not adopting the code change, including those 
costs or consequences borne by identifiable categories of affected parties, such as separate 
classes of government units, businesses, or individuals? 
      
 

4. Are you aware of any federal or state regulation or requirement related to this proposed code 
change? If so, please list the federal or state regulation or requirement and your assessment of any 
differences between the proposed code change and the federal regulation or requirement. 

       
 

***Note: The information you provide in this code change proposal form is considered Public Data 
and used by the TAG to consider your proposed modification to the code. Any code change 
proposal form submitted to DLI may be reviewed at public TAG meetings and used by department 
staff and the Office of Administrative Hearings to justify the need and reasonableness of any 
proposed rule draft subject to administrative review and is available to the public.  

 
****Note: Incomplete forms will be returned to the submitter with instruction to complete the form. 
Only completed forms will be accepted and considered by the TAG. The submitter may be asked to 
provide additional information in support of the proposed code change. 

 

https://www.revisor.mn.gov/statutes/cite/14.127


 1 

 

 

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL FORM 
  (Must be submitted electronically) 

 
Author/requestor: Chris Rosival      Date: 12/13/2024  
 
Email address: chris.rosival@state.mn.us     Model Code: 2024 IMC 
 
Telephone number: 651-284-5510     Code or Rule Section: 607 
 
Firm/Association affiliation, if any: DLI Topic of proposal: Nonfire-resistance-rated floor assemblies 
 
Code or rule section to be changed:       
 
Intended for Technical Advisory Group (“TAG”): 

 
 
General Information           Yes No 
 

A. Is the proposed change unique to the State of Minnesota?     ☐ ☒ 

B. Is the proposed change required due to climatic conditions of Minnesota?  ☐ ☒ 

C. Will the proposed change encourage more uniform enforcement?   ☒ ☐ 

D. Will the proposed change remedy a problem?     ☒ ☐  

E. Does the proposal delete a current Minnesota Rule, chapter amendment?  ☐ ☒ 

F. Would this proposed change be appropriate through the ICC code  

development process?        ☐ ☒  

 
Proposed Language 

1. The proposed code change is meant to: 
 

 change language contained the model code book? If so, list section(s). 
 IMC 607.6.3 
 

 change language contained in an existing amendment in Minnesota Rule? If so, list Rule part(s). 
       
 
  delete language contained in the model code book? If so, list section(s). 
       
 
  delete language contained in an existing amendment in Minnesota Rule? If so, list Rule 
 part(s). 
       
 
  add new language that is not found in the model code book or in Minnesota Rule. 

      
2. Is this proposed code change required by Minnesota Statute? If so, please provide the citation.  
       

 

mailto:chris.rosival@state.mn.us


 2 

 
 

3. Provide specific language you would like to see changed. Indicate proposed new words with 
underlining and strikethrough words proposed for deletion. Include the entire code (sub) section or 
rule subpart that contains your proposed changes.  
  
[BF] 607.6.3 Nonfire-resistance-rated floor assemblies. Duct systems constructed of approved 
materials in accordance with Section 603 that penetrate nonfire-resistance-rated floor assemblies 
shall be protected by any of the following methods: 
1. A shaft enclosure in accordance with Section 713 of the International Building Code. 
2. The duct connects not more than two stories, and the annular space around the penetrating duct 
is protected with an approved noncombustible material that resists the free passage of flame and 
the products of combustion. 
3. In floor assemblies composed of noncombustible materials, a shaft shall not be required where 
the duct connects not more than three stories, and The duct connects not more than three stories, 
the annular space around the penetrating duct is protected with an approved noncombustible 
material that resists the free passage of flame and the products of combustion and a fire damper is 
installed at each floor line. 
Exception: Fire dampers are not required in ducts within individual residential dwelling units. 

  
4. Will this proposed code change impact other sections of a model code book or an amendment in 

Minnesota Rule? If so, please list the affected sections or rule parts. 
       

 
 
Need and Reason 
 

1. Why is the proposed code change needed? Please provide a general explanation as well as a 
specific explanation for any changes to numerical values (heights, area, etc.) 
 
MR 1305 amended language differs that from IMC. For consistency, we need to amend the IMC to 
follow the requirements in MR1305 
 
717.6.3 Nonfire-resistance-rated floor assemblies. 
Duct systems constructed of approved materials in accordance with the Minnesota Mechanical 
Code, Minnesota Rules, Chapter 1346, that penetrate nonfire-resistance-rated floor assemblies 
shall be protected by any of the following methods: 
1.A shaft enclosure in accordance with Section 713. 
2.The duct connects not more than two stories, and the annular space around the penetrating duct 
is protected with an approved noncombustible material that resists the free passage of flame and 
the products of combustion. 
3.The duct connects not more than three stories, the annular space around the penetrating duct is 
protected with an approved noncombustible material that resists the free passage of flame and the 
products of combustion, and a fire damper is installed at each floor line. 
Exception to Item 3: Fire dampers are not required in ducts within individual residential dwelling 
units. 
 

2. Why is the proposed code change a reasonable solution?  
Consistency in codes is very important for enforcement. 
 

3. What other factors should the TAG consider?  
      
 

 
Cost/Benefit Analysis 
 



 3 

1. Will the proposed code change increase or decrease costs? Please explain and provide estimates if 
possible.  
None 
 

2. If there is an increased cost, will this cost be offset by a safety or other benefit? Please explain. If 
the benefit is quantifiable (for example energy savings), provide an estimate if possible.  
      
 

3.  If there is a cost increase, who will bear the costs? This can include government units, businesses, 
and individuals. 
      

 
4. Are there any enforcement or compliance cost increases or decreases with the proposed code 

change? Please explain.   
      
 

5. Will the cost of complying with the proposed code change in the first year after the rule takes effect 
exceed $25,000 for any one small business or small city (Minn. Stat. § 14.127)? A small business is 
any business that has less than 50 full-time employees. A small city is any statutory or home rule 
charter city that has less than ten full-time employees. Please explain.   
      

 
 
Regulatory Analysis  
 
 

1. What parties or segments of industry are affected by this proposed code change? 
 
Mechanical engineers and mechanical inspectors. 

 
2. Can you think of other means or methods to achieve the purpose of the proposed code change? 

What might someone opposed to this code change suggest instead? Please explain what  the 
alternatives are and why your proposed change is the preferred method or means to achieve the 
desired result. 

       
 
3. What are the probable costs or consequences of not adopting the code change, including those 

costs or consequences borne by identifiable categories of affected parties, such as separate 
classes of government units, businesses, or individuals? 
      
 

4. Are you aware of any federal or state regulation or requirement related to this proposed code 
change? If so, please list the federal or state regulation or requirement and your assessment of any 
differences between the proposed code change and the federal regulation or requirement. 

       
 

***Note: The information you provide in this code change proposal form is considered Public Data 
and used by the TAG to consider your proposed modification to the code. Any code change 
proposal form submitted to DLI may be reviewed at public TAG meetings and used by department 
staff and the Office of Administrative Hearings to justify the need and reasonableness of any 
proposed rule draft subject to administrative review and is available to the public.  

 
****Note: Incomplete forms will be returned to the submitter with instruction to complete the form. 
Only completed forms will be accepted and considered by the TAG. The submitter may be asked to 
provide additional information in support of the proposed code change. 

 

https://www.revisor.mn.gov/statutes/cite/14.127


 1 

 

 

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL FORM 
  (Must be submitted electronically) 

 
Author/requestor: Chris Rosival      Date: 12/10/2024  
 
Email address: chris.rosival@state.mn.us     Model Code: 2024 IMC 
 
Telephone number: 651-284-5510     Code or Rule Section: 1346.0506.4.1.1 
 
Firm/Association affiliation, if any: DLI    Topic of proposal: Type II duct sealing 
 
Code or rule section to be changed: 506.4.1 
 
Intended for Technical Advisory Group (“TAG”): 

 
 
General Information           Yes No 
 

A. Is the proposed change unique to the State of Minnesota?     ☒ ☐ 

B. Is the proposed change required due to climatic conditions of Minnesota?  ☒ ☐ 

C. Will the proposed change encourage more uniform enforcement?   ☒ ☐ 

D. Will the proposed change remedy a problem?     ☒ ☐  

E. Does the proposal delete a current Minnesota Rule, chapter amendment?  ☒ ☐ 

F. Would this proposed change be appropriate through the ICC code  

development process?        ☒ ☐  

 
Proposed Language 

1. The proposed code change is meant to: 
 

 change language contained the model code book? If so, list section(s). 
  
 

 change language contained in an existing amendment in Minnesota Rule? If so, list Rule part(s). 
  

MR1346.0506.4.1 and MR1346.0506.4.1.1 
 
  delete language contained in the model code book? If so, list section(s). 
       
 
  delete language contained in an existing amendment in Minnesota Rule? If so, list Rule 
 part(s). 
       
 
  add new language that is not found in the model code book or in Minnesota Rule. 

      
2. Is this proposed code change required by Minnesota Statute? If so, please provide the citation.  
       



 2 

 
 
 

3. Provide specific language you would like to see changed. Indicate proposed new words with 
underlining and strikethrough words proposed for deletion. Include the entire code (sub) section or 
rule subpart that contains your proposed changes.   

 
1346.0506.4.1 Ducts. 
Ducts and plenums serving Type II hoods shall be constructed of rigid metallic materials. Duct 
construction, installation, bracing, and supports shall comply with Chapter 6. Ducts subject to 
positive pressure or conveying moisture-laden air, or both, and ducts conveying waste-heat-laden 
air shall be tested pursuant to Section 506.4.1.1. All duct joints, seams and connections shall be 
sealed per IMC 603.9. 
 
1346.0506.4.1.1 Testing. 
Ducts shall be tested with light in accordance with ASHRAE 154 requirements for duct leakage 
testing. The light test shall be performed by passing a 100 W (1600 lumens) or larger lamp through 
the entire section of ductwork to be tested. No light from the duct interior shall be visible through 
any exterior surface. 
 

4. Will this proposed code change impact other sections of a model code book or an amendment in 
Minnesota Rule? If so, please list the affected sections or rule parts. 
 
No 

 
 
Need and Reason 
 

1. Why is the proposed code change needed? Please provide a general explanation as well as a 
specific explanation for any changes to numerical values (heights, area, etc.) 
 
The code does not address testing of Type II ducts.  
 

2. Why is the proposed code change a reasonable solution?  
 
Leakage of Type II ducts can cause issues with the building regarding heat, odors and moisture. 
 

3. What other factors should the TAG consider?  
      
 

 
Cost/Benefit Analysis 
 

1. Will the proposed code change increase or decrease costs? Please explain and provide estimates if 
possible.  
 
No change 
 

2. If there is an increased cost, will this cost be offset by a safety or other benefit? Please explain. If 
the benefit is quantifiable (for example energy savings), provide an estimate if possible.  
      
 

3.  If there is a cost increase, who will bear the costs? This can include government units, businesses, 
and individuals. 
      

 



 3 

4. Are there any enforcement or compliance cost increases or decreases with the proposed code 
change? Please explain.   
      
 

5. Will the cost of complying with the proposed code change in the first year after the rule takes effect 
exceed $25,000 for any one small business or small city (Minn. Stat. § 14.127)? A small business is 
any business that has less than 50 full-time employees. A small city is any statutory or home rule 
charter city that has less than ten full-time employees. Please explain.   
      

 
 
Regulatory Analysis  
 
 

1. What parties or segments of industry are affected by this proposed code change? 
 
Mechanical engineers, mechanical contractors and building owners. 

 
 

2. Can you think of other means or methods to achieve the purpose of the proposed code change? 
What might someone opposed to this code change suggest instead? Please explain what  the 
alternatives are and why your proposed change is the preferred method or means to achieve the 
desired result. 

  
 

3. What are the probable costs or consequences of not adopting the code change, including those 
costs or consequences borne by identifiable categories of affected parties, such as separate 
classes of government units, businesses, or individuals? 
 

4. Are you aware of any federal or state regulation or requirement related to this proposed code 
change? If so, please list the federal or state regulation or requirement and your assessment of any 
differences between the proposed code change and the federal regulation or requirement. 

  
 
  
***Note: The information you provide in this code change proposal form is considered Public Data and 
used by the TAG to consider your proposed modification to the code. Any code change proposal form 
submitted to DLI may be reviewed at public TAG meetings and used by department staff and the Office 
of Administrative Hearings to justify the need and reasonableness of any proposed rule draft subject to 
administrative review and is available to the public.  
 
****Note: Incomplete forms will be returned to the submitter with instruction to complete the form. Only 
completed forms will be accepted and considered by the TAG. The submitter may be asked to provide 
additional information in support of the proposed code change. 
 

https://www.revisor.mn.gov/statutes/cite/14.127


 1 

 

 

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL FORM 
  (Must be submitted electronically) 

 
Author/requestor: Brian Stemwedel      Date: 1/07/2025  
 
Email address: Bstemwedel@goldenvalleymn.gov    Model Code: IFGC 
 
Telephone number: (612)275-1436    Code or Rule Section: Section 305 
 
Firm/Association affiliation, if any: AMBO    Topic of proposal: Conflicts 
 
Code or rule section to be changed:  Fuel Gas Code 
Section 305.1 
 
Intended for Technical Advisory Group (“TAG”): 

 
 
General Information           Yes No 
 

A. Is the proposed change unique to the State of Minnesota?     ☐ ☒ 

B. Is the proposed change required due to climatic conditions of Minnesota?  ☐ ☒ 

C. Will the proposed change encourage more uniform enforcement?   ☒ ☐ 

D. Will the proposed change remedy a problem?     ☒ ☐  

E. Does the proposal delete a current Minnesota Rule, chapter amendment?  ☐ ☒ 

F. Would this proposed change be appropriate through the ICC code  

development process?        ☐ ☒  

 
Proposed Language 

1. The proposed code change is meant to: 
 

 change language contained in the model code book? If so, list section(s). 
 *** 
 

 change language contained in an existing amendment in Minnesota Rule? If so, list Rule part(s). 
  
  delete language contained in the model code book? If so, list section(s). 
  
 
  delete language contained in an existing amendment in Minnesota Rule? If so, list Rule 
 part(s). 
       
 
  add new language that is not found in the model code book or in Minnesota Rule. 

      
2. Is this proposed code change required by Minnesota Statute? If so, please provide the citation.  

 
  



 2 

 
 
 

3. Provide specific language you would like to see changed. Indicate proposed new words with 
underlining and strikethrough words proposed for deletion. Include the entire code (sub) section or 
rule subpart that contains your proposed changes.   
 
Section 305 -Installation  
305.1 General.  
Equipment and appliances shall be installed as required by the terms of their approval, in 
accordance with the conditions of listing, the manufacturer’s instructions and this code. 
Manufacturers’ installation instructions shall be available on the job site at the time of inspection. 
Where a code provision is less restrictive than the conditions of the listing of the equipment or 
appliance or the manufacturer’s installation instructions, the conditions of the listing and the 
manufacturer’s installation instructions shall apply. 
 
305.2 Conflicts. 
Where conflicts between this code and the conditions of listing or the manufacturer’s installation 
instructions occur, the provisions of this code shall apply. 
 
Exception: Where a code provision is less restrictive than the conditions of the listing of the 
equipment or appliance or the manufacturer’s installation instructions, the conditions of the listing 
and the manufacturer’s installation instructions shall apply. 
 

 
4. Will this proposed code change impact other sections of a model code book or an amendment in 

Minnesota Rule? If so, please list the affected sections or rule parts. 
NO 

 
Need and Reason 
 

1. Why is the proposed code change needed? Please provide a general explanation as well as a 
specific explanation for any changes to numerical values (heights, area, etc.) 

This language is in alignment with the Mechanical Code with regard to conflicts between the 
Code and the conditions of the listing of the equipment or appliance or the manufacturer’s 
installation instructions.  This adds clarity that the more specific or more restrictive provisions would 
apply in such conflicts. 

2.  Why is the proposed code change a reasonable solution?  
Clarity is needed to ensure the more restrictive/ specific requirements apply.  Although 

Section 305 already requires this, the language here adds clarity. 
 

3. What other factors should the TAG consider?  
Generally, in other Codes, where there is a conflict between a Code provision and a Rule or 

Standard, or where a Mfg. Installation requirement is less restrictive than the Code, the (more 
restrictive/ specific) Code provision prevails.  Also see MN Rule 1300.0030 Subp 2.(B.) 

 
Cost/Benefit Analysis 
 

1. Will the proposed code change increase or decrease costs? Please explain and provide estimates if 
possible.  
N/A. 

2. If there is an increased cost, will this cost be offset by a safety or other benefit? Please explain. If 
the benefit is quantifiable (for example energy savings), provide an estimate if possible.  
N/A 
 



 3 

3.  If there is a cost increase, who will bear the costs? This can include government units, businesses, 
and individuals. 
N/A 

 
4. Are there any enforcement or compliance cost increases or decreases with the proposed code 

change? Please explain.  NO 
 

5. Will the cost of complying with the proposed code change in the first year after the rule takes effect 
exceed $25,000 for any one small business or small city (Minn. Stat. § 14.127)? A small business is 
any business that has less than 50 full-time employees. A small city is any statutory or home rule 
charter city that has less than ten full-time employees. Please explain.   
No 

 
 
Regulatory Analysis  
 
 

1. What parties or segments of the industry are affected by this proposed code change? 
Contractors, Code Officials, Designers, installers 

 
 

2. Can you think of other means or methods to achieve the purpose of the proposed code change? 
What might someone opposed to this code change suggest instead? Please explain what the 
alternatives are and why your proposed change is the preferred method or means to achieve the 
desired result. 
 

3. What are the probable costs or consequences of not adopting the code change, including those 
costs or consequences borne by identifiable categories of affected parties, such as separate 
classes of government units, businesses, or individuals? 
Less uniform enforcement of the MSBC 
 

4. Are you aware of any federal or state regulation or requirement related to this proposed code 
change? If so, please list the federal or state regulation or requirement and your assessment of any 
differences between the proposed code change and the federal regulation or requirement. 

  NO 
 
 
 
 
 
 
***Note: Incomplete forms may be returned to the submitter with instruction to complete the form. Only 
completed forms can considered by the TAG.  

https://www.revisor.mn.gov/statutes/cite/14.127


 1 

 

 

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL FORM 
  (Must be submitted electronically) 

 
Author/requestor: Chris Rosival      Date: 12/10/2024  
 
Email address: chris.rosival@state.mn.us     Model Code: 2024 IFGC 
 
Telephone number: 651-284-5510     Code or Rule Section: 1346.5306.5 
 
Firm/Association affiliation, if any: DLI    Topic of proposal: Roof access 
 
Code or rule section to be changed: 306.5 
 
Intended for Technical Advisory Group (“TAG”): 

 
 
General Information           Yes No 
 

A. Is the proposed change unique to the State of Minnesota?     ☒ ☐ 

B. Is the proposed change required due to climatic conditions of Minnesota?  ☒ ☐ 

C. Will the proposed change encourage more uniform enforcement?   ☒ ☐ 

D. Will the proposed change remedy a problem?     ☒ ☐  

E. Does the proposal delete a current Minnesota Rule, chapter amendment?  ☒ ☐ 

F. Would this proposed change be appropriate through the ICC code  

development process?        ☒ ☐  

 
Proposed Language 

1. The proposed code change is meant to: 
 

 change language contained the model code book? If so, list section(s). 
 2024 IFGC Section 306.5 
 

 change language contained in an existing amendment in Minnesota Rule? If so, list Rule part(s). 
 MR1346.5306.5 
 
  delete language contained in the model code book? If so, list section(s). 
       
 
  delete language contained in an existing amendment in Minnesota Rule? If so, list Rule 
 part(s). 
       
 
  add new language that is not found in the model code book or in Minnesota Rule. 

      
2. Is this proposed code change required by Minnesota Statute? If so, please provide the citation.  
       

 



 2 

 
 

3. Provide specific language you would like to see changed. Indicate proposed new words with 
underlining and strikethrough words proposed for deletion. Include the entire code (sub) section or 
rule subpart that contains your proposed changes.   

 
[M] 306.5 Where equipment requiring access or appliances are located on an elevated structure or the 
roof of a building such that personnel will have to climb higher than 16 feet (4877 mm) above grade to 
access such equipment or appliances, an interior or exterior means of access shall be provided. Such 
access shall be required as referenced in MR1305 Section 1011.15. Permanent ladders shall be 
installed for not require climbing over obstructions greater than 30 inches (762 mm) in height or walking 
on roofs having a slope greater than 4 units vertical in 12 units horizontal (33-percent slope). Such 
access shall not require the use of portable ladders. Where access involves climbing over parapet 
walls, the height shall be measured to the top of the parapet wall. 
Permanent ladders installed to provide the required access shall comply with the following minimum 
design criteria: 
1. The side railing shall extend above the parapet or roof edge or landing platform not less than 42 
inches (1067 mm). 
2. Ladders shall have rung spacing not less than 10 inches (254 mm) and not to exceed 14 inches (356 
mm) on center. The uppermost rung shall be not greater than 24 inches (610 mm) below the upper 
edge of the roof hatch, roof or parapet, as applicable. 
3. Ladders shall have a toe spacing not less than 7 inches (178 mm) and not more than 12 inches (305 
mm) deep. 
4. There shall be not less than 16 inches (406 mm) between rails. 
5. Rungs shall have a diameter not less than 0.75-inch (19.1 mm) and be capable of withstanding a 
300-pound (136 kg) load. 
6. Ladders over 30 feet (9144 mm) in height shall be provided with offset sections and landings capable 
of withstanding 100 pounds per square foot (488 kg/m2). Landing dimensions shall be not less than 18 
inches (457 mm) and not less than the width of the ladder served. A guard rail shall be provided on all 
open sides of the landing. 
7. Climbing clearance. The distance from the centerline of the rungs to the nearest permanent object on 
the climbing side of the ladder shall be not less than 30 inches (762 mm) measured perpendicular to 
the rungs. This distance shall be maintained from the point of ladder access to the bottom of the roof 
hatch. A minimum clear width of 15 inches (381 mm) shall be provided on both sides of the ladder 
measured from the midpoint of and parallel with the rungs except where cages or wells are installed. 
8. Landing required. The ladder shall be provided with a clear and unobstructed bottom landing area 
having a minimum dimension of 30 inches (762 mm) by 30 inches (762 mm) centered in front of the 
ladder. 
9. Ladders shall be protected against corrosion by approved means. 
10. Access to ladders shall be provided at all times. 
11. Top landing required. The ladder shall be provided with a clear and unobstructed landing on the exit 
side of the roof hatch, having a minimum space of 30 inches (762 mm) deep and being the same width 
as the hatch.  
Catwalks installed to provide the required access shall be not less than 24 inches (610 mm) wide and 
shall have railings as required for service platforms. 

Exception: This section shall not apply to Group R-3 occupancies.  
 

4. Will this proposed code change impact other sections of a model code book or an amendment in 
Minnesota Rule? If so, please list the affected sections or rule parts. 
 
Yes, Minnesota Building Code 

 
 
Need and Reason 
 



 3 

1. Why is the proposed code change needed? Please provide a general explanation as well as a 
specific explanation for any changes to numerical values (heights, area, etc.) 
 
The code change addresses the access to roofs. The roof access is normally designed by 
architects, not mechanical contractors. 
 

2. Why is the proposed code change a reasonable solution?  
 
The Minnesota Building Code is a better location for how to build a ship stairs.  
 

3. What other factors should the TAG consider?  
      
 

 
Cost/Benefit Analysis 
 

1. Will the proposed code change increase or decrease costs? Please explain and provide estimates if 
possible.  
 
No change 
 

2. If there is an increased cost, will this cost be offset by a safety or other benefit? Please explain. If 
the benefit is quantifiable (for example energy savings), provide an estimate if possible.  
      
 

3.  If there is a cost increase, who will bear the costs? This can include government units, businesses, 
and individuals. 
      

 
4. Are there any enforcement or compliance cost increases or decreases with the proposed code 

change? Please explain.   
      
 

5. Will the cost of complying with the proposed code change in the first year after the rule takes effect 
exceed $25,000 for any one small business or small city (Minn. Stat. § 14.127)? A small business is 
any business that has less than 50 full-time employees. A small city is any statutory or home rule 
charter city that has less than ten full-time employees. Please explain.   
      

 
 
Regulatory Analysis  
 
 

1. What parties or segments of industry are affected by this proposed code change? 
 
Architects, engineers and mechanical contractors 

 
 

2. Can you think of other means or methods to achieve the purpose of the proposed code change? 
What might someone opposed to this code change suggest instead? Please explain what  the 
alternatives are and why your proposed change is the preferred method or means to achieve the 
desired result. 

  
 

https://www.revisor.mn.gov/statutes/cite/14.127


 4 

3. What are the probable costs or consequences of not adopting the code change, including those 
costs or consequences borne by identifiable categories of affected parties, such as separate 
classes of government units, businesses, or individuals? 
 

4. Are you aware of any federal or state regulation or requirement related to this proposed code 
change? If so, please list the federal or state regulation or requirement and your assessment of any 
differences between the proposed code change and the federal regulation or requirement. 

  
 
  
***Note: The information you provide in this code change proposal form is considered Public Data and 
used by the TAG to consider your proposed modification to the code. Any code change proposal form 
submitted to DLI may be reviewed at public TAG meetings and used by department staff and the Office 
of Administrative Hearings to justify the need and reasonableness of any proposed rule draft subject to 
administrative review and is available to the public.  
 
****Note: Incomplete forms will be returned to the submitter with instruction to complete the form. Only 
completed forms will be accepted and considered by the TAG. The submitter may be asked to provide 
additional information in support of the proposed code change. 
 



 1 

 

 

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL FORM 
  (Must be submitted electronically) 

 
Author/requestor: Chris Rosival     Date: 12/13/2024  
 
Email address: chris.rosival@state.mn.us    Model Code: 2024 IRC 
 
Telephone number: 651-284-5510     Code or Rule Section: M1302 
 
Firm/Association affiliation, if any: DLI    Topic of proposal: Listing and labeled 
 
Code or rule section to be changed: M1302.1 
 
Intended for Technical Advisory Group (“TAG”): 

 
 
General Information           Yes No 
 

A. Is the proposed change unique to the State of Minnesota?     ☐ ☒ 

B. Is the proposed change required due to climatic conditions of Minnesota?  ☐ ☒ 

C. Will the proposed change encourage more uniform enforcement?   ☒ ☐ 

D. Will the proposed change remedy a problem?     ☐ ☒  

E. Does the proposal delete a current Minnesota Rule, chapter amendment?  ☐ ☒ 

F. Would this proposed change be appropriate through the ICC code  

development process?        ☒ ☐  

 
Proposed Language 

1. The proposed code change is meant to: 
 

 change language contained the model code book? If so, list section(s). 
 M1302.1 
 

 change language contained in an existing amendment in Minnesota Rule? If so, list Rule part(s). 
       
 
  delete language contained in the model code book? If so, list section(s). 
       
 
  delete language contained in an existing amendment in Minnesota Rule? If so, list Rule 
 part(s). 
       
 
  add new language that is not found in the model code book or in Minnesota Rule. 

      
2. Is this proposed code change required by Minnesota Statute? If so, please provide the citation.  
       

 



 2 

 
 

3. Provide specific language you would like to see changed. Indicate proposed new words with 
underlining and strikethrough words proposed for deletion. Include the entire code (sub) section or 
rule subpart that contains your proposed changes.   
 
M1302.1 Listed and labeled. Appliances regulated by this code shall be listed and labeled for the 
application in which they are installed and used, unless otherwise approved in accordance with 
Section R104.2.2.  to an appropriate standard by a nationally recognized testing laboratory which is 
qualified to evaluate the appliance, unless otherwise approved in accordance with the 
administrative provisions of the Minnesota State Building Code, Minnesota Rules, Chapter 1300. 
The approval of unlisted appliances shall be based upon engineering evaluation.  
 

4. Will this proposed code change impact other sections of a model code book or an amendment in 
Minnesota Rule? If so, please list the affected sections or rule parts. 

       
 
 
Need and Reason 
 

1. Why is the proposed code change needed? Please provide a general explanation as well as a 
specific explanation for any changes to numerical values (heights, area, etc.) 
 
This language matches the language in the IMC for listing and labeling. Model code does not. 
 

2. Why is the proposed code change a reasonable solution?  
 
This language has been in the code for a few code cycles and the model code needs elaboration. 
 

3. What other factors should the TAG consider?  
      
 

 
Cost/Benefit Analysis 
 

1. Will the proposed code change increase or decrease costs? Please explain and provide estimates if 
possible.  
No change 
 

2. If there is an increased cost, will this cost be offset by a safety or other benefit? Please explain. If 
the benefit is quantifiable (for example energy savings), provide an estimate if possible.  
      
 

3.  If there is a cost increase, who will bear the costs? This can include government units, businesses, 
and individuals. 
      

 
4. Are there any enforcement or compliance cost increases or decreases with the proposed code 

change? Please explain.   
      
 

5. Will the cost of complying with the proposed code change in the first year after the rule takes effect 
exceed $25,000 for any one small business or small city (Minn. Stat. § 14.127)? A small business is 
any business that has less than 50 full-time employees. A small city is any statutory or home rule 
charter city that has less than ten full-time employees. Please explain.   
      

https://www.revisor.mn.gov/statutes/cite/14.127


 3 

 
 
Regulatory Analysis  
 
 

1. What parties or segments of industry are affected by this proposed code change? 
 None 
 

 
2. Can you think of other means or methods to achieve the purpose of the proposed code change? 

What might someone opposed to this code change suggest instead? Please explain what  the 
alternatives are and why your proposed change is the preferred method or means to achieve the 
desired result. 

       
 

3. What are the probable costs or consequences of not adopting the code change, including those 
costs or consequences borne by identifiable categories of affected parties, such as separate 
classes of government units, businesses, or individuals? 
      
 

4. Are you aware of any federal or state regulation or requirement related to this proposed code 
change? If so, please list the federal or state regulation or requirement and your assessment of any 
differences between the proposed code change and the federal regulation or requirement. 

       
 

***Note: The information you provide in this code change proposal form is considered Public Data 
and used by the TAG to consider your proposed modification to the code. Any code change 
proposal form submitted to DLI may be reviewed at public TAG meetings and used by department 
staff and the Office of Administrative Hearings to justify the need and reasonableness of any 
proposed rule draft subject to administrative review and is available to the public.  

 
****Note: Incomplete forms will be returned to the submitter with instruction to complete the form. 
Only completed forms will be accepted and considered by the TAG. The submitter may be asked to 
provide additional information in support of the proposed code change. 

 



 1 

 

 

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL FORM 
  (Must be submitted electronically) 

 
Author/requestor: Chris Rosival     Date: December 23, 2024  
 
Email address: chris.rosival@state.mn.us    Model Code: 2024 IRC 
 
Telephone number: 651-284-5510     Code or Rule Section: M1601.3 
 
Firm/Association affiliation, if any: DLI 
 
Code or rule section to be changed: M1601.3 
 
Intended for Technical Advisory Group (“TAG”): 

 
 
General Information           Yes No 
 

A. Is the proposed change unique to the State of Minnesota?     ☐ ☒ 

B. Is the proposed change required due to climatic conditions of Minnesota?  ☒ ☐ 

C. Will the proposed change encourage more uniform enforcement?   ☒ ☐ 

D. Will the proposed change remedy a problem?     ☒ ☐  

E. Does the proposal delete a current Minnesota Rule, chapter amendment?  ☐ ☒ 

F. Would this proposed change be appropriate through the ICC code  

development process?        ☐ ☒  

 
Proposed Language 

1. The proposed code change is meant to: 
 

 change language contained the model code book? If so, list section(s). 
 M1601.3 
 

 change language contained in an existing amendment in Minnesota Rule? If so, list Rule part(s). 
       
 
  delete language contained in the model code book? If so, list section(s). 
       
 
  delete language contained in an existing amendment in Minnesota Rule? If so, list Rule 
 part(s). 
       
 
  add new language that is not found in the model code book or in Minnesota Rule. 

      
2. Is this proposed code change required by Minnesota Statute? If so, please provide the citation.  
       

 



 2 

 
 

3. Provide specific language you would like to see changed. Indicate proposed new words with 
underlining and strikethrough words proposed for deletion. Include the entire code (sub) section or 
rule subpart that contains your proposed changes.   
 
M1601.3 Duct insulation materials. Duct insulation materials shall conform to the following 
requirements: 
1. Duct coverings and linings, including adhesives where used, shall have a flame spread index not 
higher than 25, and a smoke-developed index not over 50 when tested in accordance with ASTM 
E84 or UL 723, using the specimen preparation and mounting procedures of ASTM E2231. 

Exception: Spray application of polyurethane foam shall be permitted to be installed to the 
exterior of metallic ducts complying with Table M1601.1.1 concealed in attics, floor 
assembies over an unconditioned space and crawl spaces, provided the spray polyurethane 
foam meets shall be permitted subject to all of the following requirements: 

1. The flame spread index is not greater than 25 and the smoke-developed index is 
not greater than 450 at the specified installed thickness. 
2. The foam plastic is protected in accordance with the ignition barrier requirements 
of Sections R303.5.3 and R303.5.4. 
3. The foam plastic complies with the requirements of Section R303. 
4. The foam shall have a medium density classification (2 lbs./cubic ft., closed cell 
foam) or equivalent. 
5. The foam shall have an R-value of not less than R-8. 

2. Duct coverings and linings shall not flame, glow, smolder or smoke when tested in accordance 
with ASTM C411 at the temperature to which they are exposed in service. The test temperature 
shall not fall below 250°F (121°C). Coverings and linings shall be listed and labeled. 
3. External reflective duct insulation shall be legibly printed or identified at intervals not greater than 
36 inches (914 mm) with the name of the manufacturer, the product R-value at the specified 
installed thickness and the flame spread and smokedeveloped indices. The installed thickness of 
the external duct insulation shall include the enclosed airspace(s). The product R-value for external 
reflective duct insulation shall be determined in accordance with ASTM C1668. 
4 3. External duct insulation and factory-insulated flexible ducts shall be legibly printed or identified 
at intervals not longer than 36 inches (914 mm) with the name of the manufacturer, the thermal 
resistance R-value at the specified installed thickness and the flame spread and smoke-developed 
indices of the composite materials. Spray polyurethane foam manufacturers shall provide the same 
product information and properties, at the nominal installed thickness, to the customer in writing at 
the time of foam application. Nonreflective duct insulation product R-values shall be based on 
insulation only, excluding air films, vapor retarders or other duct components, and shall be based on 
tested C-values at 75°F (24°C) mean temperature at the installed thickness, in accordance with 
recognized industry procedures. The installed thickness of duct insulation used to determine its R-
value shall be determined as follows: 

4 3.1. For duct board, duct liner and factory-made rigid ducts not normally subjected to 
compression, the nominal insulation thickness shall be used. 
4 3.2. For ductwrap, the installed thickness shall be assumed to be 75 percent (25-percent 
compression) of nominal thickness.  

 
4. Will this proposed code change impact other sections of a model code book or an amendment in 

Minnesota Rule? If so, please list the affected sections or rule parts. 
       

 
 
Need and Reason 
 

1. Why is the proposed code change needed? Please provide a general explanation as well as a 
specific explanation for any changes to numerical values (heights, area, etc.) 
 



 3 

Minnesota has not allowed reflective insulation to be used because of our climatic conditions. R-
value insulation" refers to the measurement of a material's ability to resist heat transfer, while 
"reflective insulation" is a specific type of insulation that primarily works by reflecting radiant heat 
away. The requirements for spray polyurethane foam are taken from MR1346.0604.3. 
 

2. Why is the proposed code change a reasonable solution?  
Our climate does not only have radiant heat issues.  
 

3. What other factors should the TAG consider?  
      
 

 
Cost/Benefit Analysis 
 

1. Will the proposed code change increase or decrease costs? Please explain and provide estimates if 
possible.  
No change 
 

2. If there is an increased cost, will this cost be offset by a safety or other benefit? Please explain. If 
the benefit is quantifiable (for example energy savings), provide an estimate if possible.  
      
 

3.  If there is a cost increase, who will bear the costs? This can include government units, businesses, 
and individuals. 
      

 
4. Are there any enforcement or compliance cost increases or decreases with the proposed code 

change? Please explain.   
      
 

5. Will the cost of complying with the proposed code change in the first year after the rule takes effect 
exceed $25,000 for any one small business or small city (Minn. Stat. § 14.127)? A small business is 
any business that has less than 50 full-time employees. A small city is any statutory or home rule 
charter city that has less than ten full-time employees. Please explain.   
      

 
 
Regulatory Analysis  
 
 

1. What parties or segments of industry are affected by this proposed code change? 
Insulation suppliers. 

 
 

2. Can you think of other means or methods to achieve the purpose of the proposed code change? 
What might someone opposed to this code change suggest instead? Please explain what  the 
alternatives are and why your proposed change is the preferred method or means to achieve the 
desired result. 

       
 
3. What are the probable costs or consequences of not adopting the code change, including those 

costs or consequences borne by identifiable categories of affected parties, such as separate 
classes of government units, businesses, or individuals? 
      
 

https://www.revisor.mn.gov/statutes/cite/14.127


 4 

4. Are you aware of any federal or state regulation or requirement related to this proposed code 
change? If so, please list the federal or state regulation or requirement and your assessment of any 
differences between the proposed code change and the federal regulation or requirement. 

       
 
***Note: Incomplete forms may be returned to the submitter with instruction to complete the form. Only 
completed forms can considered by the TAG.  



 1 

 

 

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL FORM 
  (Must be submitted electronically) 

 
Author/requestor: Chris Rosival     Date: January 7, 2025  
 
Email address: chris.rosiival@state.mn.us    Model Code: 2024 IRC 
 
Telephone number: 651-284-5510     Code or Rule Section: M2001.1.1 
 
Firm/Association affiliation, if any: DLI 
 
Code or rule section to be changed: M2001.1.1 & M2001.1.2 
 
Intended for Technical Advisory Group (“TAG”): 

 
 
General Information           Yes No 
 

A. Is the proposed change unique to the State of Minnesota?     ☒ ☒ 

B. Is the proposed change required due to climatic conditions of Minnesota?  ☐ ☒ 

C. Will the proposed change encourage more uniform enforcement?   ☒ ☐ 

D. Will the proposed change remedy a problem?     ☒ ☐  

E. Does the proposal delete a current Minnesota Rule, chapter amendment?  ☐ ☒ 

F. Would this proposed change be appropriate through the ICC code  

development process?        ☒ ☐  

 
Proposed Language 

1. The proposed code change is meant to: 
 

 change language contained the model code book? If so, list section(s). 
 M2001.1.1 
 

 change language contained in an existing amendment in Minnesota Rule? If so, list Rule part(s). 
       
 
  delete language contained in the model code book? If so, list section(s). 
       
 
  delete language contained in an existing amendment in Minnesota Rule? If so, list Rule 
 part(s). 
       
 
  add new language that is not found in the model code book or in Minnesota Rule. 

M2001.1.2 
2. Is this proposed code change required by Minnesota Statute? If so, please provide the citation.  
       

 



 2 

 
 

3. Provide specific language you would like to see changed. Indicate proposed new words with 
underlining and strikethrough words proposed for deletion. Include the entire code (sub) section or 
rule subpart that contains your proposed changes.   

 

M2001.1.1 Standards. Packaged oil-fired boilers shall be listed and labeled in accordance 

with UL 726. Packaged electric boilers shall be listed and labeled in accordance with UL 834. 

Solid fuel-fired boilers shall be listed and labeled in accordance with UL 2523. Boilers shall 

be designed, constructed and certified in accordance with the ASME Boiler and Pressure 

Vessel Code , Section I or IV. Controls and safety devices for boilers with fuel input ratings of 

12,500,000 Btu/hr (3663 kW) or less shall meet the requirements of ASME CSD-1. Gas-fired 

boilers shall conform to the requirements listed in Chapter 24. 

 

M2001.1.2 Application. This chapter only applies to boilers serving a single dwelling unit. For all 

other boilers, follow MR 1346. 
 

  
4. Will this proposed code change impact other sections of a model code book or an amendment in 

Minnesota Rule? If so, please list the affected sections or rule parts. 
MR1346. Chapter 10 

 
 
Need and Reason 
 

1. Why is the proposed code change needed? Please provide a general explanation as well as a 
specific explanation for any changes to numerical values (heights, area, etc.) 
The IRC added language to address larger boilers and residential boilers. The amendment will 
clarify the differences. 
 

2. Why is the proposed code change a reasonable solution?  
Providing guidance to constituents for single dwelling unit boilers and providing a path to the IMC 
for all other boilers as there are vast differences between them. 
 

3. What other factors should the TAG consider?  
      
 

 
Cost/Benefit Analysis 
 

1. Will the proposed code change increase or decrease costs? Please explain and provide estimates if 
possible.  
Neither 
 

2. If there is an increased cost, will this cost be offset by a safety or other benefit? Please explain. If 
the benefit is quantifiable (for example energy savings), provide an estimate if possible.  
      
 

3.  If there is a cost increase, who will bear the costs? This can include government units, businesses, 
and individuals. 
      

 
4. Are there any enforcement or compliance cost increases or decreases with the proposed code 

change? Please explain.   
      



 3 

 
5. Will the cost of complying with the proposed code change in the first year after the rule takes effect 

exceed $25,000 for any one small business or small city (Minn. Stat. § 14.127)? A small business is 
any business that has less than 50 full-time employees. A small city is any statutory or home rule 
charter city that has less than ten full-time employees. Please explain.   
      

 
 
Regulatory Analysis  
 
 

1. What parties or segments of industry are affected by this proposed code change? 
 
Homeowners, contractors and designers 

 
2. Can you think of other means or methods to achieve the purpose of the proposed code change? 

What might someone opposed to this code change suggest instead? Please explain what  the 
alternatives are and why your proposed change is the preferred method or means to achieve the 
desired result. 

       
 
3. What are the probable costs or consequences of not adopting the code change, including those 

costs or consequences borne by identifiable categories of affected parties, such as separate 
classes of government units, businesses, or individuals? 
 
Single dwelling units would be required to follow CSD-1 which will require an emergency shutoff 
valve and other unforeseen issues. 
 

4. Are you aware of any federal or state regulation or requirement related to this proposed code 
change? If so, please list the federal or state regulation or requirement and your assessment of any 
differences between the proposed code change and the federal regulation or requirement. 
326B.964 

 
***Note: Incomplete forms may be returned to the submitter with instruction to complete the form. Only 
completed forms can considered by the TAG.  

https://www.revisor.mn.gov/statutes/cite/14.127


 1 

 

 

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL FORM 
  (Must be submitted electronically) 

 
Author/requestor: Brian Stemwedel      Date: 1/06/2025  
 
Email address: Bstemwedel@goldenvalleymn.gov    Model Code: IRC (mechanical) 
 
Telephone number: (612)275-1436    Code or Rule Section: M2002.4.1 
 
Firm/Association affiliation, if any: AMBO    Topic of proposal: Discharge Pipe 
 
Code or rule section to be changed: Residential Mechanical Code 
M2002.4.1 
 
Intended for Technical Advisory Group (“TAG”): 

 
 
General Information           Yes No 
 

A. Is the proposed change unique to the State of Minnesota?     ☒ ☐ 

B. Is the proposed change required due to climatic conditions of Minnesota?  ☒ ☐ 

C. Will the proposed change encourage more uniform enforcement?   ☒ ☐ 

D. Will the proposed change remedy a problem?     ☒ ☐  

E. Does the proposal delete a current Minnesota Rule, chapter amendment?  ☐ ☒ 

F. Would this proposed change be appropriate through the ICC code  

development process?        ☐ ☒  

 
Proposed Language 

1. The proposed code change is meant to: 
 

 change language contained in the model code book? If so, list section(s). 
 IRC M2002.4.1 
 

 change language contained in an existing amendment in Minnesota Rule? If so, list Rule part(s). 
  
  delete language contained in the model code book? If so, list section(s). 
  
 
  delete language contained in an existing amendment in Minnesota Rule? If so, list Rule 
 part(s). 
       
 
  add new language that is not found in the model code book or in Minnesota Rule. 

      
2. Is this proposed code change required by Minnesota Statute? If so, please provide the citation.  

 
  



 2 

 
 
 

3. Provide specific language you would like to see changed. Indicate proposed new words with 
underlining and strikethrough words proposed for deletion. Include the entire code (sub) section or 
rule subpart that contains your proposed changes.   
M2002.4.1 Requirements for discharge pipe. 
The discharge piping serving a pressure relief valve, temperature relief valve or combination valve 
shall:  
1. Not be directly connected to the drainage system. 
2. Discharge through an air break located in the same room as the boiler.  
3. Not be smaller than the diameter of the outlet of the valve served and shall discharge full size to 

the air break. 
4. Serve a single relief device and shall not connect to piping serving any other relief device or 

equipment. 
5. Discharge to the floor, to the pan serving the boiler or storage tank, to a waste receptor or to the 

outdoors an approved location. 
6. Discharge in a manner that does not cause personal injury or structural damage. 
7. Discharge to a termination point that is readily observable by the building occupants. 
8. Not be trapped.  
9. Be installed to flow by gravity.  
10. Terminate not more than 6 inches (152 mm) above the floor or waste receptor flood level rim.  
11. Not have a threaded connection at the end of the piping. 
12. Not have valves, obstructions, means of isolation or tee fittings. 
13. Be constructed of those materials indicated in Section P2906.5 rated at not less than the 

operating temperature of the system and approved for such use, or materials tested, rated and 
approved for such use in accordance with ASME A112.4.1. 

14. Not discharge from a relief valve into a water heater pan. 
 

4. Will this proposed code change impact other sections of a model code book or an amendment in 
Minnesota Rule? If so, please list the affected sections or rule parts. 

NO 
 
Need and Reason 
 

1. Why is the proposed code change needed? Please provide a general explanation as well as a 
specific explanation for any changes to numerical values (heights, area, etc.) 

Clarifies requirements for materials and means for discharge pipe to address MN Climate 
(can not discharge outdoors).  Adds language to ensure proper temperature rating of materials and 
addresses potential of disaster pan overflow by not allowing discharge pipe (under pressure) to 
terminate into a water heater pan (drained by gravity). 

2.  Why is the proposed code change a reasonable solution?  
To mitigate potential for damage caused by water leaks, and risk of explosion by blocked relief 
valves.  Adds requirement for material to be rated for temperatures of system. 
 

3. What other factors should the TAG consider?  
N/A 

 
Cost/Benefit Analysis 
 

1. Will the proposed code change increase or decrease costs? Please explain and provide estimates if 
possible.  
May increase cost of separate discharge pipe because water heater pan drain must be piped 
separately. 

2. If there is an increased cost, will this cost be offset by a safety or other benefit? Please explain. If 
the benefit is quantifiable (for example energy savings), provide an estimate if possible.  



 3 

Reduced exposure to damage caused by overflowing water heater pans and risk of discharge pipe 
being blocked by ice. 
 

3.  If there is a cost increase, who will bear the costs? This can include government units, businesses, 
and individuals. 
N/A 

 
4. Are there any enforcement or compliance cost increases or decreases with the proposed code 

change? Please explain.  NO 
 

5. Will the cost of complying with the proposed code change in the first year after the rule takes effect 
exceed $25,000 for any one small business or small city (Minn. Stat. § 14.127)? A small business is 
any business that has less than 50 full-time employees. A small city is any statutory or home rule 
charter city that has less than ten full-time employees. Please explain.   
No 

 
 
Regulatory Analysis  
 
 

1. What parties or segments of the industry are affected by this proposed code change? 
Contractors, Code Officials, Designers, installers 

 
 

2. Can you think of other means or methods to achieve the purpose of the proposed code change? 
What might someone opposed to this code change suggest instead? Please explain what the 
alternatives are and why your proposed change is the preferred method or means to achieve the 
desired result. 
 

3. What are the probable costs or consequences of not adopting the code change, including those 
costs or consequences borne by identifiable categories of affected parties, such as separate 
classes of government units, businesses, or individuals? 
Cost associated with repairs due to water damage, mitigate risk of failure by blocked discharge pipe 
(ice) 
 

4. Are you aware of any federal or state regulation or requirement related to this proposed code 
change? If so, please list the federal or state regulation or requirement and your assessment of any 
differences between the proposed code change and the federal regulation or requirement. 

  N/A 
 
 
 
 
 
 
***Note: Incomplete forms may be returned to the submitter with instruction to complete the form. Only 
completed forms can considered by the TAG.  

https://www.revisor.mn.gov/statutes/cite/14.127


 1 

 

 

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL FORM 
  (Must be submitted electronically) 

 
Author/requestor: John G. Smith, P.E.      Date: January 6, 2025 
 
Email address: jgsmith76@gmail.com    Model Code: 2024 IRC 
 
Telephone number: 612 867 3145   Code or Rule Section: M2101.22.6 

Expansion Tanks 
 
Firm/Association affiliation, if any: ACEC 
 
Code or rule section to be changed: Hydronic Piping - Expansion Tanks 
 
Intended for Technical Advisory Group (“TAG”): 1346 Mechanical and Fuel Gas Code 

 
 
General Information           Yes No 
 

A. Is the proposed change unique to the State of Minnesota?     ☐ ☒ 

B. Is the proposed change required due to climatic conditions of Minnesota?  ☐ ☒ 

C. Will the proposed change encourage more uniform enforcement?   ☒ ☐ 

D. Will the proposed change remedy a problem?     ☒ ☐  

E. Does the proposal delete a current Minnesota Rule, chapter amendment?  ☒ ☐ 

F. Would this proposed change be appropriate through the ICC code  

development process?        ☒ ☐  

 
Proposed Language 

1. The proposed code change is meant to: 
 

X  change language contained the model code book? If so, list section(s). 
 M2003 Expansion Tanks, M2003.1 General 
 

 change language contained in an existing amendment in Minnesota Rule? If so, list Rule part(s). 
  
 
  delete language contained in the model code book? If so, list section(s). 
       
 
  delete language contained in an existing amendment in Minnesota Rule? If so, list Rule 
 part(s). 
       
 
  add new language that is not found in the model code book or in Minnesota Rule. 

      
2. Is this proposed code change required by Minnesota Statute? If so, please provide the citation.  
 No 



 2 

 
 
 

3. Provide specific language you would like to see changed. Indicate proposed new words with 
underlining and strikethrough words proposed for deletion. Include the entire code (sub) section or 
rule subpart that contains your proposed changes.   
 
 
M2101.22.6 Expansion Tanks. Shutoff valves shall be installed at connections to nondiaphragm-
type expansion tanks.  Provisions shall be made for draining nonpressurized tanks without 
emptying the system. Shutoff valves shall be installed at connections to expansion tanks. The valve 
between mains and an expansion tank shall have permanently attached thereto a metal tag that 
contains the following language stamped or etched thereon: "This valve must be open at all times, 
except when draining expansion tank." 

  
4. Will this proposed code change impact other sections of a model code book or an amendment in 

Minnesota Rule? If so, please list the affected sections or rule parts. 
 No 

 
 
Need and Reason 
 

1. Why is the proposed code change needed? Please provide a general explanation as well as a 
specific explanation for any changes to numerical values (heights, area, etc.) 
 
This wording more matches the proposed change to M2003 Expansion Tanks as tank applications 
in both instances are essentially the same. 
 
Shut off valves to isolate expansion tanks for servicing are important, regardless if the tank is 
nondiaphragm or diaphragm style. I find no reason to require them only for nondiaphragm style of 
tanks.  
Requiring the tag is important to identify the importance of maintaining the valve in the open 
position except when servicing the expansion tank. Closing the valve can and will cause system 
overpressure conditions which will pop the relief valve. This relief valve action can be intermitant, 
and could be difficult to identify the cause. The metal tag is intended to eliminate inadvertent shutoff 
of the valve. 
 

2. Why is the proposed code change a reasonable solution?  
 
It has been common practice for many years and considered to be a part of a good installation. 
 

3. What other factors should the TAG consider?  
None 
 

 
Cost/Benefit Analysis 
 

1. Will the proposed code change increase or decrease costs? Please explain and provide estimates if 
possible.  
 
Minimal cost increase, but no cost increase when compared to how installations have been 
performed for many years. 
 

2. If there is an increased cost, will this cost be offset by a safety or other benefit? Please explain. If 
the benefit is quantifiable (for example energy savings), provide an estimate if possible.  
 



 3 

Will reduce/eliminate potential operation problems with closed systems with relief valves. 
 

3.  If there is a cost increase, who will bear the costs? This can include government units, businesses, 
and individuals. 
      

 
4. Are there any enforcement or compliance cost increases or decreases with the proposed code 

change? Please explain.   
No 
 

5. Will the cost of complying with the proposed code change in the first year after the rule takes effect 
exceed $25,000 for any one small business or small city (Minn. Stat. § 14.127)? A small business is 
any business that has less than 50 full-time employees. A small city is any statutory or home rule 
charter city that has less than ten full-time employees. Please explain.   
      

 
 
Regulatory Analysis  
 
 

1. What parties or segments of industry are affected by this proposed code change? 
Contractors, design engineers, building officials. 

 
 

2. Can you think of other means or methods to achieve the purpose of the proposed code change? 
What might someone opposed to this code change suggest instead? Please explain what  the 
alternatives are and why your proposed change is the preferred method or means to achieve the 
desired result. 

 No 
 

      
 

3. What are the probable costs or consequences of not adopting the code change, including those 
costs or consequences borne by identifiable categories of affected parties, such as separate 
classes of government units, businesses, or individuals? 
 
System operational issues if the valve is inadvertently shut off, more difficulty servicing diaphragm 
expansion tanks if no valve is installed in those systems. 
 

4. Are you aware of any federal or state regulation or requirement related to this proposed code 
change? If so, please list the federal or state regulation or requirement and your assessment of any 
differences between the proposed code change and the federal regulation or requirement. 

 No 
 
       
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

https://www.revisor.mn.gov/statutes/cite/14.127


 4 

***Note: Incomplete forms may be returned to the submitter with instruction to complete the form. Only 
completed forms can considered by the TAG.  



 1 

 

 

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL FORM 
  (Must be submitted electronically) 

 
Author/requestor: John G. Smith, P.E.      Date: January 6, 2025 
 
Email address: jgsmith76@gmail.com    Model Code: 2024 IRC 
 
Telephone number: 612 867 3145   Code or Rule Section: M2003 

Expansion Tanks 
 
Firm/Association affiliation, if any: ACEC 
 
Code or rule section to be changed: Boilers and Water Heaters - Expansion Tanks 
 
Intended for Technical Advisory Group (“TAG”): 1346 Mechanical and Fuel Gas Code 

 
 
General Information           Yes No 
 

A. Is the proposed change unique to the State of Minnesota?     ☐ ☒ 

B. Is the proposed change required due to climatic conditions of Minnesota?  ☐ ☒ 

C. Will the proposed change encourage more uniform enforcement?   ☒ ☐ 

D. Will the proposed change remedy a problem?     ☒ ☐  

E. Does the proposal delete a current Minnesota Rule, chapter amendment?  ☒ ☐ 

F. Would this proposed change be appropriate through the ICC code  

development process?        ☒ ☐  

 
Proposed Language 

1. The proposed code change is meant to: 
 

X  change language contained the model code book? If so, list section(s). 
 M2003 Expansion Tanks, M2003.1 General 
 

 change language contained in an existing amendment in Minnesota Rule? If so, list Rule part(s). 
  
 
  delete language contained in the model code book? If so, list section(s). 
       
 
  delete language contained in an existing amendment in Minnesota Rule? If so, list Rule 
 part(s). 
       
 
  add new language that is not found in the model code book or in Minnesota Rule. 

      
2. Is this proposed code change required by Minnesota Statute? If so, please provide the citation.  
 No 



 2 

 
 
 

3. Provide specific language you would like to see changed. Indicate proposed new words with 
underlining and strikethrough words proposed for deletion. Include the entire code (sub) section or 
rule subpart that contains your proposed changes.   
 
Section M2003, Expansion  Tank: Revise M2003.1 General as follows: 
 
M2003.1 General. Hot water boilers shall be provided with expansion tanks. Nonpressurized 
expansion tanks shall be securely fastened to the structure or boiler snd supported to carry twice 
the weight of the tank filled with water. Provisions shall be made for draining nonpressurized tanks 
without emptying the system. Shutoff valves shall be installed at connections to expansion tanks. 
The valve between mains and an expansion tank shall have permanently attached thereto a metal 
tag that contains the following language stamped or etched thereon: "This valve must be open at all 
times, except when draining expansion tank." 

  
4. Will this proposed code change impact other sections of a model code book or an amendment in 

Minnesota Rule? If so, please list the affected sections or rule parts. 
 No 

 
 
Need and Reason 
 

1. Why is the proposed code change needed? Please provide a general explanation as well as a 
specific explanation for any changes to numerical values (heights, area, etc.) 
 
Shut off valves to isolate expansion tanks for servicing are important, regardless if the tank is 
nondiaphragm or diaphragm style. I find no reason to require them only for nondiaphragm style of 
tanks.  
Requiring the tag is important to identify the importance of maintaining the valve in the open 
position except when servicing the expansion tank. Closing the valve can and will cause system 
overpressure conditions which will pop the relief valve. This relief valve action can be intermitant, 
and could be difficult to identify the cause. The metal tag is intended to eliminate inadvertent shutoff 
of the valve. 
 

2. Why is the proposed code change a reasonable solution?  
 
It has been common practice for many years and considered to be a part of a good installation. 
 

3. What other factors should the TAG consider?  
None 
 

 
Cost/Benefit Analysis 
 

1. Will the proposed code change increase or decrease costs? Please explain and provide estimates if 
possible.  
 
Minimal cost increase, but no cost increase when compared to how installations have been 
performed for many years. 
 

2. If there is an increased cost, will this cost be offset by a safety or other benefit? Please explain. If 
the benefit is quantifiable (for example energy savings), provide an estimate if possible.  
 
Will reduce/eliminate potential operation problems with closed systems with relief valves. 



 3 

 
3.  If there is a cost increase, who will bear the costs? This can include government units, businesses, 

and individuals. 
      

 
4. Are there any enforcement or compliance cost increases or decreases with the proposed code 

change? Please explain.   
No 
 

5. Will the cost of complying with the proposed code change in the first year after the rule takes effect 
exceed $25,000 for any one small business or small city (Minn. Stat. § 14.127)? A small business is 
any business that has less than 50 full-time employees. A small city is any statutory or home rule 
charter city that has less than ten full-time employees. Please explain.   
      

 
 
Regulatory Analysis  
 
 

1. What parties or segments of industry are affected by this proposed code change? 
Contractors, design engineers, building officials. 

 
 

2. Can you think of other means or methods to achieve the purpose of the proposed code change? 
What might someone opposed to this code change suggest instead? Please explain what  the 
alternatives are and why your proposed change is the preferred method or means to achieve the 
desired result. 

 No 
 

      
 

3. What are the probable costs or consequences of not adopting the code change, including those 
costs or consequences borne by identifiable categories of affected parties, such as separate 
classes of government units, businesses, or individuals? 
 
System operational issues if the valve is inadvertently shut off, more difficulty servicing diaphragm 
expansion tanks if no valve is installed in those systems. 
 

4. Are you aware of any federal or state regulation or requirement related to this proposed code 
change? If so, please list the federal or state regulation or requirement and your assessment of any 
differences between the proposed code change and the federal regulation or requirement. 

 No 
 
       
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
***Note: Incomplete forms may be returned to the submitter with instruction to complete the form. Only 
completed forms can considered by the TAG.  

https://www.revisor.mn.gov/statutes/cite/14.127


 1 

 

 

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL FORM 
  (Must be submitted electronically) 

 
Author/requestor: Chris Rosival     Date: January 7, 2025  
 
Email address: chris.rosiival@state.mn.us    Model Code: 2024 IRC 
 
Telephone number: 651-284-5510     Code or Rule Section: G2452.1 
 
Firm/Association affiliation, if any: DLI 
 
Code or rule section to be changed: G2452.1 and G2452.1.1 
 
Intended for Technical Advisory Group (“TAG”): 

 
 
General Information           Yes No 
 

A. Is the proposed change unique to the State of Minnesota?     ☒ ☒ 

B. Is the proposed change required due to climatic conditions of Minnesota?  ☐ ☒ 

C. Will the proposed change encourage more uniform enforcement?   ☒ ☐ 

D. Will the proposed change remedy a problem?     ☒ ☐  

E. Does the proposal delete a current Minnesota Rule, chapter amendment?  ☐ ☒ 

F. Would this proposed change be appropriate through the ICC code  

development process?        ☒ ☐  

 
Proposed Language 

1. The proposed code change is meant to: 
 

 change language contained the model code book? If so, list section(s). 
 G2452.1 
 

 change language contained in an existing amendment in Minnesota Rule? If so, list Rule part(s). 
       
 
  delete language contained in the model code book? If so, list section(s). 
       
 
  delete language contained in an existing amendment in Minnesota Rule? If so, list Rule 
 part(s). 
       
 
  add new language that is not found in the model code book or in Minnesota Rule. 

G2452.1.1 
2. Is this proposed code change required by Minnesota Statute? If so, please provide the citation.  
       

 



 2 

 
 

3. Provide specific language you would like to see changed. Indicate proposed new words with 
underlining and strikethrough words proposed for deletion. Include the entire code (sub) section or 
rule subpart that contains your proposed changes.   

 

G2452.1 (631.1) Standards. Boilers shall be listed in accordance with the requirements of 

ANSI Z21.13/CSA 4.9 or UL 795. If applicable, the boiler shall be designed and constructed in 

accordance with the requirements of ASME CSD-1 and as applicable, the ASME Boiler and 

Pressure Vessel Code, Sections I, II, IV, V and IX and NFPA 85. 

 

G2452.1.1 Application. This chapter only applies to boilers serving a single dwelling unit. For all 

other boilers, follow MR 1346. 
 

  
4. Will this proposed code change impact other sections of a model code book or an amendment in 

Minnesota Rule? If so, please list the affected sections or rule parts. 
MR1346. Chapter 10 

 
 
Need and Reason 
 

1. Why is the proposed code change needed? Please provide a general explanation as well as a 
specific explanation for any changes to numerical values (heights, area, etc.) 
The IRC added language to address larger boilers and residential boilers. The amendment will 
clarify the differences. 
 

2. Why is the proposed code change a reasonable solution?  
Providing guidance to constituents for single dwelling unit boilers and providing a path to the IMC 
for all other boilers as there are vast differences between them. 
 

3. What other factors should the TAG consider?  
      
 

 
Cost/Benefit Analysis 
 

1. Will the proposed code change increase or decrease costs? Please explain and provide estimates if 
possible.  
Neither 
 

2. If there is an increased cost, will this cost be offset by a safety or other benefit? Please explain. If 
the benefit is quantifiable (for example energy savings), provide an estimate if possible.  
      
 

3.  If there is a cost increase, who will bear the costs? This can include government units, businesses, 
and individuals. 
      

 
4. Are there any enforcement or compliance cost increases or decreases with the proposed code 

change? Please explain.   
      
 

5. Will the cost of complying with the proposed code change in the first year after the rule takes effect 
exceed $25,000 for any one small business or small city (Minn. Stat. § 14.127)? A small business is 

https://www.revisor.mn.gov/statutes/cite/14.127


 3 

any business that has less than 50 full-time employees. A small city is any statutory or home rule 
charter city that has less than ten full-time employees. Please explain.   
      

 
 
Regulatory Analysis  
 
 

1. What parties or segments of industry are affected by this proposed code change? 
 
Homeowners, contractors and designers 

 
2. Can you think of other means or methods to achieve the purpose of the proposed code change? 

What might someone opposed to this code change suggest instead? Please explain what  the 
alternatives are and why your proposed change is the preferred method or means to achieve the 
desired result. 

       
 
3. What are the probable costs or consequences of not adopting the code change, including those 

costs or consequences borne by identifiable categories of affected parties, such as separate 
classes of government units, businesses, or individuals? 
 
Single dwelling units would be required to follow CSD-1 which will require an emergency shutoff 
valve and other unforeseen issues. 
 

4. Are you aware of any federal or state regulation or requirement related to this proposed code 
change? If so, please list the federal or state regulation or requirement and your assessment of any 
differences between the proposed code change and the federal regulation or requirement. 
326B.964 

 
***Note: Incomplete forms may be returned to the submitter with instruction to complete the form. Only 
completed forms can considered by the TAG.  


	CCP IMC 306.5 Staff
	CCP IMC 607.5.5 Shaft enclosures Staff
	CCP IMC 607.6.3 Non-fire-resistive Staff
	CCP IMC MR1346.0506.4.1 Staff (2)
	CCP IFGC 305.1 Brian Stemwedel
	CCP IFGC 306.5 Staff
	CCP M1302.1 Listing and labeling Staff
	CCP M1601.3 Reflective Insulation Staff (2)
	CCP M2001.1.1 Staff
	CCP M2002.4.1 Brian Stemwedel
	CCP M2101.22.6 John Smith
	CCP M2003.1 John Smith
	CCP G2452.1 Staff

